
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION 

EQUAL OPPORTUNITY/AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER 

 

 

BID TABULATION 

 

 

BID ID: 7144 

 

APPROVAL DATE: October 12, 2015 

 

ITEM(S) QUOTED: SNOW REMOVAL SERVICE 

 

DATE BIDS RECEIVED: September 8, 2015 

 

CONTRACT PERIOD: From November 1, 2015 through October 31, 2016. 

 

QUOTED DISCOUNT TERMS: More & More Contracting 5% - 30 days 

 All Others Net 

  

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: No shipments/services are to be made against the contract. 

 Purchase orders will be issued. 

 

AWARD OF BID: Awarded to all vendors to ensure adequate coverage. 

 



SNOW REMOVAL SERVICE 

(JCPS No. 4600015-2010331) 

 

ITEM NO. 1 - BACK HOE    

 

BIDDER MAKE & MODEL NO. PRICE PER UNIT PER HOUR 

 

 

DCI General Contractors Case 580 $ 140.00 

 

Mike Osbourn Lawn Care, Inc. John Deere  145.00 

 

Riverside Paving  

   & Contracting Co., Inc. Ford 555, CAT 416 & Case 580 (2) each  145.00 

 

Action Landscape, Inc. 6 units, Kubota Articulated Unit #R420  150.00 

 equipped w/12′ snow plow   

 

ABM, LLC 580 Case  175.00  

 

More & More   

   Contracting Services, LLC  No bid  -- 

 

 

ITEM NO. 2 - MICHIGAN LOADER 

 

ABM, LLC Cat Wheel Loader  225.00 

 

Riverside Paving  

   & Contracting Co., Inc. VOLO 4 yd bucket  250.00 

 

Action Landscape, Inc. No bid  -- 

 

DCI General Contractors N/A  -- 

 

Mike Osbourn Lawn Care, Inc. No bid  -- 

 

More & More  

   Contracting Services, LLC No bid  -- 

 

 

ITEM NO. 3 - SKID STEERLOADER 

 

More & More  

   Contracting Services, LLC Bobcat Skid-Steer, John Deere  100.00 

 

Riverside Paving 

   & Contracting Co., Inc. Gehl CTL70, Case 410, John Deere  120.00 

  

DCI General Contractors Bobcat Skidsteer  123.00 

 

Mike Osbourn Lawn Care, Inc.  John Deere 317, New Holland (2)  130.00 

 

ABM, LLC 883 Bobcat, CTL60 Gehl, F-180  150.00  

 

Action Landscape, Inc. No bid                      --  



ITEM NO. 4 - TRUCK AND PLOW 

 

BIDDER MAKE & MODEL NO. PRICE PER UNIT PER HOUR 

 

More & More  

   Contracting Services, LLC 1997 Dodge Ram 3500, 9 ft. wide $ 100.00 

 Western plow; 2000 Ford Excursion V10, 

 7 ft. Western plow & salt spreader   

 

Mike Osbourn Lawn Care, Inc. (8) Plow trucks, Ford diesel 350, 8 ft. plow  135.00  

 

ABM, LLC 1 ton with plow & salt spreader, 3/4 ton  150.00 

 w/plow & spreader, 1 ton with plow; 

 4 trucks total w/plows, 3 w/salt spreaders  

 

Action Landscape, Inc. (5) Ford F350′s 4x4 w/plow & salt spreader;  150.00 

 Dodge Ram 2500 4x4 w/plow; F350 Flatbed 

 4 x 4 w/extra-large snow plow & salt spreader; 

  (2) Ford F550′s4x4 w/automatic Super Duty 

 w/special frames& springs for extra large 

 snow plow& salt spreader 

   

Riverside Paving  

   & Contracting Co., Inc. 2008 F350 w/Western Plow & Salt Spreader  200.00 

     

DCI General Contractors N/A  -- 

 

 

ITEM NO. 5 - MISC. OTHER EQUIPMENT 

 

Mike Osbourn Lawn Care, Inc. Snow Blower "sidewalks"   40.00 

 

DCI General Contractors Kubota Tractor with front loader   140.00 

 

Action Landscape, Inc. Extra plows, snow pusher,   150.00 

 3 walk behind snow throwers  

Riverside Paving  

   & Contracting Co., Inc. John Deere Road Grader  165.00 

 

ABM, LLC No bid  -- 

 

More & More  

   Contracting Services, LLC No bid  -- 

 

  



 

ITEM NO. 6 - APPLICATION OF ROAD SALT TO LOCATION PLOWED PRICE PER TON 

 

Action Landscape, Inc.  $ 150.00 

 

More & More  

   Contracting Services, LLC   200.00 

 

Mike Osbourn Lawn Care, Inc.  290.00 

 

DCI General Contractor   N/A 

 

Riverside Paving  

   & Contracting Co., Inc.       N/A 

 

 


