
JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION

EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

7134BID ID:

APPROVAL DATE: October 12, 2015

ITEM(S) QUOTED: REFRIGERANT . 

DATE BIDS RECEIVED: September 14, 2015

From November 01, 2015 through April 30, 2016CONTRACT PERIOD:

RENEWAL(S): No renewal option. 

COMMENTS: An * indicates an award. 
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Vendor Response Terms

Response Payment TermsResponse TermsVendor Name

Airgas Refrigerants, Inc. Please see attached for Required Vendor 

Information for Bid No. 7134, MSDS and ARI 

Policy 2015

Net 30

American Refrigerants, Inc. No bid

CAPP, Inc.

UNITED REFRIGERATION INC.
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ITEM NO. 1   -  Refrigerant, R-22, 50-lb. disposable cylinder.  Please price per cylinder.   1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated 

Quantity - 20 (4500500-1663811)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

NO BID  1.0000American Refrigerants, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

*REFRON  #R22-50 494.0000CAPP, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS325992

Please see attached  #R-22 (50#) 572.5000Airgas Refrigerants, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: R-22 (50#)

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Please see attached

national refrigents  #50r22 600.1800UNITED REFRIGERATION INC.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 50r22

ITEM NO. 2   -  Refrigerant, R-22, 30-lb. disposable cylinder.  Please price per cylinder.   1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated 

Quantity - 50 (4500500-1663812)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

NO BID  1.0000American Refrigerants, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

*REFRON  #R22-30 309.9000CAPP, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS2712408

Please see attached  #R-22 (30#) 328.5000Airgas Refrigerants, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: R-22 (30#)

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Please see attached

national refrigerants  360.1000UNITED REFRIGERATION INC.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 30r22

ITEM NO. 3   -  Refrigerant, R-134A, 30-lb. disposable cylinder.  Please price per cylinder.   1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated 

Quantity - 40 (4500500-1720041)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

NO BID  1.0000American Refrigerants, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

*FREON  #R134A-30 93.9000CAPP, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS3016103

Please see attached  #R-134A (30#) 109.7500Airgas Refrigerants, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: R-134A (30#)

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Please see attached 

national refrigerants  160.0000UNITED REFRIGERATION INC.
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Note: *  indicates a pending award.
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VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 30r134a

ITEM NO. 4   -  Refrigerant, R-409A, 30-lb. disposable cylinder.  Please price per cylinder.   1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated 

Quantity - 2 (4500500-1721647)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

NO BID  1.0000American Refrigerants, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

*Please see attached  #R-409A (30#) 328.5000Airgas Refrigerants, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: R-409A (30#)

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Please see attached 

FREON  #R409A-30 450.0000CAPP, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS454677

national refrigerants  459.3800UNITED REFRIGERATION INC.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 30r409a

ITEM NO. 5   -  Refrigerant, R-404A, 24-lb. disposable cylinder.  Please price per cylinder.   1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated 

Quantity - 16 (4500500-1731409)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

V  1.0000American Refrigerants, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

*FREON  #R404A-24 85.0000CAPP, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS3031404

Please see attached  #R-404A (24#) 98.9000Airgas Refrigerants, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: R-404A (24#)

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Please see attached 

national refrigants  156.0000UNITED REFRIGERATION INC.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 24r404a

ITEM NO. 6   -  Refrigerant, R-410A, 25-lb. disposable cylinder.  Please price per cylinder.   1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated 

Quantity - 2 (4500500-2011959)

UNIT PRICE ($)ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER VENDOR NAME

NO BID  1.0000American Refrigerants, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NO BID

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NO BID

*FREON  #R410A-25 90.0000CAPP, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: CS852957

Please see attached  #R-410A (25#) 109.7400Airgas Refrigerants, Inc.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: R-410A (25#)

Net 30RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 
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Note: *  indicates a pending award.
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RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Please see attached 

national refrigerants  127.5600UNITED REFRIGERATION INC.

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 25r410a
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Note: *  indicates a pending award.
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TOTAL BIDS - 

AWARDED TOTAL ($)TOTAL ($)VENDOR NAME
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Note: *  indicates a pending award.
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TOTAL BIDS

VENDOR NAME TOTAL ($) AWARDED TOTAL ($)

34,723.88  657.00Airgas Refrigerants, Inc.

130.00American Refrigerants, Inc.

31,571.00  30,671.00CAPP, Inc.

40,078.48UNITED REFRIGERATION INC.

31,328.00
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Note: *  indicates a pending award.
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