JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY/AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

PROPOSAL NO.:
APPROVAL DATE:
ITEM(S) QUOTED:
DATE BIDS RECEIVED:

CONTRACT PERIOD:

QUOTED DISCOUNT TERMS:

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS:

AWARD OF PROPOSAL:

BID TABULATION

7114

September 28, 2015

LAMINATING FILM

August 10, 2015

October 1, 2015 through September 30, 2016.
All vendors quoted net terms.

No shipments/services are to be made against the contract.
Purchase orders will be issued.

An * indicates an award.



PART A

ITEM NO. 1 - FILM, LAMINATING. TO FIT ALL 12” LAMINATING MACHINES. CLEAR 1.5 MIL. 12” X 500’

ROLL W/1” CORE, 2 ROLLS PER BOX, STANDARD ROLL LAMINATING FILM FOR USE WITH HOT ROLL
AND HEAT SHOE LAMINATORS. GBC #3000002 NAP-LAM | OR EQUAL.
ESTIMATED QUANTITY - 24 ROLLS. (COMMODITY CODE 5690370-1422991)

BIDDER BRAND NAME & NO. PRICE PER ROLL
Scott Electric Bryce/Adlam #011251X $ 920 *
Pyramid School Products Bryce/Adlam #011251X 9.98

Acco Brands USA, LLC d/b/a GBC GBC Brand #3000002 15.61

Mark Andy Print Products P#181B125001PI 16.50
B3/Bind USA 18.00
Lamination Depot Reject - did not submit sample.

ITEM NO. 2 - FILM, LAMINATING. TO FIT ALL 18” LAMINATING MACHINES. CLEAR 1.5 MIL. 18” X 500°

ROLL W/1” CORE, 2 ROLLS PER BOX, STANDARD ROLL LAMINATING FILM FOR USE WITH HOT ROLL
AND HEAT SHOE LAMINATORS. GBC #3000003 NAP-LAM | OR EQUAL.
ESTIMATED QUANTITY - 30 ROLLS. (COMMODITY CODE 5690370-1371804)

Scott Electric Hop 18” X 500’ 12.80 *
Pyramid School Products Bryce/Adlam #011851X 13.97
Acco Brands USA, LLC d/b/a GBC GBC #3000003 NAP-LAMI 17.54
B3/Bind USA 19.00
Mark Andy Print Products P#18B185001PI 25.12
Lamination Depot Reject - did not submit sample.

ITEM NO. 3 - FILM, LAMINATING. TO FIT ALL 25” LAMINATING MACHINES. CLEAR 1.5 MIL. 25” X 500°

ROLL W/1” CORE, 2 ROLLS PER BOX, STANDARD ROLL LAMINATING FILM FOR USE WITH HOT ROLL
AND HEAT SHOE LAMINATORS. GBC #3000004 NAP-LAM | OR EQUAL.
ESTIMATED QUANTITY - 1,000 ROLLS. (COMMODITY CODE 5690370-1371813)

Lamination Depot 15.07 *
Pyramid School Products Bryce/Adlam #011851X 15.39
Acco Brands USA, LLC d/b/a GBC 18.15
Mark Andy Print Products P#18B255001PI 34.00
Scott Electric Reject - poor quality, did not adhere.

B3/Bind USA Reject - poor quality, did not adhere.



ITEM NO. 4 - FILM, LAMINATING. CLEAR 1.5 MIL. 25” X 500’ ROLL W/2.25” CORE, 2 ROLLS PER BOX,
STANDARD ROLL LAMINATING FILM FOR USE WITH HOT ROLL AND HEAT SHOE LAMINATORS.
GBC #3000007 NAP-LAM |1 OR EQUAL. ESTIMATED QUANTITY -30 ROLLS.

(COMMODITY CODE 5690370-1714943)

BIDDER BRAND NAME & NO. PRICE PER ROLL
Scott Electric Bryce #012552X $ 19.20 *
Lamination Depot 24.56

Acco Brands USA, LLC d/b/a GBC GBC Brand #3000007 26.70

Mark Andy Print Products P#18255002P0 34.00
B3/Bind USA 34.00
Pyramid School Products Reject - did not submit sample.

ITEM NO. 5 - FILM, LAMINATING. TO FIT ALL 12” LAMINATING MACHINES. CLEAR 3.0 MIL. 12” X 250’

ROLL W/1” CORE, 2 ROLLS PER BOX, STANDARD ROLL LAMINATING FILM FOR USE WITH HOT ROLL
AND HEAT SHOE LAMINATORS. GBC #3000022 NAP-LAM | OR EQUAL.
ESTIMATED QUANTITY - 24 ROLLS. (COMMODITY CODE 5690370-1423007)

Scott Electric Bryce #031231C 8.90 *
Pyramid School Products Bryce/Adlam 03-123-1C 9.39
Mark Andy Print Products P#19B122501PI 14.00
Acco Brands USA, LLC d/b/a GBC GBC Brand #3000022 22.77
B3/Bind USA 36.00
Lamination Depot Reject - did not submit sample.

ITEM NO. 6 - FILM, LAMINATING. TO FIT ALL 18” LAMINATING MACHINES. CLEAR 3.0 MIL. 18” X 250’

ROLL W/1” CORE, 2 ROLLS PER BOX, STANDARD ROLL LAMINATING FILM FOR USE WITH HOT ROLL
AND HEAT SHOE LAMINATORS. GBC #3000023 NAP-LAM | OR EQUAL.
ESTIMATED QUANTITY - 24 ROLLS. (COMMODITY CODE 5690370-1371822)

Scott Electric Bryce #031831C 12.85 *
Pyramid School Products Bryce/Adlam #03-183-1C 12.94
Mark Andy Print Products P#19182501PI 20.50
Acco Brands USA, LLC d/b/a GBC GBC Brand #3000023 28.55
B3/Bind USA 54.00
Lamination Depot Reject - did not submit sample.

ITEM NO. 7 - FILM, LAMINATING. TO FIT ALL 25” LAMINATING MACHINES. CLEAR 3.0 MIL. 25” X 250’

ROLL W/1” CORE, 2 ROLLS PER BOX, STANDARD ROLL LAMINATING FILM FOR USE WITH HOT ROLL
AND HEAT SHOE LAMINATORS. GBC #3000024 NAP-LAM | OR EQUAL.
ESTIMATED QUANTITY -1,300 ROLLS. (COMMODITY CODE 5690370-1371831)

Scott Electric Bryce #032531C 17.80 *
Pyramid School Products Bryce/Adlam #03-253-1C 18.59
Mark Andy Print Products P#19B252501PI 28.39
Acco Brands USA, LLC d/b/a GBC GBC Brand #3000024 30.62
B3/Bind USA 35.00

Lamination Depot Reject - did not submit sample.



ITEM NO. 8 - FILM, LAMINATING. TO FIT ALL 27” LAMINATING MACHINES. CLEAR 3.0 MIL. 27” X 250°
ROLL W/1” CORE, 2 ROLLS PER BOX, STANDARD ROLL LAMINATING FILM FOR USE WITH HOT ROLL
AND HEAT SHOE LAMINATORS. GBC #3126514 NAP-LAM | OR EQUAL.

ESTIMATED QUANTITY - 400 ROLLS. (COMMODITY CODE 5690370-2013109)

BIDDER BRAND NAME & NO. PRICE PER ROLL
Scott Electric Bryce #032731C $ 2030 *
Acco Brands USA, LLC d/b/a GBC GBC Brand #3126514 NAP-LAM | 28.52

Mark Andy Print Products P#19B272501PI 33.50
B3/Bind USA 45.00
Lamination Depot Reject - did not submit sample.

Pyramid School Products Reject - did not submit sample.



PART B - OTHER BRAND LAMINATING FILMS

ITEM NO. 1 - 3M LAMINATING FILMS, HEAT AND NON-HEAT SEALED, ALL SIZES. NO SUBSTITUTE.
(COMMODITY CODE 4600185-2012302)

PERCENTAGE OF DISCOUNT
OFF MANUFACTURER’S

BIDDER RETAIL PRICE
Acco Brands USA, LLC d/b/a GBC No Bid
B3/Bind USA No Bid
Lamination Depot No Bid
Mark Andy Print Products No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid
Scott Electric No Bid

ITEM NO. 2 - VARITRONICS LAMINATING FILMS, HEAT AND NON-HEAT SEALED, ALL SIZES.
NO SUBSTITUTE. (COMMODITY CODE 4600185-2012304)

Acco Brands USA, LLC d/b/a GBC No Bid
B3/Bind USA No Bid
Lamination Depot No Bid
Mark Andy Print Products No Bid
Pyramid School Products No Bid

Scott Electric No Bid



