JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY / AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION

BID ID: 7086

APPROVAL DATE: June 22, 2015

ITEM(S) QUOTED: CUSTODIAL EQUIPMENT .

DATE BIDS RECEIVED: May 20, 2015

CONTRACT PERIOD: From July 25, 2015 through July 24, 2016
RENEWAL(S): No renewal option.

COMMENTS: An * indicates an award.

PAGE 1



Vendor Response Terms

Vendor Name

Response Terms

Response Payment Terms

Allied-Central Distributing Inc

1. (a)YES, (b) NO 2. Allied Cleaning
Solutions, 11600 Commonwealth Drive,
Louisville, KY 40299 502-261-1600 3. See
Attachment below 4. See Attachments below
5. 14 Days from Purchase Order Date.

Net 30 Days

Baumann Paper Company

5 business days average

Net 30 days from receipt of merchandise

Dixie Vac Service Inc.

Delivery 7-14 days. Warranty 1 year Warranty
service: Dixie Vac Service Inc. 8214 Dixie
Highway Louisville, KY. 40258 502-935-1903

1%-20 days net-30

Genesis Il Inc.

Hillyard - KY

See attached Required Vendor Info, Vendor
References, Vendor Representative Form and
Reciprocal Preference Form.

Net 30 days.

Kenway Distributors, Inc.

1. (a) Yes (b) No 2. Kenway Distributors 6320
Strawberry Lane Louisville, KY 40214 PO Box
9347 Louisville, KY 40209 3. See Attached 4.
See Attached 5. 14 days

net 30 terms

Leonard Brush & Chemical Co.

1l.a. Yes; 1.b. No; 2. 1450 Mellwood Ave.,
Louisville, KY 40206 585-2381 584-2086fax;
5. 14 days delivery Proteam Warranty: 3 yr.
Parts, Labor and Motor, Lifetime warranty on
molded body parts.

net 30 days

Pyramid School Products, Inc.

**OUR BID REFERENCE NUMBER IS
#7086JEFF. THIS NUMBER MUST BE
REFERENCED ON ALL ORDERS PLACED
AGAINST THIS BID.**

NET 30 DAYS

xpedx, a Veritiv company

See attached documents. Formal notarized
documents arriving via mail.

PAGE 2

Net 30 Days



ITEM NO. 1 - Floor machine, 20", electric, Viper TP2015HD or equal. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: State Warranty. Vendor shall have repair facilities within Jefferson County, Kentucky with

adequate spare parts to provide rapid maintenance support and minimum downtime. Indicate facility name, address and phone
number. Failure to have facilities within Jefferson County, Kentucky may subject your bid to rejection. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase,

Estimated Quantity - 1 (2000445-1661406

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Hillyard - KY Viper 456.4500*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: VIPVN2015

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: See attached Machine Specs Sheet. See attached Viper Warranty Info Sheet. See
attached Repair Facility Info Sheet.

Leonard Brush & Chemical Co. Viper (LBC Task Pro) #TP2015HD 465.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: LBC-TP2015HD

Kenway Distributors, Inc. Triple-S / Viper #86011 542.2500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 199505

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Terms

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Warranty (see attachment): 5 years - Metal Castings, Injected Molded Parts, Metal and
Gear Boxes, Labor 1 year - Wear Items

xpedx, a Veritiv company Nobles by Tennant #9007336 689.2000

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 5480524
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 1 Quoting Functional alternate TENNANT SALES & SERVICE NOBLES FM-20-SS 20"
HD 175 RPM 1.5HP FLOOR MACH W/ PAD DRIVER 9007336 5480524 1 EA Nobles
by Tennant operate mobile repair services throughout the Louisville that are equipped to
repair equipment on-site. Tennant also operates a national repair parts distribution
center that operates in Louisville. See attachments for product literature, warranty and
repair facilities information.

Baumann Paper Company NSS #302008 839.9800

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NSS-302008
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 days from receipt of machine

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 20" 1.5HP NSS Galaxy Floor Machine New (includes pad driver)

ITEM NO. 2 - Floor machine, 20", electric, high speed, buffer/burnisher, Viper TP1500 20 or equal. Please respond to the following
in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: State Warranty. Vendor shall have repair facilities within Jefferson County,
Kentucky with adequate spare parts to provide rapid maintenance support and minimum downtime. Indicate facility name, address
and phone number. Failure to have facilities within Jefferson County, Kentucky may subject your bid to rejection. 1-1.0000
Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1 (2000445-1661879)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)
Hillyard - KY Viper 656.7500*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: VIPVN1500

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: See attached Machine Specs Sheet. See attached Viper Warranty Info Sheet. See
attached Repair Facility Info Sheet.

Leonard Brush & Chemical Co. Viper (LBC Task Pro) #TP1500 659.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: LBC-TP1500

Kenway Distributors, Inc. Triple-S / Viper #86012 765.5600
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 199510

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Terms

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Warranty (see attachment): 5 years - Metal Castings, Injected Molded Parts, Metal and
Gear Boxes, Labor 1 year - Wear Iltems

. .
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Baumann Paper Company NSS #300621 1,021.9500

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NSS-300621
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 from receipt of machine

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 1500 SPEED NSS GALAXY CORD ELECTRIC HI SPEED

xpedx, a Veritiv company Nobles by Tennant #BR-1600 1,174.0100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 5480527
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 2 Quoting Functional alternate TENNANT SALES & SERVICE * NOBLES BR-1600-NDC
20" 1600 RPM ELEC BURNISHER W/ PAD DRIVE 9007347 5480527 1 EA Nobles by
Tennant operate mobile repair services throughout the Louisville that are equipped to
repair equipment on-site. Tennant also operates a national repair parts distribution
center that operates in Louisville. See attachments for product literature, warranty and
repair facilities information.

ITEM NO. 3 - Vacuum, wet/dry pick-up, with tool kit. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES
field: State Warranty. Vendor shall have repair facilities within Jefferson County, Kentucky with adequate spare parts to provide
rapid maintenance support and minimum downtime. Indicate facility name, address and phone number. Failure to have facilities
within Jefferson County, Kentucky may subject your bid to rejection. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1
(2000950-1021254)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Allied-Central Distributing, Inc. - does not meet specifications for tip and pour, wheels are the
incorrect size.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($
Allied-Central Distributing Inc MINUTEMAN #C29085-05 465.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: MM-15WDNA

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NET 30 DAYS

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Warranty 3 years parts & 2 years labor 10 years on poly tank (no additional labor)
Repair Facility: Allied Cleaning Solutions 11600 Commonwealth Drive Louisville, KY
40299 502-261-1600

Hillyard - KY ProTeam 485.0000*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: PTM107130

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: See attached Machine Specs Sheet which includes Warranty Info and UL verification of
UL listing. See attached Repair Facility Info sheet.

Leonard Brush & Chemical Co. Proteam(Emerson Tool) #107130 494.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: PT107130

Kenway Distributors, Inc. Pro-Team #107130 607.2000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 107130

RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Terms

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Warranty: 3 years on parts, labor and motor. Lifetime on molded body parts.

Baumann Paper Company Alpha by NSS #5702506 648.0400
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NSS-5702506
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NET 30 FROM RECEIPT OF MACHINE

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Alpha 24 FMS FRONT MOUNTED SQUEEGE WET DRY TOOLS 24 GALLON
CAPACITY

xpedx, a Veritiv company Nobles by Tennant #V-WD-14x 744.2200
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 5480532-5033818
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 3a Quoting Functional alternate TENNANT SALES & SERVICE NOBLES V-WD-15

. .
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15GAL WET/ DRY VACUUM 9007469 5480532 1 EA 3b Quoting Functional alternate
TENNANT SALES & SERVICE NOBLES 26" FRONT MOUNT WET/ DRY SQUEEGEE
KIT 190108 5033818 1 KIT Nobles by Tennant operate mobile repair services throughout
the Louisville that are equipped to repair equipment on-site. Tennant also operates a
national repair parts distribution center that operates in Louisville. See attachments for
product literature, warranty and repair facilities information.

ITEM NO. 4 - Vacuum, carpet, upright. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: State
Warranty. Vendor shall have repair facilities within Jefferson County, Kentucky with adequate spare parts to provide rapid
maintenance support and minimum downtime. Indicate facility name, address and phone number. Failure to have facilities within
Jefferson County, Kentucky may subject your bid to rejection. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1
(2000950-1098931)

ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Hillyard-KY - 12-inch pick-up not acceptable.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Kenway Distributors, Inc. no bid 0.0001
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: no bid

Hillyard - KY Nilfisk Advance 199.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: ADV03002A

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: See attached Machine Specs Sheet including UL verification of UL listing. See attached
Warranty Info Sheet. See attached Repair Facility Info Sheet.

Dixie Vac Service Inc. Perfect Vac #P-102 244.5000*

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: P-102
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 1%-20days net-30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Delivery 7-10 days Warranty 1 year Warranty service: Dixie Vac Service Inc. 8214 Dixie
Highway Louisville, KY. 40258 502-935-1903

Pyramid School Products, Inc. SANITAIRE #SC899F 289.9800

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: SC899F
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: *SEE ATTACHED SPEC SHEETS**

xpedx, a Veritiv company Nobles by Tennant #V-SMU-14 310.7100
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 5507344
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 4 Quoting Functional alternate TENNANT SALES & SERVICE NOBLES V-SMU-14
SINGLE MOTOR VACUUM W/ TOOL 1060829 5507344 1 EA Nobles by Tennant
operate mobile repair services throughout the Louisville that are equipped to repair
equipment on-site. Tennant also operates a national repair parts distribution center that
operates in Louisville. See attachments for product literature, warranty and repair
facilities information.

ITEMNO.5 - Vacuum, 15", upright HEPA. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:
State Warranty. Vendor shall have repair facilities within Jefferson County, Kentucky with adequate spare parts to provide rapid
maintenance support and minimum downtime. Indicate facility name, address and phone number. Failure to have facilities within
Jefferson County, Kentucky may subject your bid to rejection. 1 - 1.0000 Each Purchase, Estimated Quantity - 1

(2000950-1733452)
ITEM AWARD NOTES: Reject Hillyard-KY - 12-inch pick-up not acceptable.

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Kenway Distributors, Inc. no bit 0.0010
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: no bid

Hillyard - KY Nilfisk Advance 225.0000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: ADV107404753

. .
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RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: See attached Machine Specs Info Sheet including Warranty Info. We are bidding the
VU500 12" vacuum. See attached Repair Facility Info Sheet.

Dixie Vac Service Inc. A.B. Electrolux #SC-5815 244.5000*

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: SC-5815
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: 1%-20 net-30

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Delivery 7-14 days Warranty 1 year Warranty service: Dixie Vac Service Inc. 8214 Dixie
Highway Louisville, KY. 40258 502-935-1903

Pyramid School Products, Inc. SANITAIRE #SC5815B 253.9500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: SC5815B
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: *SEE ATTACHED SPEC SHEETS**

Baumann Paper Company NSS #9600151 343.5600

VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: NSS-9600151
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: NET 30 FROM RECEIPT OF MACHINE

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: NSS PACER 15UE 15" VACUUM

xpedx, a Veritiv company Nobles by Tennant #V-DMU-14 406.4300
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 6030225
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: 5 Quoting Functional alternate TENNANT SALES & SERVICE V-DMU-14 TENN 14"
GRY NOBLES DUAL MOTOR UPRIGHT VACUUM 1068027 6030225 1 EA Nobles by
Tennant operate mobile repair services throughout the Louisville that are equipped to
repair equipment on-site. Tennant also operates a national repair parts distribution
center that operates in Louisville. See attachments for product literature, warranty and
repair facilities information.

(2000080-1714515)

VENDOR NAME ITEM MANUFACTURER & PART NUMBER UNIT PRICE ($)

Kenway Distributors, Inc. no bid 0.0010
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: no bid

Genesis Il Inc. Genesis 91.8600*
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: BB154048

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Packed Each

Pyramid School Products, Inc. IMPACT #6850 93.9500
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 6850
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: *SEE ATTACHED SPEC SHEET**

Allied-Central Distributing Inc Impact #6850 96.5000
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: IM-6850
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

Baumann Paper Company CONTINENTAL #184BL 139.3400
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 563-101
RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: STOCK ITEM TYPICALLY AVAILABLE NEXT BUSINESS DAY

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: CONTINENTAL 184 BLUE JANITOR CART

xpedx, a Veritiv company Rubbermaid Commercial Products 166.6600
#FG617388BLA
VENDOR REFERENCE NUMBER: 5344840

. .
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RESPONSE ITEM PAYMENT TERMS: Net 30 Days

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES: Product literature attached

. .
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TOTAL BIDS

VENDOR NAME TOTAL ($) AWARDED TOTAL ($)
Allied-Central Distributing Inc 561.50
Baumann Paper Company 2,992.87
Dixie Vac Service Inc. 489.00 489.00
Genesis Il Inc. 91.86 91.86
Hillyard - KY 2,022.20 1,598.20
Kenway Distributors, Inc. 1,915.01
Leonard Brush & Chemical Co. 1,618.00
Pyramid School Products, Inc. 637.88
xpedx, a Veritiv company 3,491.23

2,179.06

Note: * indicates a pending award.
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