erfical: C	Description	Pack	Quantity	Approved Products	lateroduct Manufacti	ırııfacturer tribi	utor Cak Numal	(Spack Unitorian	немвіліть	t Unit Price
1 F(B	Bakery Products. BREADSTICK - Mozzarella filled twisted	90.0 - 3.1 Ounces		Tasty Brands, LLC 62002	Equ'TB	62002	90 3	CONTRACTOR CONTRACTOR OF THE STATE OF THE ST	aty bia om	
	buttery breadstick, whole grain				140.10	02002	30 (3	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	1	41.08
	Provides 2.0 oz grain equivalent	60.0 - 3.0 Ounces	1,300 Cases	Bake Crafters (Bake Crafters Food Company) - 2003	Equ Bake Crafter	2003	1 1		1	21.53
	Bakery Products. Breakfast Toast - egg, cheese & turkey bacon, whole grain, individually wrapped	120.0 - 2.64 Ounc	es	Tasty Brands, LLC 55104	Eq. TB	55104	1 1	n reas a financia de maria de la compansión de la compans	1	57.31
4 FGB	Bakery Products. Buns & Rolls: hot dog, whole wheat, hinged, commercially baked bun, whole grain. Provides 2.0 oz grain equivalent	144.0 - 2.0 Ounce	150 Cases	Bake Crafters (Bake Crafters Food Company) - 471	Apr Bake Crafter	471	1 1		1	23.14
	Bakery Products. French Toast Sticks, WG. (3 pieces = 3.3oz). Provides 2.0 grain equivalent	47.0 Servings	700 Cases	Bake Crafters (Bake Crafters Food Company) - 442	EquiBake Crafter	442	1	(Sentegoral prophysicanskin graves) av Garrage upagen (98) m	1	17.72
6 FcB	Bakery Products. Muffins: Whole Grain, Cornbread, IW. Provides 1.0 oz grain equivalent	72.0 - 1.8 Ounces	1,500 Cases	Bake Crafters (Bake Crafters Food Company) - 1278	Apr Bake Crafter	1278	1	pagana ganara makama paminan kababahan baran 1999m indamma	1	18.45
7 F(B	Bakery Products. WG Cheese Stuffed Sandwich, IW, wholegrain crust surrounds a filling of mozzarella cheese and pizza sauce	96.0 - 2.27 Ounce	300 Cases	The Schwan Food Company - 55299	Eq. schwan	55299	1 1			45
	Buns & Rolls: slider, hinged, commercially baked, bun, whole grain. Provides 1.0 oz grain equivalent	288.0 - 1.1 Ounce	700 Cases	Bake Crafters (Bake Crafters Food Company) - 519	Equ Bake Crafter	519	1 1		1	42.67
	Cheese: white, reduced fat, shredded, bulk, processed, reduced sodium, part skim, mozzarella.		200 Cases	Land O' Lakes (Land O'Lakes, Inc. (LOL)) - 41698	Eqt LOL	41698	1 1		1	56.85
	Cheese: yellow, reduced fat, sliced, bulk, processed, reduced sodium, american. 160 Sliced	6.0 - 5.0 Pounds	500 Cases	Land O'Lakes, Inc. (LOL) - 46288	Eq. LOL	46288	1 1		1	81.08
11 F P	Chicken Nuggets, whole grain breading, Homestyle Cooked W/D Meat, w/ISP, Must Have CN Label, 5 nuggets to meet 2 oz meat/meat alt	26.0 Pounds	2,000 Cases	Pilgrim's Pride Corporation - 6116	EquTyson	3731	1 1		1	56.98
12 F¢P	Chicken Patty,Homestyle Breading W/D Meat Fully Cooked W/Isp Cn Label	26 Pounds	2,500 Cases	Tyson Foods, Inc 3732	Apr Tyson	3732	1 1	manang managi nasiguna makaman manakan abasan panahangan baran	1	56.87
13 Fe P	Chicken: filet, cooked, hot & spicy, white. Whole Muscel	40.0 - 4.0 Ounces	500 Cases	Brakebush (Brakebush Brothers) - 5206	Equ BB	5206	1 1		1	39.45
14 F P	Chicken: patty, cooked, grilled, unbreaded, mix.	90 / 2.65 Ounces	150 Cases	Tyson Foods, Inc 5567	Apr Tyson	5567	1 1	mare acceptance of the second	1	65.33
	Chicken: patty, cooked, homestyle, breaded, mix, whole grain.	200 / 1.45 Ounces	2,000 Cases	Brakebush (Brakebush Brothers) - 5902	Eq. BB	5902	1		1	39.45
16 F P	Chicken: spicy, asian style.	6.0 - 7.15 Pounds	500 Cases	Asian Food Solutions - 73003	Equ No Bid \$ from man	ufacturer	1 1		1	
17 Fc H	Corn Dogs: chicken, whole grain batter, reduced fat, frozen, bulk, cooked, with sticks.	72 / 4.0 Ounces	2,000 Cases	Foster Farms State Fair Foods, Inc. (Sara Lee Foods)	Equ Foster Farm	95150	1 1	فيتنان واسترادون وودنوانسا مسونس مدينات وأحده	1	29.11
	Diced Chicken, / White And Dark; Fully Cooked. 60/40 mix	2.0 - 5.0 Pounds	2,500 Pound:	Tyson Foods, Inc 17306	Equityson	22830	1 1		1	2.9
	Egg Roll: pork & vegetable, precooked. whole wheat	60.0 - 4.4	40 Cases	Minh Food Corporation (The Schwan Food Company) - 69349	Equ schwan	69349	1 1	amon de Sala (Amondo Mario Nello, a particolità i di Sala di padari spili depi ani	1	41.85
20 E	Ethnic Foods. Orange Chicken Stir Fry Kit - made with lightly dusted chicken and tossed in an orange sauce	240.0 - 2.8 Ounce	125 Cases	The Schwan Food Company - 69020	Eqt Schwan	69020	1 1		1	154.15
21 F(S	Fish Nuggets, Breaded, Alaskan Pollack, 5 Nuggets Portions, Grade A; Each Porton Provides .5 Oz Cooked, Products Must Be Sampled Before Final Award	188 / 0.86 Ounces	550 Cases	FPI (Fishery Products) (High Liner Foods (USA), Inc.) - 1089301	Apr FPI	1089301	1 1		1	28.56
	Fish Square Shape Alask Pollack, Usda Fish Crispy Breading, Precooked, Grade A Sheild Must Be On Box; Piece Must Provide 2 Oz. Of Cooked Meat/Alt, Products Must Be Sampled Before Final Award		600 Cases	FPI (Fishery Products) (High Liner Foods (USA), Inc.) - 1089300		1089300	1 1		1	22.5
23 FdS	Fish Sticks, Breaded, 1 Oz Portions Grade A; Each Portion Provides .5 Oz, Products Must Be Sampled Before Final Award	160 / 1.0 Ounces	600 Cases	FPI (Fishery Products) (High Liner Foods (USA), Inc.) - 1089302	Apt FPI	1089302	1 1		1	24.21

24 F	Me Ham, Boneless, Buffet, Fully Cooked Usda Inspected W/	19.0 - 20.0 Pounds	11 000 Pour	Correlated Condensation	(F-/7-1- 14	700		ì			* -	
27	Natural Juice.Produce From Whole Muscle,Pff 18.5 To 20.4	16.0 - 20.0 Pounds	11,000 Pound	Farmland Foodservice Bryan Foods (Sara Lee Foods)	EquJohn Morrell	7E+09	114	1	1		. 1	2.23
	· ·			Hormel Foods Corporation			100					
25 F	Hd Hot Dogs: meat, 8:1, reduced fat, frozen, cooked.	80.0 - 2.0 Ounces	3,000 Cases	Fischer Packing Company - 85370	Equ John Morrell	7E+09		1	1		1	18
26 Fc	Hd Hot Dogs: turkey, 8:1, reduced fat, frozen, cooked.	80.0 - 2.0 Ounces		Jennie-O - 72001	Equijennie	72001	engere en innovembre Marie en innovembre	no become money and a	1		1	28
27 F(1	Be Juices & Drinks: apple, 100% juice, frozen, plastic, cup, no	72.0 - 4.0	4,500 Cases	Suncup (Gregory Packaging Inc.) - 90303	Apr Country Pure	90303	***************************************	militaria	1	ered ligarese eren eren eren eren eren eren eren	1	10.91
	added sugar, juice.			Ardmore Farms (Country Pure Foods)								
28 Fe		72.0 - 4.0 Ounces	3,300 Cases	Suncup (Gregory Packaging Inc.) - 90503	Equ Country Pure	90503		1	1		1	13.07
30 E	added sweeteners, unsweetened, juice.	1	4 000 0	Ardmore Farms (Country Pure Foods)			9-7-1-7-2-2-2-2-2-2-2-2-2-2-2-2-2-2-2-2-2		· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	n kalendar v med jednojaj promitijaj da se mejejenje je		antitudes for a secret as a secret as definition for a form to the property of the property of the contract of
29 [11]	Be Juices & Drinks: orange, 100% juice, frozen, plastic, cup, no added sweeteners, unsweetened, juice.	72.0 - 4.0 Ounces	4,900 Cases	Ardmore Farms (Country Pure Foods)	Eqt Country Pure	90100		1	1		1	12.81
30 Fc	Lu Lunchmeat: breast, frozen, turkey, fully cooked, roasted.	6 / 2.0 Pounds	10 000 Pound	Jennie-O - 8482	Equiennie	8482	***************************************			11.000-00000000000000000000000000000000	1	3.8
	reduced sodium, thin.	0 / 2.0 / Odrids	10,000 1 00110	Jernie O - 0402	Edelenne	0402		*	1			3.6
31 fc l	Meat. Pepperoni Style Seasoned Turkey Slices, 3.5",	6.0 - 2.0 Pounds		Jennie-O - 2130-12	Equ No Bid- Discontinue	d	***************	1	1	blendin perlantus bermerenandura	***************************************	ورسيدن وسييدوه والاستمار والمساوقية والاستامار والمائية والمائية والمساورة والمستودية
32 F(Cc Oil: trans fat free, canola.	1.0 - 35.0 Pounds	1,000 Cases	International Foods - 201209	Equ International	201209		1	1		1	
33 F(I	Pi; Pizza: rectangle, cream sauce, turkey sausage, white, whole			Tony's (The Schwan Food Company) - 78352	Egyschwan	78352			1		1	46.75
	grain, 50/50 mozz/sub mozz, biscuit, deep dish, stuffed			, - (
	crust, reduced fat, frozen, reduced sodium, 3" x 4", par-								44 3 5	Y HE BOOK		
	baked. Low-fat cheese, < 750mg sodium. Meat topping											
	should be lean protein; low-fat meat; reduced fat meat.											
34 Fr	Piz Pizza: round, cheese, whole grain, 50/50 mozz/sub mozz,	9.0 - 16.0 Inches	250 Cacac	Big Daddy's Pizza (The Schwan Food Company) -	Eguschwan	78926		41	196	rigisi eta de la		
	wheat crust, reduced fat, frozen, reduced sodium, 16", par-	3.0 - 10.0 Inches	200 Cases	78926	Equaciiwan	78920		1	1		1	52
	baked.											
35 Fel	Piż Pizza: round, pepperoni, whole grain, 50/50 mozz/sub mozz,	9.0 - 16.0 Inches	500 Cases	Big Daddy's Pizza (The Schwan Food Company) -	Equschwan	78927	Asi yulaya	1	1		1	52
	wheat crust, reduced fat, frozen, reduced sodium, 16", par-	***************************************		78927				and of the same of				
25 5	baked. PuPizza. square, cheese, whole grain, 50/50 mazz/sub mozz,	000 500	1 700 6	T1-/Th C-1		1						
30 []	wheat crust, reduced fat, frozen, reduced sodium, 4" x 6".	90.0 - 5.5 Ounces	1,700 Cases	Tony's (The Schwan Food Company) - 78763	Equischwan	78763		1	1		1	35.14
	par-baked. Low-fat cheese, < 750mg sodium. Meat topping											
- Charles	should be lean protein; low-fat meat: reduced fat meat.	-			w Volume of the control of the contr		A B					
					Telefore, prefixedati	Aliston Glic	girt alitz		arija da Kv		anda Nasa kangantan	La La Legra des gração da Las
37 F(I	Pizza: square, pepperoni, whole grain, 50/50 mozz/sub	96.0 - 5.6	1,600 Cases	Tony's (The Schwan Food Company) - 78674	Equschwan	78674		1	1		1	36.09
	mozz, wheat crust, reduced fat, frozen, reduced sodium, 4" x						paraller.		重图 心心			
	6", par-baked. Low-fat cheese, < 750mg sodium. Meat											
	topping should be lean protein; low-fat meat; reduced fat meat.											
38 F(Piz Pizza: square, sausage, whole grain, 50/50 mozz/sub mozz,	96.0	500 Cases	Tony's (The Schwan Food Company) - 73160	Egyschwan	73160		1	1		100 1 1 5 5	47.25
	wheat crust, reduced fat, frozen, reduced sodium, 4" x 6",			, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,	The analysis of the second second							
	par-baked. Low-fat cheese, < 750mg sodium. Meat topping				- 1人。 1人, 1人, 1人, 1人, 1人, 1人, 1人, 1人,					建设 建物		
	should be lean protein; low-fat meat; reduced fat meat.						William Control		44 3 6			
30 E	Po Potato Wedges , Spicy	6 / E O Dound-	1 200 Casa-	1.D. Simplet Company 10071170479033								
اع ا ود	or otato weages , spicy	6 / 5.0 Pounds	1,300 Cases	J.R. Simplot Company - 10071179478089 McCain Foods Limited - MCXO3626	Eqt Mccain	MCX03626		1	1		36 1 Harris	20.45
40 Fel	Pc Potato, 3/8" Oven Fry, Coated Fry	6 / 5.0 Pounds	4.000 Cases	J.R. Simplot Company - 10071179018490	Equcav	5311		1	1		1	21.73
		, 5.0 i ounds	.,500 Cases	Cavendish Farms - 56210 05311-2	Edecas	.3311						41./3
41 Fq1	Po Potato, Seasoned Potato Cubes	6 / 5.0 Pounds	1,250 Cases	Cavendish Farms - 56210 05222-2	Equcav	5222		1	1		1	15
				Lamb Weston, Inc A28		dalla Quah	w, 26 mm, 27 mm,					
	Pc Potato, Sweet Potato Fries, Lattice-Cut Fries	6.0 - 2.5 Pounds	50 Cases	McCain Foods Limited - MCF05074	Equ Mccain	MCF05074		1	1		1	21.75
43 Fd	Po Potato, Tater Tots	6 / 5.0 Pounds	800 Cases	Lamb Weston, Inc H30	Eq. Mcain	OIF00215		1	1		1	16.68
10 =	Do Dototopou franch fulco 1/28 Caluldo Cub (Cardo Al ad	6.45.0.0	5 000 0	McCain Foods Limited - OIF00215								tropo my amo mo veto en trobando paramen agranas anadas a judição com ano
144 [F]	Pc Potatoes: french fries. 1/2" Crinkle Cut 'Grade A' only, coated, bake or fry	6 / 5.0 Pounds	6,800 Cases	Lamb Weston, Inc X14	Equicav	Maria Sh		1	1		1	15.95
	repared, bake of ITA	1	1	McCain Foods Limited - OIF00055A	 ★ ASSA (#434-64-64-64-64-64-64-64-64-64-64-64-64-64	earcheanna (F	400年1月1日	ering to the first of the		11/2012/19/19/19/19		g cyclostic protectió is de Gibble

45 For Potatoes: nuggets/bites, reduced fat, domestic, frozen, sweet potato, oven ready, grade b/extra standard.	6.0 - 2.5 Pounds	500 Cases	Harvest Splender (McCain Foods Limited) - MCF05034	Equ Mccain	MCF0534	The state of the s	1	1	1 18
46 FC Pc Potatoes: wedge, steak, reduced fat, domestic, frozen, sweet potato, oven ready, grade b/extra standard.	6.0 - 2.5 Pounds	500 Cases	Harvest Splender (McCain Foods Limited)	Equ Mccain	MCF4712		1	1	1 20.75
47 F6Sa Sausage: patty, pork, cooked. 1.5oz cooked weight. Whole hog	128.0 - 1.5 Ounce	1	Tennessee Pride - 456 Swaggerty Sausage Co., Inc.	Equswaggerty			1	1	1 16.5
48 Food Spicy Chicken Breast-W/D	150 / 3.23 Ounces	1,100 Cases	Tyson Foods, Inc 70314	Equtyson	70314		1	1	55.73
49 For Tangerine Chicken	6 / 7.2 Pounds	500 Cases	Asian Food Solutions - 72001	Equ No Bid from Manuf		Sand Leaven Constitution Consti	1	1	es firm of the months proved the month and a specific propagation of the propagation of the provided for the
50 F¢Pr Teriyaki Chicken	6 / 7.15 Pounds	500 Cases	Asian Food Solutions - 73001	Eq. No Bid from Manuf	and an an Paperin Fernancia palace and a particular property		1	1	A
51 FcLu Turkey Combo Pack	12 / 1.0 Pounds	300 Cases	Jennie-O - 2095	Equjennie	2095		1	1	1 37.27
52 FePc Turkey: diced, ham, cooked, dark.	2 / 5.0 Pounds	5,000 Pounds	Jennie-O - 6409	Equijennie	6409		1	1	1 34.5
53 FcPcTurkey: roast, cooked, seasoned, boneless, mix.		16,000 Pound	Jennie-O - 317004	Equiennie	317004		1	1	1 2.79
54 FeHc Wrapped Sausage: frozen, bulk, with sticks, heat and serve, chicken, whole grain batter, pancake.	56.0 - 2.85 Ounce	1 *	Foster Farms - 96087 State Fair Foods, Inc. (Sara Lee Foods)	Equ Foster	95121	Construence Constr	1	1	1 20.15