CHENOWETH LAW OFFICE 114 South Main Street Lawrenceburg, Kentucky 40342 Telephone No. (502) 839-0114 Employer I.D. No. 61-1216451

SPENCER COUNTY SCHOOLS 207 West Main Street Taylorsville, KY 40071-8619 BILLING DATE 10/31/14

ACCOUNT NUMBER RLC004226

Billing Period: May 1-June 30, 2014

RE: General School Matters

BALANCE CARRIED FORWARD FROM PREVIOUS INVOICE

\$597.23 CR

DATE PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

INDIV TIME

(SEE ATTACHED LIST)

TOTAL FOR THE ABOVE SERVICES

13.10 \$1,637.50

**EXPENSES** 

(SEE ATTACHED LIST)

TOTAL FOR THE ABOVE EXPENSES

\$79.49

TOTAL

\$1,119.76

PAYMENT RECEIVED

TOTAL PAYMENT

\$0.00

AMOUNT DUE

\$1,119.76

M KARAT LINASI

VERN PARTOCALIA STEAD

TVOESIBE

LONG TO THE SECUL PRINTER

21 1 25 79

SPENCER COUNTY SCHOOLS
RE: General School Matters

BILLING DATE 10/31/14 ACCOUNT NUMBER RLC004226

DATE	PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED	INDIV	TIME	
05-07-14	Receipt and review Attorney General's Notification to Agency of Receipt of	GD G	0.20	\$25.00
05-07-14	Open Records Appeal Return call to citizen regarding	GRC		
05-09-14	open records requests and appeal Prepare email to Supt. Adams regarding potential for hiring athletic trainer	GRC	0.20	\$25.00
	for high school athletic practices and events	GRC	0.30	\$37.50
05-12-14	Tele. call to D. Thomas regarding records appeal; personnel issue	GRC	0.20	\$25.00
05-12-14	Prepare response to Open Records Act appeal	GRC	2.10	\$262.50
05-13-14	Tele. call from citizen regarding previous record request; inquiry as	GRC	n/c	\$0.00
	to where to send payment	GRC	n/c	\$0.00
05-17-14	Receipt and review email from citizen	GRC	11/ C	40.00
05-19-14	Prepare correspondence to Supt. Adams			
	regarding contact from citizen regarding	CDC	0.20	\$25.00
	records request(s) issues	GRC	0.20	φ23.00
05-19-14	Review KSP criminal background check	ana	0.50	\$62.50
	agreement and prepare email to D. Thomas	GRC GRC	0.40	\$50.00
05-21-14	Tele. call to D. Thomas	GRC	0.40	\$50.00
05-22-14	Receipt and review School-District			
	favorable Open Records Decision regarding			
	appeal against School District; prepare		0.00	¢25 00
	cover correspondence to Supt. Adams	GRC	0.20	\$25.00
05-23-14	Tele. call from citizen; prepare letter			
	to citizen providing copies of records		SHOT YOUR MIC	
	subsequent to receipt of payment	GRC	0.10	\$12.50
06-04-14	Draft reply to Attorney General's Office			
00 01 11	regarding open records appeal	GRC	0.90	\$112.50
06-04-14	Prepare email to Supt. Adams regarding			• 0 • 000 000 000
00 04 11	ongoing contact from citizen	GRC	0.10	\$12.50
06-04-14	Return call to Atty. Ruberg regarding			
00-04-14	threat of litigation; status of litigation			
	in Boone Circuit Court	GRC	n/c	\$0.00
06 00 14	Prepare response to records request,			
06-09-14	including review of records provided			
	Including leview of records provided	GRC	0.90	\$112.50
0 - 1 - 1 4	by D. Thomas Exchange emails to D. Thomas regarding			
06-11-14	employee on disability leave; draft			
	employee on disability leave, diale	GRC	0.40	\$50.00
	letter to be sent to employee	GRE	0.11	
06-11-14	Tele. call from citizen reacting to	GRC	0.10	\$12.50
	records response letter	GIC	0.10	4
06-11-14	Receipt and review email from D. Thomas	GRC	0.20	\$25.00
	regarding enrollment of foreign student	GRC	0.20	φ25.00
06-11-14	Tele. call to D. Thomas regarding F-1			
	Visa and I-20 form for foreign student	ana	0 50	\$62.50
	enrollment	GRC	0.50	302.50
06-11-14	Prepare email to D. Thomas regarding		0 10	¢10 E0
	foreign student enrollment	GRC	0.10	\$12.50
06-11-14	Receipt and review OAG decision regarding			
·	open records appeal; prepare cover email			1
	transmitting decision to Supt. Adams	GRC	0.40	\$50.00
06-16-14	Prepare correspondence to D. Thomas			
00 10 14	regarding retention schedule vis-a-vis			
	personnel records, UI records, etc.	GRC	0.20	\$25.00
	porbonnor rooter,,			

PAGE THREE
BILLING DATE 10/31/14
ACCOUNT NUMBER RLC004226

## SPENCER COUNTY SCHOOLS RE: General School Matters

DATE	PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED	INDIV	TIME	
06-17-14	Receipt and review records provided by			
00 17 11	D. Thomas for responding to records request	GRC	0.50	\$62.50
06-17-14	Draft letter to citizen responding to records request	GRC	0.30	\$37.50
06-17-14	Tele. call from citizen regarding request for additional records	GRC	0.10	\$12.50
06-17-14	Prepare email to CIO/DTC regarding archived emails of former employee	GRC	0.10	\$12.50
06-18-14	Conf. with RLC regarding status of Evergreen Clause use Draft Fourth Addendum to Contract	GRC	0.20	\$25.00
06-18-14	Re-Employing Superintendent; forward to Supt. Adams by email Tele. call to M. Barlow to obtain	GRC	0.70	\$87.50
06-18-14	<pre>information regarding Board meeting minutes for prior addenda to superintendent's contract</pre>	GRC	0.10	\$12.50
06-18-14	Tele. call from Supt. Adams regarding open records; record retention; superintendent's contract	GRC	0.40	\$50.00
06-19-14	Tele. call from Citizen regarding status of request for additional records	GRC	0.10	\$12.50
06-19-14	Receipt and review email from citizen regarding posing of notice regarding public records; prepare email to Supt. Adams and D. Thomas regarding records			
06-23-14	appeal Receipt and review emails from Supt.	GRC	0.20	\$25.00
	Adams and D. Thomas regarding open records request Review email from CIO; receipt and	GRC	0.10	\$12.50
06-23-14	review email from citizen; prepare response email to citizen	GRC	0.20	\$25.00
06-24-14	Tele. call to D. Thomas regarding records request and subpoena	GRC	0.40	\$50.00
06-24-14	Prepare response letter to citizen regarding open records complaint as to posting of notices	GRC	0.30	\$37.50
06-26-14	Review subpoena and related documents; draft letter to attorney issuing	1 *** * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * *	£	
25 25 14	subpoena to formally contest/object due to FERPA issues Prepare letter to Atty. Rust regarding	GRC	0.40	\$50.00
06-27-14	deficiencies in subpoena and regarding compliance with FERPA	GRC	0.80	\$100.00

BILLING DATE 10/31/14 ACCOUNT NUMBER RLC004226

## SPENCER COUNTY SCHOOLS RE: General School Matters

. . . .

## EXPENSES

05-07-14	Long distance telephone call	\$3.08
05-09-14	Photocopy expense - 7 copies @ \$.15	\$1.05
05-12-14	Photocopy expense - 16 copies @ \$.15	\$2.40
05-12-14	Long distance telephone call	\$2.39
05-13-14	Photocopy expense - 7 copies @ \$.15	\$1.05
05-12-14	FAX Fee	\$2.00
05-19-14	Photocopy expense - 8 copies @ \$.15	\$1.20
05-21-14	Long distance telephone call	\$5.23
05-22-14	Photocopy expense - 24 copies @ \$.15	\$3.60
05-23-14	Photocopy expense - 134 copies @ \$.10 [ORR]	\$13.40
05-27-14	Photocopy expense - 5 copies @ \$.15	\$0.75
06-03-14	Photocopy expense - 8 copies @ \$.15	\$1.20
06-05-14	FAX Fee	\$1.50
06-09-14	Photocopy expense - 91 copies @ \$.15	\$13.65
06-11-14	Photocopy expense - 11 copies @ \$.15	\$1.65
06-11-14	Long distance telephone call	\$5.47
06-12-14	Photocopy expense - 5 copies @ \$.15	\$0.75
06-17-14	Photocopy expense - 6 copies @ \$.15	\$0.90
06-18-14	Photocopy expense - 10 copies @ \$.15	\$1.50
06-18-14	Long distance telephone call	\$0.69
06-19-14	Photocopy expense - 5 copies @ \$.15	\$0.75
06-24-14	Photocopy expense - 24 copies @ \$.15	\$3.60
06-24-14	Long distance telephone call	\$5.08
06-27-14	Photocopy expense - 12 copies @ \$.15	\$1.80
06-27-14	FAX Fee	\$1.50
06-30-14	Photocopy expense - 22 copies @ \$.15	\$3.30