

Henderson County Schools

1805 Second Street, Henderson, Kentucky 42420
(270) 831-5000 Fax: (270) 831-5009
www.henderson.kyschools.us



TO: Marganna K. Stanley
And School Board Members

FROM: Walt Spencer, CPA
Director of Finance

DATE: August 18, 2014

RE: Bid Recommendations

A handwritten signature in blue ink, which appears to be "Walt Spencer", is written over the "FROM:" line and extends slightly into the "DATE:" line.

Bid Recommendations

Fire Safety Equipment, Sprinkler System Equipment/Parts, and Hood Suppression System Parts Bid # 11-14-7-8

Invitations were sent to 5 vendors. We received bids from Armor Fire Protection and Kooresen Fire and Safety. After evaluating the bids it is our recommendation to award the bid to Armor Fire Protection.

Milk Coolers Bod # 10-14-7-8

Bids were received from seven (7) companies for forced air milk coolers. We are recommending the bid be awarded to CRS OneSource for 20 8-crate milk coolers, 5 12-crate milk coolers and 3 16-crate milk coolers. We also recommend to award Wabash Food Service the bid for 1 8-crate dual access milk cooler. The Bid Tabulation Sheet is included with this recommendation.

HENDERSON COUNTY SCHOOLS - CHILD NUTRITION

1805 Second Street
Henderson, KY 42420

FORCED AIR MILK COOLERS

Bid # 10-14-7-8

ITEM	C & T DESIGN	extended	CRS ONESOURCE	extended	WABASH FOOD SERVICE	extended	ARCTIC REFRIGERATION & FOODSERVICE	extended	RESTAURANT LINK	extended	SAM TELL & SONS	extended	ALACK REFRIGERATION CO INC	extended
FORCED AIR MILK COOLERS														
White Coated finish on SS Exterior 8 Crate	No Bid		<u>\$1,940.00</u>	\$38,800.00	\$1,820.20	\$36,404.00	\$1,865.38	\$37,307.60	\$1,700.98	\$34,019.60	\$2,516.99	\$50,339.80	\$1,700.00	\$34,000.00
Stainless Steel Exterior 8 Crate	\$2,408.40	\$48,168.00	\$2,020.00	\$40,400.00	\$1,938.00	\$38,760.00	No Bid		\$1,936.99	\$38,739.80	No Bid		\$1,800.00	\$36,000.00
White Coated finish on SS Exterior 12 Crate	No Bid		<u>\$2,220.00</u>	\$11,100.00	\$2,139.27	\$10,696.35	\$2,192.37	\$10,961.85	\$1,961.99	\$9,809.95	\$2,796.87	\$13,984.35	\$2,000.00	\$10,000.00
Stainless Steel Exterior 12 Crate	\$2,681.65	\$13,408.25	\$2,400.00	\$12,000.00	\$2,314.00	\$11,570.00	No Bid		\$2,312.99	\$11,564.95	No Bid		\$2,171.00	\$10,855.00
White Coated finish on SS Exterior 16 Crate	No Bid		<u>\$2,475.00</u>	\$7,425.00	\$2,366.39	\$7,099.17	\$2,425.12	\$7,275.36	\$2,132.99	\$6,398.97	\$2,987.91	\$8,963.73	No Bid	\$0.00
Stainless Steel Exterior 16 Crate	\$3,214.25	\$9,642.75	\$2,700.00	\$8,100.00	\$2,598.00	\$7,794.00	No Bid		\$2,596.99	\$7,790.97	No Bid		No Bid	\$0.00
8 Crate Dual Access Milk Cooler Wh/SS Ext	No Bid		\$3,125.00	\$3,125.00	<u>\$2,700.50</u>	\$2,700.50	\$2,767.55	\$2,767.55	\$2,489.99	\$2,489.99	\$3,207.96	\$3,207.96	No Bid	\$0.00
8 Crate Dual Access Milk Cooler SS Ext	\$3,570.03	\$3,570.03	\$3,225.00	\$3,225.00	\$2,899.00	\$2,899.00	No Bid		\$2,689.99	\$2,689.99	No Bid		No Bid	\$0.00
8 Crate Capacity Compressor Unit	\$2,000.00	\$2,000.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$369.55	\$369.55	\$289.43	\$289.43	No Bid	\$0.00	\$249.69	\$249.69	No Bid	\$0.00
TOTAL ALL UNITS DELIVERED:	\$77,689.03	\$76,789.03	\$75,990.00	\$60,450.00	\$60,769.44	\$57,269.57	\$58,312.36	\$58,601.79		white \$54,510.42 SS	\$76,745.53	\$76,745.53		white \$44,000.00 SS
TRAULSEN			BEV-AIR	\$63,725.00	TRUE	\$61,392.55	TRUE		TRUE	\$62,577.62	CONTINENTAL			\$46,855.00
					White Finish				Delivery Charge					
									\$1,791.91					
									Inside delivery					
									of all units at once					
Evaluation Criteria														
a. Quality of Product And Services provided	8		8		6		6		6		6		6	
b. Service- (1) business reputation of the bidder	10		8		8		6		5		5		5	
c. Availability of items and services needed	8		8		8		8		8		6		4	
d. Cost of items bid based on specific product	6		8		10		9		10		6		9	
e. Delivery of product or service	8		10		8		10		6		6		6	
Total:	40		<u>42</u>		<u>40</u>		39		35		29		30	

HENDERSON COUNTY SCHOOLS

1805 Second Street

Henderson, Kentucky 42420

Fire Safety Equipment, Sprinkler System Equipment/Parts, and Hood Suppression System Parts Bid # 11-14-7-8 TABULATION SHEET

Successful bidder is highlighted.

		Advanced Fire & Safety	Armor Fire Protection	Armor Fire Protection	Triple T Hood & Duct Cleaning	Koorsen Fire & Safety	Tri-State Fire Protection, Inc.
Henderson County High School Hydrostatically test (2) PyroChem kitchen hood suppression systems	Parts	No Bid			No Bid	3 Cylinders	No Bid
	Labor		\$350.00			Rebuild Kits 3	
	Total		\$710.00			Chemical \$2,159.08	
Henderson County High School Replace (8) failed water gages, (3) 110 v failed bells and preform internal inspection on sprinkler system.	Parts	No Bid		Internal Inspection \$800.00 per system (3 systems) \$2,400.00	No Bid	8 Guages 3	No Bid
	Labor		\$400.00			110V Bells \$554.71	
	Total		\$1,025.00	\$2,400.00		\$2,560	
Thelma B. Johnson Early Learning Center Replace (2) missing sprinkler wrenches on sprinkler system.	Parts	No Bid			No Bid	2 Wrenches \$161.50	No Bid
	Labor		\$70.00				
	Total		\$50.00			0	
Spottsville Elementary School Replace (2) out-of-date gauges and preform internal inspection on sprinkler system.	Parts	No Bid			No Bid	2 Guages \$74.80	No Bid
	Labor		\$120.00				
	Total		\$50.00			\$161.50	
Grand Total	Parts	No Bid			No Bid		No Bid
	Labor		\$4,705.00				
	Total		\$2,305.00	\$2,400.00		\$794.80	
Combined Grand Total			\$4,705.00	\$2,400.00		\$6,550.09	