FUEL BID TABULATION 2014-2016

Daily Avg Pr
Rack Total Bid Markup/F Annual Est Fixed Total Bid  Annual Est  7/1/12 -
Vendor Price  Appl Tax Markup Freight Price reight Cost Price Appl Tax  Freight Price Cost Current  Annual Est Cost
4/3/2014
Diesel 148,000 Gal 148,000 Gal
Newcomb Oil No Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
D &R QOil Co 3.2735 0.2739 0.0010 0.0250 3.5734 0.0260 $528,863.20  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Key Oil Co 3.2735 0.2739 0.0000 0.0125 3.5599 0.0125 $526,865.20  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Petroleum Traders Corp 3.2735 0.2739 -0.0046 0.0271  3.5699 0.0225 $528,345.20 $3.0230 0.2739 0.0271 3.3240 $491,952.00  $3.4645 $512,746.00
Rogers Petroleum 3.2735 0.2739 0.0000 0.0325 3.5799 0.0325 $529,825.20  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Gas 87 11,000 Gal 11,000 Gal
Newcomb Oil No Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
D &R QOil Co 3.2355 0.3037 0.0010 0.0230 3.5632 0.0240  $39,195.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Key Oil Co 3.2355 0.3037 0.0000 0.0800 3.6192 0.08 $39,811.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Petroleum Traders Corp 3.2355 0.3037 0.0119 0.0234 3.5745 0.0353  $39,319.50  $2.735 0.3037 0.0234 3.0621 $33,683.10  $3.2199 $35,418.90
Rogers Petroleum 3.2355 0.3037 0.0000 0.0325 3.5717 0.0325  $39,288.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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