TO:

Members of the Hardin County Board of Education

FROM:

Janey Thornton, Child Nutrition Director

SUBJECT:
FS-384   Milk Bid

This is a decision paper
ISSUE:

We bid dairy products for school food service annually

FACTS:

We sent out bid requests to eight different vendors.  We only received bids from four companies.

DISCUSSION:
Our recommendations are shown by “**” beside recommended vendor. 

RECOMMENDED MOTION:
I move that we approve the Milk Bid from Prairie Farms (Firm Price) as recommended. 





Effective July 1, 2007 through June 30, 2008

	2007-08 MILK BID WORKSHEET
	
	
	
	
	

	 
	Goldenrod
	Southern Belle without coolers
	Dean Milk 
	Prairie Farms - FIRM Price
	Prairie Farms  - ESC/DESC
	Flav-O Rich
	Southern Foods
	Haywood Dairy

	Items
	 
	 
	 
	
	
	
	
	

	1/2 pint CARTON 1% lowfat white milk.  Vitamin A & D added
	.185
	.1795
	.188
	.179
	.172
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	1/2 pint CARTON 1% lowfat chocolate milk.  Vitamin A and D added.
	.185
	.1921
	.188
	.178
	.172
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	1/2 pint CARTON skim white milk
	.185
	.1765
	.188
	.178
	.172
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	1/2 pint CARTON 1% strawberry milk
	.185-FatFree
	.1991
	.194
	.178
	.172
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	1/2 pint PLASTIC BOTTLE 1% lowfat white milk.  Vitamin A and D added
	.245
	.2609
	.30
	.248
	.242
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	1/2 pint PLASTIC BOTTLE 1% lowfat chocolate milk.  Vitamin A and D added
	.245
	.2721
	.30
	.248
	.242
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	1/2 pint PLASTIC BOTTLE Skim White Milk
	n/a
	n/a
	n/a
	.248
	.242
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	1/2 pint PLASTIC BOTTLE 1% strawberry milk
	.249
	.2791
	.30
	.248
	.242
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	Cottage Cheese, low fat, 5# container
	5.15
	5.50
	5.50
	5.95
	5.95
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	1/2 pint Lactose-Free milk
	n/a
	n/a
	.60
	.325
	.325
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	Sour Cream, low-fat, 5# container
	5.00
	4.95
	5.00
	5.75
	5.75
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	Sour Cream, individual, 200 ct
	19.50
	10.50/100 ct
	n/a
	19.32
	19.32
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	Buttermilk, 1/2 gallon
	1.40
	1.4367 FatFree
	1.75
	1.39
	1.39
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	2% White Milk, GALLON
	2.75
	2.6963
	2.70
	2.79
	2.79
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	Whole Milk, GALLON
	2.95
	2.8220
	2.90
	2.89
	2.89
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	Yogurt, FAT FREE, 8 oz, assorted flavors
	.52 Low-Fat
	.6800, 6 oz. LITE
	n/a
	.44
	.44
	No Bid
	No Bid
	No Bid

	 
	 
	 
	 
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	 Southern Belle submitted a Milk Escalator/De-Escalator Pricing Clause 
	
	 Prairie Farms submitted an announcement of advanced class prices and pricing factors 
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	


