

Henderson County Schools

1805 Second Street, Henderson, Kentucky 42420
(270) 831-5000 Fax: (270) 831-5009
www.henderson.kyschools.us



To: Dr. Thomas Richey, Superintendent
And School Board Members

From: Walt Spencer, CPA
Director of Finance

A handwritten signature in blue ink, which appears to read "Walt Spencer", is written over the printed name and title of the sender.

Date: January 21, 2014

Re: Bid Recommendations

Bid Recommendations

Athletic Equipment # 1-14-5-1

Invitations were sent to 37 vendors. Bids were received from 20 of the 37 vendors. We recommend awarding the bid to multiple vendors as allowed under model procurement. Many focus on different athletic programs and offer different selections for the various sports. By making multiple awards, this will allow the athletic director and team coaches the best purchase decision based on their specific needs at the start of their season. The individual bid discounts or prices are shown on the attached bid tabulation sheets.

Printing # 2-14-5-1

Invitations were sent to ABBA Promotions, Alpha Graphics, Greenwell Chisholm, Office Depot, RR Donnelley, and Sprint Print. Bids varied for all line items. Multiple awards are allowable under the Model Procurement regulations. We recommend awarding this contract to the company with the lowest evaluated price per line item. The lowest price is highlighted on the bid tabulation sheets enclosed.

ATHLETIC SUPPLIES BID #1-14-5-1

CATALOG IN STORE DISCOUNT TABULATION - Part A

Purchases can be made from highlighted vendors only.

General Supplies	Aluminum Athletic	Aluminum Athletic	Brant Williams Golf Shop	BSN Sports Dallas	BSN Sports	Color Connections	Dick's Sporting Goods	Dive Quarters	Ellie Screen Printing	Bill Heath Family Sports	Fandstand Prints	Golf Plus	GTM Sportswear	High Performance Training	Municipal	IRC Team Sports	Just For Kix
	Catlin Store	Catlin Store	Catlin Store	Catlin Store	Catlin Store	Catlin Store	Catlin Store	Catlin Store	Catlin Store	Catlin Store	Catlin Store	Catlin Store	Catlin Store	Catlin Store	Catlin Store	Catlin Store	Catlin Store
BASEBALL	18%	18%		10%									0%				
BASKETBALL				10%									0%				
CHEERLEADING				10%									0%				
CROSS COUNTRY			30-50%	10%									0%				
DANCE				10%									0%				
FOOTBALL	18%	18%		10%									0%				
GOLF			30-50%	10%									0%				
SOCCER	18%	18%		10%									0%				
SOFTBALL				10%				35%					0%				
SWIMMING				10%									0%				
TENNIS				10%									0%				
TRACK	18%	18%		10%									0%				
VOLLEYBALL				10%									0%				
WEIGHTS, CONDITIONING, & TRAINING EQUIPMENT				10%									0%				
WRESTLING				10%									0%				
Other (List)	18%	18%		10%									0%				
Exclusions on Discount				On file in Finance Office													
Shipping																	
Exclusions to Free Shipping																	
Have published catalog																	
Contact	Thomas Syron	Thomas Syron	Brant Williams	John Stafford	Yes			Joe Daring	Chris Hartman	Bill Heath			Heather Widler			Yes	Kevin Lindley
Address	1000 Enterprise Drive Royersford, PA 19468	1001 Enterprise Drive Royersford, PA 19468	1030 Country Club Drive Henderson, KY 42420	PO Box 7725 Dallas, TX 75209-0726				1725 Laskin Rd Hilltop Beach, VA 23454	1026 3rd Street Henderson, KY 42420	514 Tenth Street Henderson, KY 4420			520 McCall Rd Manhattan, KS 66502			8249 Dean Road Indianapolis, IN 46240	
Phone	800-523-5471 Ext 109	800-523-5471 Ext 109	270-927-3444	800-527-7510				757-422-3483	270-827-8061	270-826-4300			800-326-4485			866-486-1762	
Fax	610-825-2378	610-825-2379	270-927-3760	800-365-7653				757-425-6748	270-827-8069	270-826-4300			866-916-4270			317-842-5621	
E-mail	tom.syron@mvalsworld.com	tom.syron@mvalsworld.com	brantwilliams@gmail.com					info@divequarters.com	chrisella12@yahoo.com	billfamilyradio@hotmail.com						salas@circlemoorts.com	

Legends	M & M Creations	Mercury Sports	MPAC, LLC	MOJO Sports	Omni Cheer	Players Club	Power Systems, Inc.	Riddell	Roger's Athletic Company	School Specialty	Skeeter Kell	Spectrum Athletics LLC	EuroSport/Soccer.com/Sports Endeavors	Sports Warehouse
Catlin Store	Catlin Store	Catlin Store	Catlin Store	Catlin Store	Catlin Store	Catlin Store		Catlin Store	Catlin Store	Catlin Store	Catlin Store	Catlin Store	Catlin Store	Catlin Store
General Supplies			10%	32%			10-25%	15%			30%			
BASEBALL				32%			10-25%	15%			30%			
BASKETBALL				32%			10-25%	15%			35%	12%		
CHEERLEADING				32%			10-25%	15%			No Bid			
CROSS COUNTRY			10%	32%			10-25%	15%			35%	12%		
DANCE				32%			10-25%	15%			No Bid			
FOOTBALL				32%			10-25%	15%	5%		No Bid	12%		
GOLF				32%			10-25%	15%			No Bid			
SOCCER				32%			10-25%	15%			35%	12%		
SOFTBALL				32%			10-25%	15%			30%			
SWIMMING				32%			10-25%	15%			30%			
TENNIS				32%			10-25%	15%			30%			
TRACK			10%	32%			10-25%	15%			30%	12%		
VOLLEYBALL				32%			10-25%	15%			30%	12%		
WEIGHTS, CONDITIONING, & TRAINING EQUIPMENT							10-25%	15%			No Bid			
WRESTLING			10%	32%			10-25%	15%			No Bid			
Other (List)				32%			10-25%	15%			No Bid			
Exclusions on Discount								Catalog percentage discount does not apply to football equipment, soccer balls, pads & all outside vendor products. Contact sales rep for pricing on these items.						
Shipping			Free	In Stock - Free Shipping			Based on weight	Yes	12% of order		3%	Shipping based on weight of item	5.5% of order	
Exclusions to Free Shipping				Quote if not in stock			Yes	Yes	Yes		No		Yes	
Have published catalog			Yes	Yes			Yes	Yes	Nathan Yehouse		J.P. Cummings	Derek Pahl	M. W. Kelso	
Contact			Rachel Amoral	Michael Vick			Daniel Wells							
Address			PO Box 8030 Cranston, RI 02920	PO Box 1172 Henderson, KY 42429			5700 Casey Drive Knoxville, TN 37909	669 Sugar Lane Elyria, OH 44035-6309	1156 Four Star Drive Mount Joy, PA 17552		1300 Industrial Drive Kennett, MO 63857	PO Box 238 Gilberdsville, KY 42044	431 US Hwy 70-A East Hickory, NC 27278	
Phone			800-556-7464	270-631-0520			865-862-7866	440-366-0041	800-248-0270		270-860-1544	270-873-3660	800-997-8326	
Fax			800-682-6950	270-631-0521			865-671-1450	440-366-0041	888-549-9659		573-888-6679	866-205-3339	800-443-8326	
E-mail			mlal@mlac.com	michael@mojosports.com					nathan@rogersathletic.com		jcummings1989@gmail.com	dpahl@spectrumathletics.com		

General Supplies	Spottsville Monsters	Studio 421	Swinville USA	The Graphic Edge	Tri-State Trophies	Trophy House	Varsity
	Catlin Store	Catlin Store	Catlin Store	Catlin Store	Catlin Store	Catlin Store	Catlin Store
							5%
BASEBALL							5%
BASKETBALL							5%
CHEERLEADING							5%
CROSS COUNTRY							5%
DANCE							5%
FOOTBALL							5%
GOLF							5%
SOCCER							5%
SOFTBALL							5%
SWIMMING			25%				5%
TENNIS							5%
TRACK							5%
VOLLEYBALL							5%
WEIGHTS, CONDITIONING, & TRAINING EQUIPMENT							5%
WRESTLING							5%
Other (List)							All packages priced items & exclusive shoes. All excluded items will receive free shipping only.
Exclusions on Discount							Free
Shipping							Yes
Exclusions to Free Shipping							Cathy Ray
Have published catalog							6745 Lenox Center Ct Ste 300 Memphis, TN 39115
Contact			Ann Ruble				800-533-6022 Ext 5927
Address			11800 Shelbyville Rd Louisville, KY 40243				
Phone			502-245-9811				
Fax			502-244-6179				
E-mail			anna@swinvilleusa.com				

HENDERSON COUNTY SCHOOLS
ATHLETIC SUPPLIES BID TABULATION - Bid #14-5-1

Part B

VENDOR		Aluminum Athletic	Brant Williams Golf Shop	BSN Sports Dallas	BSN Sports	Order Cancellations	Dist's Sporting Goods	Dive Quarters	Elite Screen Printing	Bill Heath's Family Sports	Fandstand Prints	Golf Plus	GTM Sportswear	High Performance Training	Henderson Municipal Golf Course	IRC Team Sports	Just For Kix	Legends
BASEBALLS																		
Unit Price Unit Price																		
1	Game Baseballs, Rawlings R100 KHSAA Approved	Dozen		\$77.98						\$65.46								
2	Baseballs, Worth Brand	Dozen								\$43.18								
BASKETBALLS																		
3	Basketball, Boys Game Ball, Wide Seams, Rawlings KHSAA Approved	Each								\$47.40								
4	Basketball, Girls Leather Game Ball, Wide Seams, Rawlings KHSAA Approved	Each								\$47.40								
FOOTBALLS																		
5	Footballs, Leather, Rawlings ST Pro	Each		\$47.98						\$63.66								
6	Footballs, Leathers, Rawlings ST 5	Each		\$42.98						\$61.14								
7	School	Each																
SOCCER BALL																		
8	Ball, Game, KHSAA Approved	Each																
SOFTBALLS																		
9	Balls, Game, KHSAA Approved, 12" Optic Yellow, Leather Cover, Wilson A9011SST or KHSAA Approved	Dozen		\$75.98						\$61.14								
VOLLEYBALLS																		
10	Balls, Game, Leather, 16-Panel, KHSAA Approved, Rawlings	Each																
TENNIS BALLS																		
11	Wilson or Penn Dunlop Grand Prix	Dozen		\$13.16														
	Penn Championship	Case/24 Cans																
	Wilson Championship	Case/24 Cans																
	Wilson U.S. Open	Case/24 Cans																
												Free shipping with purchase of 6 or more cases.						
												\$71.76						
												\$62.16						
												\$66.96						
												\$71.76						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						
												No Bid						

[illegible]

PART C Tabulation - Percent Discount

Capezio/Bloch/Gotta
Flurt

HENDERSON COUN
BID #1-14-5-1 ATHLE
PART C Tabulation.

[illegible]

HENDERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
1805 Second Street
Henderson, Kentucky 42420

PRINTING BID TABULATION Bid # 2-14-5-1

LINE ITEM PURCHASES CAN BE MADE FROM THE HIGHLIGHTED COMPANIES ONLY.

February 1, 2014 Through January 31, 2015

COMPANY	ABBA Promotions	Alpha Graphics	Greenwell Chisholm	OFFICE DEPOT	RR Donnelley Printing	SPRINT PRINT
SECTION I - GENERAL 8.5 x 11						
1. Digital Format, paginated, Adobe In Design CS3 60# white offset, printed one side black ink						
Per 500		\$53.04	\$70.96	\$10.00	\$34.74	\$50.00
Per 1000		\$84.21	\$94.30	\$20.00	\$50.53	\$66.00
Per 5000		\$236.98	\$170.38	\$100.00	\$167.37	\$165.00
2. Digital Format, 60# white offset, printed 2 sides, 1 PMS colored ink						
Per 500		\$120.56	\$113.86	\$96.83	\$50.30	\$100.00
Per 1000		\$146.02	\$119.22	\$113.20	\$82.11	\$125.00
Per 5000		\$321.54	\$208.01	\$276.00	\$209.48	\$285.00
SECTION II - CARBONLESS FORMS (NCR)						
black ink, paginated, digital						
1. 8 1/2" X 11", 2 part, print 1 side: <i>Transfer/Withdrawal Form</i> (Int.), School P.O. forms, Parent/Teacher Conf., Immunization, Records Request, Pre-Trip Daily Use						
Per 1000		\$309.87	\$138.50	\$100.00	\$126.44	\$152.00
Per additional 1000		\$703.80	\$63.67	\$100.00	\$107.37	\$110.00
2. 8 1/2" x 11", 2 part, printed 2 sides: Pre-Trip for Field Trips						
Per 1000		\$360.93	\$170.57	\$120.00	\$136.97	\$200.00
Per additional 1000		\$119.94	\$42.19	\$60.00	\$70.53	\$182.00
3. 8.5" X 5.5", 2 part, printed one side						
Per 500		\$143.10	\$108.17	\$25.35	\$56.97	\$109.00

COMPANY	ABBA Promotions	Alpha Graphics	Greenwell Chisholm	OFFICE DEPOT	RR Donnelley Printing	SPRINT PRINT
Per 1,000		\$212.62	\$138.59	\$50.70	\$96.84	\$60.00
4. 8 1/2" x 11", 3 part, printed 1 side: Classified Evaluation Forms						
Per 5000						
Per 10,000		\$1,343.43	\$692.77	\$750.00	\$767.37	\$695.00
5. 8 1/2" x 11", 4 part , printed one side, black: Discipline Notice, Prof. Dev. Request		\$2,600.94	\$1,264.46	\$1,500.00	\$1,490.53	\$1,325.00
Per 5,000						
Per 10,000		\$1,804.90	\$1,070.40	\$1,250.00	\$962.00	\$1,250.00
6. 8 1/2" x 11", 4 part, printed blue & red one side, crashed numbered, same copy throughout. <i>Board Purchase Orders</i>		\$3,549.72	\$1,960.26	\$2,500.00	\$1,883.00	\$2,000.00
Per 5000						
Per additional 1000		\$1,998.24	\$1,232.65	\$1,312.36	\$1,016.00	\$1,500.00
		\$368.76	\$215.92	\$2,392.43	\$208.00	\$2,495.00
SECTION III - LETTERHEAD						
1. 8 1/2" X 11" letterhead, black ink, 24# white Capitol bond, copy ready.						
Per 500		\$112.66	\$78.26	\$73.40	\$70.10	\$45.00
Per 1000		\$151.88	\$109.63	\$127.00	\$88.66	\$70.00
Per additional 1000		\$80.01	\$30.55	\$207.91 Per 2,000	\$83.51	\$70.00
2. 8 1/2" x 11" Burgundy Screen Print on Letterhead, paper provided						
Per 5000		\$234.34	No Bid	\$529.80	No Bid	\$125.00
3. 8 1/2" x 11" 3 color, 24" white Capitol bond						
Per 5000		\$654.07	\$369.49	\$529.80	\$364.95	\$350.00
Per additional 1000		\$89.42	\$34.73	\$105.96	\$72.17	\$60.00
SECTION IV - ENVELOPES						
1. 9" x 12" Catalog open end, white wove, print one side, black ink						
Per 5000		\$755.47	\$489.26	\$565.79	No Bid	\$636.00

COMPANY	ABBA Promotions	Alpha Graphics	Greenwell Chisholm	OFFICE DEPOT	RR Donnelley Printing	SPRINT PRINT
Per add. 1000		\$127.82	\$79.09	\$113.16		\$150.00
2. Size #10, (9 1/2" x 4 1/2") white wove, blk. Ink						
Per 1000		\$160.87	\$101.50	\$57.40		\$85.00
Per 5000		\$397.36	\$192.39	\$187.79	No Bid	\$250.00
Per add. 1000		\$62.71	\$23.48	\$37.56		\$50.00
Window Per 1000			\$106.30			
Window pPer 5000			\$213.97			
Window Per add. 1000			\$27.70			
3. Size #9 Window Envelope (3 7/8" x 8 7/8") white, blk. Ink Security for checks						
Per 5000		\$466.52	\$225.08	\$243.86		\$240.00
Per 10,000		\$854.36	\$376.84	\$454.40	No Bid	\$450.00
SECTION V - CARDS						
Based on no heavy coverage or bleeds						
1. Employee Emergency Card - 3" x 5" card, 70# yellow index, printed 2 sides, black ink.						
Per 1000		\$80.86	\$92.68	\$49.54	\$48.00	\$65.00
Per add. 1000		\$38.75	\$31.62	No Bid	\$48.00	\$25.00
Per 2500				\$75.29		
Per 5000				\$116.64		
2. Paneled Note Cards - 7 x 4 7/8" flat, scored, white paginated, 3 color ink on <u>one side</u> . Matching envelope with no printing.		250 Minimum Envelopes Included				
Per 100		\$375.00	\$158.21	\$126.37	\$54.64	No Bid
Per 500		\$447.00	\$180.03	\$167.10	\$222.68	No Bid
Matching Envelope With No Printing			\$33.09	\$50.43	\$39.18	No Bid
Paneled Note Cards- Card Size: 4.25" x 5.5", 65#, 100#, or 140# paper- Printed <u>two sides</u> .		250 Minimum Envelopes Included				
Per 100		\$464.00	\$171.57	\$140.09	\$67.01	No Bid
Per 500		\$544.00	\$200.87	\$180.81	\$255.67	No Bid
3. Business Cards - 80# white cover stock						
1 color / BK Per 250		\$42.34	\$66.89	\$40.50	\$19.59	\$25.00

COMPANY	ABBA Promotions	Alpha Graphics	Greenwell Chisholm	OFFICE DEPOT	RR Donnelley Printing	SPRINT PRINT
1 color/ BK Per 500		\$44.24	\$68.27	\$47.86	\$25.77	\$35.00
3 color Logo / Per 250		\$52.60	\$70.71	\$131.93	\$32.99	\$35.00
3 color Logo / Per 500		\$63.82	\$74.03	\$138.21	\$35.06	\$45.00
				Using 3 PMS Colors		
4. Athletic Cards/Pass for HCHS - white 65# cover, 1 PMS, printed 1 side 2 1/4" x 4"						
Per 1000		\$110.10	\$130.98	\$29.45	\$59.79	\$60.00
Per 2500		\$218.21	\$137.62	\$73.52	\$127.84	\$100.00
5. 8.5" x 11" Transportation Emergency Card: 14 point white cover, 4 up on sheet, full color, printed 2 sides, perforated, hole punched						
Per 1,000		\$793.64	\$241.70	\$417.96	\$256.70	No Bid
Per 2,500		\$1,379.84	\$407.03	\$754.61	\$564.95	No Bid
Per additional 1,000		\$472.73	\$121.76	No Bid	\$206.43	No Bid
				\$1056.50 Per 5000		
SECTION VI - FOLDERS						
1. Recruitment Folders 9" x 12", 100# Gloss Cover						
Per 1000		\$2,512.64	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,033.00	\$1,000.00
Per additional 1000		\$670.47			\$671.18	\$500.00
2. Employee Recruitment Packet Inserts staggered fold; stapled, 16 pgs.; art provided						
Per 500		\$2,649.87	\$1,265.15			
Per 1000		\$5,230.50	\$1,395.58	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3. Permanent Record Form (18" x 11 1/2")						
Per 1000					\$1,077.03	\$526.61
Per additional 1000					\$554.41	\$526.61
4. Writing Folder (Elementary) Red						
Per 1000					\$889.22	\$526.61

COMPANY	ABBA Promotions	Alpha Graphics	Greenwell Chisholm	OFFICE DEPOT	RR Donnelley Printing	SPRINT PRINT
Per additional 1000					\$402.06	\$526.61
5. Writing Folder (Middle and High School) Manila						
Per 1000						
Per additional 1000		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$778.81 \$256.25	\$526.61 \$526.61
SECTION VII - BOOKLETS/BROCHURES						
1. School Brochures HCS Global Learning Begins Here						
Per 500		\$2,324.95	\$1,932.87	\$3,652.00	\$972.17	\$5,650.00
Per 1000		\$4,278.88	\$2,538.38	\$7,304.00	\$1,763.89	\$6,150.00
				Digital		
2. HCHS/CTE Course Catalog						
Per 3000		\$12,406.32	\$7,441.73	\$6303.76 Per 2500 ***	No Bid	\$6,750.00
Per 5000		\$15,053.13	\$8,928.26	No Bid		\$9,500.00
3. Parent's Guide to MAP						
Per 5,000		\$586.74	\$590.87	\$503.14	\$839.18	\$600.00
4. Academic Success Timeline						
Per 1000		\$420.54	\$424.42	\$426.04	\$342.27	\$350.00
Per 5000		\$860.30	\$729.92	\$688.86	\$1,583.51	\$950.00
5. Commencement Programs						
Per 7500		\$1,061.87	\$484.21	\$819.60	\$643.30	\$675.00
Cost for 3 hrs. typesetting		\$180.00	\$120.00	\$125.00	\$195.00	\$65.00
6. CTE Brochures						
Per 1,000		\$325.23	\$455.54	\$260.00	\$197.94	\$175.00
Per additional 1,000		\$92.65	\$22.88	No Bid	\$197.94	\$175.00
				\$386.43 Per 2500		
				\$503.14 Per 5000		
7. Parents' Guide to Middle School Booklet						
Per 2,500		\$2,035.50	\$1,874.75	\$1,693.50	\$3,903.09	\$2,573.00
Per additional 1,000		\$437.90	\$285.64	No Bid	\$1,558.76	\$1,250.00
						Plus Mail Service

COMPANY	ABBA Promotions	Alpha Graphics	Greenwell Chisholm	OFFICE DEPOT	RR Donnelley Printing	SPRINT PRINT
8. Henderson County Schools Calendar/Handbook						
Per 1,000		\$1,001.85	\$798.22	\$692.67	\$952.58	\$1,550.00
Per additional 1,000		\$561.29	\$258.00	No Bid	\$849.49	\$1,350.00
				\$1453.93 Per 2500		
				\$2636.86 Per 5000		
9. Classroom Emergency Procedures Guide Flip Chart						
Per 1,000		\$5,406.06	\$2,328.40	No Bid	\$3,261.86	No Bid
Per additional 1,000		\$2,746.48	\$1,148.85		\$3,261.86	
10. 8 1/2" x 5 1/2" K-PREP Booklet						
Per 1,000		\$1,315.72	\$1,196.94	\$1,596.84	\$890.72	No Bid
Per additional 1,000		\$517.24	\$148.50	No Bid	\$890.72	
<u>SECTION VIII - Certificates</u>						
1. 8.5 x 11", 60# parchment paper, 2 color, 1 color border w/ black text; Sundance felt						
Per 100		\$69.55	\$73.24	\$80.99	\$95.88	\$50.00
Per 500		\$187.35	\$128.42	\$110.43	\$107.22	\$125.00
Per 1000		\$326.21	\$196.90	\$153.34	\$130.93	\$180.00
<u>SECTION IX - MISCELLANEOUS</u>						
1. Note Pads - padded in 50, black ink, 4 1/4" x 5 1/2"						
Per 500		\$322.99	\$227.69	\$250.00	\$262.89	\$275.00
Per 1000		\$550.43	\$362.39	\$500.00	\$474.23	\$475.00
2. Note Pads - 2 3/4" x 5 1/2" Printed one side, padded in 50						
Per 500 pads		\$255.98	\$214.04	\$208.34	\$221.65	\$360.00
Per 1,000 pads		\$419.22	\$337.37	\$416.68	\$410.31	\$600.00
3. Parent Packet Material 8 1/2" x 11" color paper black ink printed one side						
Per 5,000		\$247.31	\$171.44	\$237.43	\$203.09	No Bid
Per additional 1,000		\$30.53	\$18.94	No Bid	\$40.21	

COMPANY	ABBA Promotions	Alpha Graphics	Greenwell Chisholm	OFFICE DEPOT	RR Donnelley Printing	SPRINT PRINT
3a. 8 1/2" x 11" color paper black ink printed two side						
Per 1,000		\$123.81	\$204.62	\$74.19	\$50.52	
Per additional 1,000		\$45.15	\$22.80	No Bid	\$50.52	No Bid
Collated per 1,000		\$35.00	\$14.00	No Bid	\$22.68	
				\$142.04 Per 2500		
				\$271.64 per 5000		
4. Bookmarks - 8 1/2 x 2 1/2"						
Per 1000		\$181.57	\$155.53	\$67.66	\$63.92	No Bid
Per add. 1000		\$137.15	\$65.83	No Bid	\$63.92	
				\$163.93 Per 2500		
				\$185.93 Per 5000		
5. Desk Calendars- 17" x 22"						
Per 500		No Bid	\$872.87	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,527.44
Per 1000			\$73.77			\$1,378.84
6. Henderson County Schools Mission/Vision Poster						
Per 100		No Bid	\$450.95	\$769.29 Per 250	No Bid 250 Minimum	\$354.50
Per 500			\$497.87	\$803.57	\$308.49	\$450.00
7. Yard Signs- 18" x 24"						
Per 1000 (2-sided)		\$12,173.25	\$5387.50 Plus Shipping	\$9,985.71	No Bid	\$3,000.00
Per 1000 (one sided)						

Final Proofs Must Be Approved By Publications team at Board of Education

Date Sample Packet Picked Up At Board Office						
--	--	--	--	--	--	--

COMPANY	ABBA Promotions	Alpha Graphics	Greenwell Chisholm	OFFICE DEPOT	RR Donnelley Printing	SPRINT PRINT
Contact					Debra Wilczak or Michael Hackbush	
Address	Ty Rideout 228 Second Street Henderson, KY 42420	Rita Joest 6220 Vogel Road Evansville, IN 47715	Sam Wolfe 420 E Parrish Ave Owensboro, KY 42303	Terri Crawford 972 Oakwood Lane Litchfield, KY 42754	300 Lang Blvd Grand Island, NY 14072	23 Dulin Street Madisonville, KY 42431
Phone Number	270-8267-5577	812-471-7100	800-684-3267 270-684-3267	270-287-7998	800-280-4520 Ext 2757 or 800-280-4520 Ext 2738	270-825-3376
Fax Number	270-827-0777	812-471-1895	270-686-19*28		800-773-1430	270-825-9415

Daigle
requested this
quoted with
some
curriculum
materials. If
Books are
purchased
with
curriculum,
their price is