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SPENCER COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS

Board of Education Agenda Item

Item #  ____________________________
Meeting Date:  October 28, 2013
Topic/Title:  Request to Approve Copier Lease Vendor
Presenter:  Brett Beaverson
Origin


Topic presented for information only (no board action required).

Action requested at this meeting.


Item is on the consent agenda for approval.


Action requested at future meeting, ___________________ (date).


Board review required by –


  
State or federal law or regulation


  
Board of Education policy


  
Other  ___________________________________________

Previous Review, Discussion or Action


No previous Board review, discussion or action


Previous review or action

Date: 

Action:


Background/Summary of Information
On 10/23/13 a copier bid opening took place involving three participating vendors. After careful analysis involving the finance officer, Commonwealth Technology, Inc. is the recommended vendor for a 36 month lease for Level 1, Level 2, and Level 3 copiers.

The bid specifications for each level are:
	Level 1 (minimal standard)

· 20-34 copies per minute

· Document Feeder

· Duplex

· Finisher with stapling

· Scanning and email

· Stand

· Print Controller – network enabled
	Level 2 (minimal standard)

· 35-54 copies per minute

· Document feeder

· Duplex

· Finisher with stapling

· Scanning and email

· Stand Print Controller – network enabled
	Level 3 (minimal standard)

· 55-70 copies per minute

· Document Feeder

· Duplex

· Finisher with stapling

· Scanning and email

· Stand Print Controller – network enabled




Additional options not listed on the bid are:
	Kyocera 6525

Paper Cassette - $23.00 per month

Hole Punch – not available


	Kyocera 3501i

Paper Cassette - $30.00 per month

Hole Punch - $15.00 per month


	Kyocera 5501i

Paper Cassette - $30 per month

Hole Punch - $15.00 per month




The bid comparison is attached.
Impact on Resources  (REQUIRES FINANCE OFFICER’S INITIALS OF REVIEW)
__vg_  Finance Officer  The bids were competitive between the Lang Co. and Commonwealth Technology.  Applying the current models and usage to the prices quoted, Commonwealth Technology came in slightly lower than the Lang Co.
Timetable for Further Review or Action: N/A
SUPERINTENDENT’S RECOMMENDATION
Recommend approval of Commonwealth Technology for copier services.

[image: image1.emf]Option A - 36 months

Level 1 Lang Canon CW-Kyocera CW-Konica CW-Canon

25 ppm, scan 10-40  $924.84 n/a $1,020.00 n/a n/a

25 ppm, scan 25-35 n/a $1,014.48 n/a n/a n/a

22 ppm, scan 42-70 n/a n/a n/a $1,068.00 n/a

Level 2

35 ppm, scan 80-160 color  $1,570.56 n/a $1,236.00 n/a n/a

35 ppm, scan 25-35 n/a $1,463.64 n/a n/a n/a

28 ppm, scan 42-70 n/a n/a n/a $1,356.00 n/a

35 ppm, scan optional n/a n/a n/a n/a $1,152.00

45 ppm, scan 80-160 color $1,699.68 n/a n/a n/a n/a

Level 3

55 ppm, scan 80-160 color $1,873.32 n/a $1,536.00 n/a n/a

55 ppm, scan 100-200 n/a $3,241.80 n/a n/a n/a

55 ppm, scan up to 160 n/a n/a n/a $2,436.00 n/a

55 ppm, scan up to 200 n/a n/a n/a n/a $3,024.00

65 ppm, scan 70-160 color $3,039.24 n/a n/a n/a n/a

per copy charge $0.0044 $0.0057 $0.0048 $0.0048 $0.0048

based on py  5,200,708 $22,883.12$29,644.04 $24,963.40 $24,963.40 $24,963.40

Option B - Purchase

3 year lease  - 25 ppm $2,774.52 $3,043.44 $3,060.00 $3,204.00 $0.00

purchase $2,728.06 $2,875.50 $2,811.00 $2,967.00 $0.00

Savings $46.46 $167.94 $249.00 $237.00 $0.00

3 year lease - 35 ppm $4,711.68 $4,390.92 $3,708.00 $4,068.00 $3,456.00

purchase $4,632.89 $4,148.50 $3,417.00 $3,780.00 $3,197.00

Savings $78.79 $242.42 $291.00 $288.00 $259.00

3 year lease - 45 ppm $5,099.04

purchase $5,013.80

Savings $85.24

3 year lease - 55 ppm $5,619.96 $9,725.40 $4,608.00 $7,308.00 $9,072.00

purchase $5,526.06 $9,188.93 $4,283.00 $6,793.00 $8,439.00

Savings $93.90 $536.47 $325.00 $515.00 $633.00

3 year lease - 65 ppm $9,117.72

purchase $8,965.30

Savings $152.42

per copy charge $0.0044 $0.0057 $0.0048 $0.0048 $0.0048

based on py  5,200,708 $22,883.12$29,644.04 $24,963.40 $24,963.40 $24,963.40

Option C - No Lease/Copy Charges Only

per copy charge only

Level One No Bid  No Bid $0.0323 $0.0336 $0.0358

Level Two $0.01381 No Bid $0.00910 $0.00960 $0.00880

Level Two Add'l Option $0.01239  n/a  n/a  n/a  n/a

Level Three $0.00854 No Bid $0.00830 $0.01030 $0.01160

Level Three Add'l Option $0.01061  n/a  n/a  n/a  n/a

In $$ Amounts (5,200,708)

Level One  (917,659) $29,640.39 $0.00000 $29,640.39 $30,833.34 $32,852.19

Level Two   (389,920) $5,384.80 $0.00000 $3,548.27 $3,743.23 $3,431.30

Level Three   (3,893,129) $33,247.32 $0.00 $32,312.97 $40,099.23 $45,160.30

$68,272.51 $65,501.63

Copier Use Per Building

SCHS $10,610.76 $9,120.00

TES $5,619.96 $4,608.00

Preschool $924.84 $1,020.00

Hillview $924.84 $1,020.00

SCMS $3,723.00 $3,576.00

SCES $3,746.64 $3,072.00

CO $1,873.32 $1,536.00

per copy charges $22,883.12 $24,963.40

Comparison $50,306.48 $48,915.40
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