HARDIN COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION

NANNETTE JOHNSTON, INTERIM SUPERINTENDENT

JANEY THORNTON, DIRECTOR OF CHILD NUTRITION SERVICES

2514 LEITCHFIELD ROAD

ELIZABETHTOWN, KENTUCKY 42701

This is a decision paper
TO:


Members of the Hardin County Board Of Education

FROM:

Nannette Johnston, Interim Superintendent

SUBJECT:

FS-382 Small Equipment Bid

ISSUE:

We bid small equipment items for school food service annually

FACTS:

We sent out bid requests to 23 different vendors.  We received bids from 9 companies.
DISCUSSION:
In comparing these bid prices with those from previous years, the bid prices have changed only slightly.           We feel these prices are fair and competitive.

CONCLUSION:
Our recommendations are shown by “*” beside the desired item.  

RECOMMENDED MOTION:  
I move that  we approve the Small Equipment Bid as recommended.

*Prices are per unit unless otherwise specified.

	
	ITEM
	Hubert
	GFS
	DINE
	BG

CONS.
	BARRET

FISHER
	Clint Chemical
	Rest. Sales
	Kenway
	Weber

	1
	Adaptor Bar (divider) for steam table pans, (Black Cambro H-Pans) 12”.
	3.68
	3.76
	1.06

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	4.95
	1.30
	NO BID
	1.92

	2
	Adaptor Bar (divider) for steam table pans (Black Cambro H-Pans), 20”.
	5.39
	5.51
	1.41

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	3.65
	1.92
	NO BID
	4.56

	3
	Apple Corer
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	4
	Apron, bib, 50% polyester, 50% cotton.  Women’s size 34” side, 36” long.  Stitched Hems.  Price per dozen

SAMPLE REQUIRED
	75.48/ Doz.

NO SAMPLE
	33.12/ Doz.
	22.99/ DOZ.

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	22.40/ DOZ.

NO SAMPLE

	5
	Apron, vinyl, bib apron, tie strings, brown, 26” x 31”.  Price each
	12.77
	10.89
	11.00
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	8.22

*

	6
	Black plastic trays.  Cambro #1418-110ff Size 14 » x 18 » black.  No substitues.
	11.72
	24.69/ DOZ.

*
	2.14
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	3.23
	NO BID
	2.23

	7
	Black steam table pan lids, slotted, quarter size, to fit items #22 & #23.
	7.01
	4.59
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	2.98

*
	NO BID
	5.30

	8
	Black steam table pan lids, slotted, half-size, to fit items #21.
	11.96
	6.02

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	12.16
	NO BID
	9.78

	9
	Black steam table pan lids, slotted, full-size, to fit items #19 & #20.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	10
	Black steam table pan lids, slotted, long half-size, to fit item #24.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	6.63

*
	NO BID
	11.00

	11
	Bowls-Melamine, Carlisle, 46 oz. (preschool) 9” vegetable #ARR240-02, white, priced per dozen.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	12
	Bowls-Melamine, Carlisle, 57 oz. (preschool) 9 ½” vegetable #43739-02, white, priced per dozen.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	13
	Bowl, Mixing, stainless steel.  5-quart capacity.  Price each
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	14
	Brooms, Angle 52” long, 8” wide Angled hood, Polypropylene bristles 4 ½” – 5” long.  Head should not screw off.  SAMPLE REQUIRED
	20.15

No Sample
	8.71

*


	NO BID


	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID


	15.20
	NO BID

	15
	Brush, Steel wire oven and grill

20” long x 2 5/8” wide.  Price each
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	16
	Bun Pan, Aluminum, 13” x 18” x 1”

Price per dozen
	127.32/ Doz.
	121.56/ Doz.
	58.80/ DOZ.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	8.15
	4.20

*
	NO BID
	58.60/ DOZ.

	17
	Bun Pan, Aluminum, 26” x 18” x 1”

Price per dozen
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	18
	Butter Knives.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	19
	CAMBRO Full Size 2 ½” deep H-Pan with Camwear Grip Lid cover using on steam table and in ovens up to 375 F.  NO EQUAL
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	20
	CAMBRO Full Size 4” deep H-Pan with Camwear Grip Lid Cover using on steam table and in ovens up to 375 F.  NO EQUAL
	33.83
	20.91

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	29.29


	NO BID
	24.90

	21
	CAMBRO Half Size 4” deep H-Pan with Camwear Grip Lid Cover using on steam table and in ovens up to 375 F.  NO EQUAL
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	22
	CAMBRO Fourth Size 4” deep H-Pan with Camwear Grip Lid Cover using on steam table and in ovens up to 375 F.  NO EQUAL
	12.41
	7.80

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	10.35
	NO BID
	9.15

	23
	CAMBRO Fourth Size 6” deep H-Pan with Camwear Grip Lid Cover using on steam table and in ovens up to 375 F.  NO EQUAL
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	24
	CAMBRO Half Size Long 4” deep H-Pan with Camwear Grip Lid Cover using on steam table and ovens up to 375 F.  NO EQUAL
	24.47
	15.25-PAN

7.27-LID


	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	20.55


	NO BID
	18.20

*

	25
	Can opener blade for Edlund Electric Single speed to match existing items.
	6.38
	4.41
	4.56
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID


	NO BID
	4.15

*

	26
	Can opener blade for Edlund Model 1
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	27
	Can Opener, electric Edlund, heavy duty, single speed.  Stainless steel housing
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	28
	Can opener, heavy duty, Edlund No. 1.  Comes with table/counter mount.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	29
	Can Punch and Bottle Opener
	4.49
	20.82/ 100 ct
	2.13
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	1.50
	NO BID
	1.45

*

	30
	Cart, Stainless Steel Utility.  3 shelves.  Lakeside 370-019 or equal.  650# load capacity.  Overall dimensions 39x23x37 18 gauge stainless shelves
	953.10
	NO BID
	659.88
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	221.00

Not per spec
	NO BID
	613.00

*

	31
	Colander, hand; 4-quart capacity.

Semi-heavyweight aluminum.  Sanitary edges and riveted handles.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	32
	Condiment Pump - stainless steel.  Pump to fit #10 - Changeable gauging collars to allow for varying portions.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	33
	Corner Pan strainer.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	34
	Crispers - 18” x 12” x 6” deep.  Clear polycarbonate food boxes WITH LIDS to withstand temp. from -50(F to 212(F.  Boxes to nest and cross stack.  Lids to snap-fit or invert NFS approved.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	35
	Crispers - 18” x 26” x 6” deep.  Clear polycarbonate food boxes WITH LIDS to withstand temp. from -50(F to 212(F.  Boxes to nest and cross stack.  Lids to snap-fit or invert NFS approved
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	36
	Cutting boards, assorted colors, approx. 15”x20”x1/2’thick.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	37
	Cutting Board, 15”x20”x1/2”.  USDA materials & FDA regulation compliance.  White non-toxic material; dishwasher safe.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	38
	Dish Racks – Sani stack; polypropylene; all-purpose, posted.

19 3/4”x19 3/4”x4 3/8”
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	39
	Dish Racks – Sani stack; polypropylene; all-purpose, flat tray.  19 ¾”x19 ¾”x4 3/8”.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	40
	Dish Truck -500 pound capacity, all stainless steel.  Overall size 24” x 39 1/2” x 32 1/2”; 8” swivel casters, hinge front and top.  To hold 216 9” plates or 100 standard trays.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	41
	Dispenser, straw, sani Straw Miser.Wood and plastic construction.  Dispenser should be 6 ½” x 7 ¾” long to dispense thin 5 ¾” milk straws.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	15.40

*
	NO BID
	NO BID

	42
	Dispensers, Napkins.heavy gauge stainless steel.  3 3/4”x4”x7 3/8”.
	9.94
	10.57
	4.21
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	3.28
	NO BID
	    3.27

*

	43
	Dolly for garbage can to fit Rubbermaid Brute container – 44 gallon
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	37.38

Not ordering


	NO BID

	44
	Double Boilers, aluminum, heavy duty; 12 quart insert.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	45
	Dough cutter, Stainless Steel Blade 3”x6”.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	46
	Dunnage racks - brown, polyethylene construction.  21”x18”.  4 legs.  Modular design with removable legs.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	47
	Flour sifter.  Body and handle of extra heavy charcoal tin.  Side crank with wood handle.  Well or reinforced wire.  Capacity 3#.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	48
	Food storage container with lid.  Polyethylene, dishwasher safe.  White rectangular shape, 18-quart capacity.  13”hx 14 1/2”l x 6 5/8”w.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	49
	Food storage container with lid.  Polyethylene, dishwasher safe.  White rectangular shape, 18-quart capacity.  13”h x 6 5/8”l x 6 5/8”w.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	50
	Food transporters, insulated.  Holds one 12” x 20” steam table pan up to 4” deep.  Keeps food hot or cold.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	51
	Forks, stainless steel, utility, 7” length, plain design.  1 1/8 pound weigh/dozen.

SAMPLE REQUIRED.  Price by dozen.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	52
	Fry turner, hamburger (serving spatula) Square end turner; walnut handle, 2 steel expansion rivets. 5”w x 4”D
	18.71
	9.11
	1.05

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	1.89
	NO BID
	1.49

	53
	Funnel, wide neck, aluminum.  1-quart capacity.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	54
	Funnel, wide neck, aluminum.  4-quart capacity.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	55
	Garbage can with lid.  Rubbermaid Brute, 20 gallon to match existing items, white.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	5.00

Not ordering
	NO BID

	56
	Garbage can step-on-can.  11 ½” x 14 ½” x 19 ¼”.  Beige
	108.90
	54.89

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	70.00
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	60.90

	57
	Garbage can.  Rubbermaid Brute, 44 gallon to match existing items, #2643 white.
	55.79
	31.40
	43.20
	34.00
	33.02
	29.35

*
	61.08
	36.10
	34.60

	58
	Gloves, cut resistant for cleaning slicers, etc.  Medium size.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	59
	Gloves, cut resistant for cleaning slicers, etc.  Extra Large Size. 
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	60
	Gloves, cut resistant for cleaning slicers, etc.  Large size.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	61
	Gloves, vinyl, textured palms and fingers.  Mat-proof lining.  Resistant to cleaning solutions.  Priced per dozen  SMALL
	NO BID
	5.52/ DOZ.

*


	9.57 DOZ.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	10.60/ DOZ.


	9.20/ DOZ.

	62
	Gloves, vinyl, textured palms and fingers.  Mat-proof lining.  Resistant to cleaning solutions.  Priced per dozen.   MEDIUM
	NO BID
	5.52/ DOZ.

*
	9.57 DOZ.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	10.60/ DOZ.
	9.20/ DOZ.



	63
	Gloves, vinyl, textured palms and fingers.  Mat-proof lining.  Resistant to cleaning solutions.  Priced per dozen.    LARGE
	NO BID
	5.52/ DOZ.

*


	9.57 DOZ.


	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	10.60/ DOZ.
	9.20/ DOZ.

	64
	Grater, heavy duty stainless steel.  4 cutting sides.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	65
	Hot Mitt, 24” long, provides protection up to 450(F.
	16.19
	12.27
	9.80

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	10.20

	66
	Hot Pad Pot Holder.  King size with wrist straps, 8 ½” x 11 ¼”.  Flash-flameproof. Priced EACH.
	20.51
	2.21
	1.50

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	18.50/ DOZ.

	67
	Ingredient bins, hinged lid, white plastic, NFS approved.  3” extra wide swivel casters. Capacity 195 pounds sugar or 140 pounds flour.  21 1/2”w x 23 1/2”d x 24”d.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	68
	Kitchen shaker, aluminum with screw cap.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	69
	Knife sharpener.  Manual.  Precision angle guides.  100% diamond abrasives.  Dishwasher safe.  Right-handed.


	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	70
	Knife, bread, serrated, 10” blade with mirror construction, 3-rivet construction. Rosewood handle.
	19.16
	11.10
	3.68

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	14.30

	71
	Knife, butcher, fultz tang, 3-rivet construction, rosewood handle, 10” blade and mirror finish.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	72
	Knife, paring, sani-safe, rivet less polypropylene handle.  Mirror finish.  Stainless steel blade, hand-honed, 3 1/4” long.

SAMPLE REQUIRED.  Price per dozen
	64.68/ DOZ.
	76.20/ DOZ.
	19.96/ DOZ.

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID


	NO BID
	45.00/ DOZ.

NO SAMPLE

	73
	Kurley Kate Scouring Pad, s/s splinter free, soft rounded edging to prevent scratching.  144/case
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	74
	Ladle 18-8 stainless steel.  2 oz. capacity.  10 1/2” handle length, 3# weight per dozen.  Plain with hooked handle.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	75
	Ladle 18-8 stainless steel.  4 oz. capacity.  10 1/2” handle length, 3# weight per dozen.  Plain with hooked handle.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	76
	Ladle 18-8 stainless steel.  8 oz. capacity.  10 1/2” handle length, 3# weight per dozen.  Plain with hooked handle.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	77
	Ladle, clear Lexan plastic. 1 oz capacity

10 1/2”.  For use with salad bars.  Handle hands on edge of bowl.  Dishwasher safe.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	78
	Laundry Detergent Chlorinated.  Dry powder, low sudsing.  Safe for cotton and polyesters.  BUCKET MUST HAVE HANDLE.  50#/case.  SAMPLE REQUIRED.
	NO BID
	44.01

*


	NO BID


	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	79
	Liquid measure, 1-gallon aluminum with riveted handle.  Calibrated.
	NO BID
	20.98
	7.27
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	6.65

*

	80
	Liquid measure, 1-quart aluminum with riveted handle.  Calibrated.
	NO BID
	13.27
	3.19
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	   3.16

*

	81
	Liquid measure, 2-quart aluminum with riveted handle.  Calibrated.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	82
	Lobby Dust Pan Plastic with Metal Handle.
	24.65
	11.18
	8.00
	8.25
	7.42
	6.60

*
	NO BID
	11.99
	12.12

	83
	Masher-base to be of heavy, retinned steel or stainless steel wire.  Polished natural wood or plastic handle.  22-25” length, 5” x 5” mashing surface.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	2.68

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	3.48

	84
	Measuring cups.  Aluminum, 4 piece

1 cup, 1/2 cup, 1/3 cup, 1/4 cup
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	85
	Measure, Dry 1-gallon aluminum with riveted handle.  Calibrated.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	86
	Measure, Dry, 1-quart aluminum with riveted handle.  Calibrated.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	87
	Measure, Dry, 2-quart aluminum with riveted handle.  Calibrated
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	88
	Measuring spoons.  Aluminum on ring.  4 piece, 1/4 teaspoon, 1/2 teaspoon, 1 teaspoon, 1 tablespoon.
	4.94
	3.95
	2.00
	NO BID
	NO BID
	4.15
	1.70
	NO BID
	.50

*

	89
	Meat Thermometer.  Must be able to calibrate and include tool to re-calibrate.  Dishwasher safe.
	30.95
	NO BID
	13.80

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	90
	Mop Bucket with wringer. – 35 qt with 3” casters, yellow one piece construction, 2 –handle, “Wet Floor” Imprint, mounded-in graduations, interchangeable ball bearing casters.
	    79.19
	42.15


	46.32


	45.60


	   NO BID
	    41.15

         *
	105.00


	55.50
	53.28

	91
	Mop Stick – Rubbermaid H146.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	14.18
	12.10
	12.10
	8.50
	20.01
	6.75

*
	11.60

	92
	Muffin pan.  Aluminum.  24 well with 2 3/4” cups.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	93
	Oven mitts, elbow length.  13” heat resistant.  Price per dozen.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	94
	Paddle-scrapper.  Nylon.  Overall length 40”.  No crevices, seams, or ridges.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	95
	Pail opener.  Opens most 2-5 gallon plastic tubs.  One-piece construction.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	96
	Pan lifters.  Stainless steel.  Fits all full-size pans.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	97
	Pan rack cover.  Double zippered flap for easy access.  Constructed of 20mil reinforced clear vinyl.  Tear and abrasion resistant.  Remains flexible in freezers.  Triple reinforced top corners.
	126.00
	67.74

*
	85.84
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID


	NO BID
	78.00

	98
	Pan rack cover, MESH, double-zipped flap for easy access.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	93.75
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	90.00

*

	99
	Pan racks.  20 shelf, standard 18” x 26” size. High strength, heavy-duty high tensile aluminum.  Angles are welded in place front and back, making sure all cracks sealed.  Welded both horizontally and vertically.  Supporting cross braces has gussets welded into place to prevent “racking”.  Four 5” heavy-duty casters.  Caster plates welded to frame of unit and casters bolted to caster plate (not to frame) with 4 bolts.  5-year guarantee against defects and workmanship.
	416.70
	156.51

Not per spec
	314.00
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	203.00

*


	NO BID
	314.00

	100
	Pastry brush.  3” wide, sterilized bristles, vulcanized in hard rubber.  Bristles to be 2 1/4” long.  Wooden handle.  Overall length 9 ¼”.
	9.62
	4.68
	1.19

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	8.95
	NO BID
	NO BID
	    3.25

	101
	Pie servers.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	102
	Pitcher.  Aluminum, 2-3 quart.  Ice guard, heat resistant handle.  For use with hot or cold beverages.


	NO BID
	NO BID
	53.87

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	103
	Pizza cutter, stainless steel hollow ground, hardened blade.  4” diameter.  Slip-proof wooden handle.
	6.29
	4.13
	3.78
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	2.75
	NO BID
	1.90

*

	104
	Platform truck.  2 in 1 convertible.  To be platform dolly or 2 wheel dolly.  Heavy-duty 1” steel tubing.  Electrically welded and reinforced.  Capacity 400 pounds.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	105
	Rolling Pins - Poly-roll.  Made with extra-tough polyethylene.  Non-porous, non-absorbent & dishwasher safe.  Chip, peel, & crack resistant.  One piece, seamless construction.  Meets FDA requirements.  15” long.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	106
	Rolling Pins - Poly-roll.  Made with extra-tough polyethylene.  Non-porous, non-absorbent & dishwasher safe.  Chip, peel, & crack resistant.  One piece, seamless construction.  Meets FDA requirements.  24” long.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	107
	Rubber floor mat, 3x5, for dish room.  Anti-slip, water & grease resistant and allow for drainage.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	108
	Rubber scrapper, flexible plastic.  Handle 16 ½”.  Priced by dozen.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	109
	Rubber scrapper, flexible plastic.  Handle 9”.  Priced by dozen.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	110
	Salad Crocks - NFS approved plastic.  Thick wall design with tight lids.  Dishwasher safe.  Beige.  1.2 qt.
	6.45
	40.45/ Doz.
	2.93

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	3.54
	NO BID
	NO BID
	4.15

	111
	Salad Crocks - NFS approved plastic.  Thick wall design with tight lids.  Dishwasher safe.  Beige.  1.5 qt.
	9.77
	24.27/

6 ct.
	3.93

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	5.65
	NO BID
	NO BID
	5.11

	112
	Salad Crocks - NFS approved plastic.  Thick wall design with tight lids.  Dishwasher safe.  Beige.  2.7 qt.
	10.53
	28.94/

6 ct.
	4.69

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	6.45
	NO BID
	NO BID
	5.16

	113
	Sandwich spreader, serrated, 3 1/2” stainless steel blade.  Rosewood handle.
	8.63
	3.28
	1.00
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	1.75
	NO BID
	.55

*

	114
	Saucepan, heavy-duty aluminum.  1-quart capacity.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	115
	Saucepan, heavy-duty aluminum.  2-quart capacity.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	116
	Saucepan, heavy-duty aluminum.  6-quart capacity.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	117
	Saucepan, heavy-duty aluminum.  8-quart capacity.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	118
	Scales.  1-25 pound.  Stainless steel case and platform.  Fixed dial.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	119
	Scales.  1-32 ounce.  Electronic digital, stainless steel.  Solid-state electronics.  LED display in ounces or grams.  110 V, AC.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	120
	Scales.  Portion control.  5# capacity.  1/2 oz. graduations.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	121
	Scoop, Ice cream.  Stainless steel.  Size #100.  All 18-8 stainless steel.  Rapid non-fatigue squeeze action.  Suitable for right or left hand use.  Heavy-duty compression ring.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	122
	Scoop, Ice cream.  Stainless steel.  Size #16.  Capacity of 1/4 cup.  All 18-8 stainless steel.  Rapid non-fatigue squeeze action.  Suitable for right or left hand use.  Heavy-duty compression ring.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	123
	Scoop, Ice cream.  Stainless steel.  Size #24. Capacity of 1 1/3 oz.   All 18-8 stainless steel.  Rapid non-fatigue squeeze action.  Suitable for right or left hand use.  Heavy-duty compression ring.
	12.50
	6.26


	6.78


	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	   5.28


	NO BID
	3.57

*

	124
	Scoop, Ice cream.  Stainless steel.  Size #60.    All 18-8 stainless steel.  Rapid non-fatigue squeeze action.  Suitable for right or left hand use.  Heavy-duty compression ring.
	NO BID
	NO BID


	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	125
	Scoop, Ice cream.  Stainless steel.  Size #70.  All 18-8 stainless steel.  Rapid non-fatigue squeeze action.  Suitable for right or left hand use.  Heavy-duty compression ring.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	126
	Scoop, Ice cream.  Stainless steel.  Size 8.  Capacity of 1/2 cup.  All 18-8 stainless steel.  Rapid non-fatigue squeeze action.  Suitable for right or left hand use.  Heavy-duty compression ring.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	127
	Scoop, Ice.  Heavy duty plastic.  NFS approved.  Dishwasher safe.  Made of high impact polyethylene plastic.  Bowl size 5 1/2” wide x 9” long x 3 1/2” deep.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	128
	Scoop, utility.  Clear, 64 oz capacity


	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	129
	Scoop, utility.  Stainless.  Overall length 11 7/8”.  Bowl length 7 7/8”.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	130
	Scoop.  Cast aluminum.  Bowl size 10 1/2” long x 5 1/2” wide.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	131
	Scoop.  Cast aluminum.  Bowl size 7” long x 4” wide.


	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	132
	Scraper, bowl.  Nylon or plastic.  5 7/8” long x 4 5/8” high.  1 piece construction.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	133
	Serrated Butcher Steel - 5/8" diameter, high carbon steel.  Black handle.  14" blade length


	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	134
	Shakers.  Salt & Pepper.  3” high.  2 oz capacity.  Stainless top.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	135
	Silverware cylinder.  White polyethylene.      5 1/2” h x 4 5/8” top diameter.  Capacity 40-45 pieces.

Price by dozen.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	136
	Skimmer, fine mesh
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	137
	Spatula, Stainless Steel.  Wooden handle held by 3 rivets.  Approximately 10” overall.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	1.50

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	2.89
	NO BID
	11.60

	138
	Spatula.  Stainless Steel.  Wooden handle held by 3 rivets.  Approximately 13” overall.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	139
	Spoodles.  Constructed of heavy gauge stainless steel.  Plastic sanitary handles that is heat resistant.

2 ounce perforated, 11 11/16” long.
	8.45
	5.61
	1.74
	NO BID
	NO BID
	4.20
	NO BID


	NO BID
	1.27

*

	140
	Spoodles.  Constructed of heavy gauge stainless steel.  Plastic sanitary handles that is heat resistant.

2 ounce solid.  11 11/16” long
	8.45
	5.61
	1.74
	NO BID
	NO BID
	4.20
	NO BID


	NO BID
	1.27

*

	141
	Spoodles.  Constructed of heavy gauge stainless steel.  Plastic sanitary handles that is heat resistant.

3 ounce perforated.  11 11/16” long
	8.45
	5.72
	1.92
	NO BID
	NO BID
	4.20
	NO BID


	NO BID
	1.30

*

	142
	Spoodles.  Constructed of heavy gauge stainless steel.  Plastic sanitary handles that is heat resistant.

3 ounce solid.  11 11/16” long
	8.45
	5.72
	1.92
	NO BID
	NO BID
	4.20
	NO BID
	NO BID
	1.30

*

	143
	Spoodles.  Constructed of heavy gauge stainless steel.  Plastic sanitary handles that is heat resistant.

4 ounce perforated.  1 11/16” long
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	144
	Spoodles.  Constructed of heavy gauge stainless steel.  Plastic sanitary handles that is heat resistant.

4 ounce solid.  11 11/16” long
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	145
	Spoon with flat edges, solid with bottom and one edge flattened to fit corners of pans.  16 gauge stainless with bakelite handle.  Overall length 13”.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	146
	Spoons, serving spoons for preschool
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	147
	Spoon, perforated.  13” long, stainless steel.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	148
	Spoon, slotted.  13” long, stainless steel.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	149
	Spoon, solid basting.  13” long stainless steel.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	150
	Spoon, solid basting, 20”, with hooks.  Stainless steel.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	151
	Squeeze Dispensers, natural (clear); 8 oz. Capacity.
	1.35
	6.34/ Doz.
	.28

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	2.93
	NO BID
	.40

	152
	Squeeze Dispensers, natural (clear); 24 oz capacity
	2.46
	    9.55/

 Doz.
	.48

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	4.68
	NO BID
	.70

	153
	Squeeze Dispensers, natural (clear); 32 oz capacity


	NO BID
	NO BID
	.70

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	7.75
	NO BID
	1.20

	154
	Steam table pan lid, dome, full size 18-8 stainless steel.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	155
	Steam table pan lid, dome-hinged, full size, 18-8 stainless steel.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	156
	Steam table pan lid, flat, full-size with recessed handle, 18-8 stainless steel.
	14.66
	18.48
	8.80

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	15.90
	8.81
	NO BID
	11.40

	157
	Steam table pan lid, half-size, 18-8 stainless steel.
	7.73
	9.24
	4.82

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	8.75
	4.91
	NO BID
	5.95



	158
	Steam table pan lid, to fit long style half pan.  18-8 stainless steel.
	12.05
	NO BID
	11.18
	NO BID
	NO BID
	23.15
	8.52

*
	NO BID
	9.56

	159
	Steam table pan, full size.  18-8 stainless steel.  2 1/2 “ deep.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	160
	Steam table pan, full size.  18-8 stainless steel.  4 “ deep.
	17.54
	10.08

*
	11.18
	NO BID
	NO BID
	23.15
	10.93
	NO BID
	17.45

	161
	Steam table pan, full size.  18-8 stainless steel.  6 “ deep.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	162
	Steam table pan, half size.  18-8 stainless steel.  2 1/2 “ deep.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	163
	Steam table pan, half size.  18-8 stainless steel.  4 “ deep.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	164
	Steam table pan, half size.  18-8 stainless steel.  6 “ deep.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	165
	Steam table pan, long style half size.  18-8 stainless steel.  2 1/2 “ deep.
	17.81
	6.09

*
	13.39
	NO BID
	NO BID
	27.75
	8.58
	NO BID
	12.00

	166
	Steam table pan, long style half size.  18-8 stainless steel.  4 “ deep.


	20.42
	7.52

*
	15.27
	NO BID
	NO BID
	28.50
	9.83
	NO BID
	14.50

	167
	Steam table pan, long style half-size.  18-8 stainless steel.  6 “ deep.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	168
	Steam table pan, perforated. 18-8 stainless steel.  Full size, 4” deep.
	27.71
	NO BID
	16.42
	NO BID
	NO BID
	29.75
	15.10

*
	NO BID
	23.25

	169
	Steam table pan, perforated. 18-8 stainless steel.  Full size, 6” deep.
	24.20
	NO BID
	21.87
	NO BID
	NO BID
	45.30
	21.14

*
	NO BID
	31.50



	170
	Step Stool. 14” tall.  “kik-step”.  Two level construction.  Casters retract when weight is applied.  Heavy gauge steel frame.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	171
	Stirring paddle, 24” hardwood.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	172
	Stirring paddle, 31” hardwood.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	173
	Stock pot with lid, stainless steel, 10 quart capacity
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	174
	Stock pot with lid, stainless steel, 24 quart capacity
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	175
	Stock pot with lid, stainless steel, 40 quart capacity
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	176
	Stockpot with lid, stainless steel, 8-quart capacity.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	177
	Store ‘N Pour.  Designed for controlled pouring of salad dressings.   Vent hole for “pour control”; airtight seal. Quart system.
	7.05
	43.68/ Doz.
	3.74
	NO BID
	NO BID
	4.05
	NO BID
	NO BID
	3.10

*

	178
	Store ‘N Pour.  Designed for controlled pouring of salad dressings. Vent hole for “pour control”; airtight seal. Half-gallon system.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	179
	Strainer, spaghetti NFS approved.  Aluminum.  4-5 quart capacity.  With loop in handle and hook on opposite side of handle. Dimension 10 3/8” x 5 ½”
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	15.70


	8.47

*


	NO BID
	8.55

	180
	Strainer, utility.  Extra strength mesh.  Hardwood handle.  14” diameter
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	181
	Teaspoon.  Stainless steel, 6” length, plain design, 12 oz weight per dozen.  SAMPLE REQUIRED.  Price per dozen.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	182
	Thermometer, digital
	25.91
	9.56
	5.83
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	5.79

*
	NO BID
	17.18

	183
	Thermometers, for oven temperatures.  SAMPLE REQUIRED.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	184
	Thermometer, freezer, rustproof.  4 7/8” x 1 1/2”; -40( F to 160( F
	6.83
	1.48

*
	1.78
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	3.43
	NO BID
	2.38

	185
	Thermometer, hot food.  Pocket style with protective case with clip.  5 3/4” long, dial diameter 1”.  Dial graduated in increments with 0( to 220(F.
	9.89
	3.73
	3.82
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	2.58

*
	NO BID
	4.50

	186
	Thermometer, room temperature, for stock rooms.
	5.12
	2.54
	1.38

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	3.25
	NO BID
	1.45

	187
	Timers
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	188
	Tongs, black handle, metal gripping edge.  6"
	6.02
	NO BID
	3.97

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	189
	Tongs, Kool-Touch, 6” black handle.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	190
	Tongs.  Kool-Touch 9” black handle
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	191
	Tongs, spring operated scalloped gripped edge, stainless steel, 6”
	1.97
	NO BID
	.68

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	2.15
	NO BID
	.94

	192
	Tongs.  Spring operated scalloped gripping edge.  Stainless steel, 12” length.
	4.40
	2.04
	1.05

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	3.50


	2.75
	NO BID
	1.20

	193
	Tongs.  Spring operated scalloped gripping edge.  Stainless steel, 15” length.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	194
	Towel, dish.  Crash bleached cotton yarn.  15” x 36” approximate size.  Priced by dozen.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	16.22/ DOZ.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	5.70/ DOZ.

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	15.18/ DOZ.

	195
	Towel, dish.  White, terry.  15” x 26” approximate size.  Priced by dozen.
	17.98/ Doz.
	7.42/ DOZ.

*


	8.52/ DOZ.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	8.05/ DOZ.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	8.30/ DOZ.

	196
	Towels, flour sack.  36” x 36”.  Priced per dozen.
	NO BID
	12.00/ DOZ.
	17.78/ DOZ.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	11.25/ DOZ.

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	17.33/ DOZ.

	197
	Tray cart, stainless steel.  Shelf on top must have receptacles for silverware, napkins & straws.  One shelf on bottom for trays.  No larger than 21” x 28”.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	198
	Trays, 6 compartment, 10”x14 ½”

Dallas ware # P-71 Square holes.NO EQUAL

Price per. Dozen. Sample Required
	NO BID
	NO BID
	46.78/ DOZ.

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	NO BID
	62.00/ DOZ.

	199
	Trays, 6 compartment, 10” x 14 1/2”.***..  Heavy weight Melamine, Carlisle  # 43981 tray.  NO EQUAL. Priced per dozen

Sample Required
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	200
	Trays with logo – high schools only
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	201
	Utility Truck.  Holds up to 600lbs.  5" heavy-duty plate casters.  Chrome.  Platform size 19 3/4 x 29 5/8
	NO BID
	NO BID
	190.00

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID


	NO BID
	NO BID

	202
	Vegetable brush.  Curved and white.  Tampico bristles twisted in steel wires.  Hardwood handle.  9” long.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	203
	Vegetable peelers.  “knee action”, 6”, floating blade, 2 cutting edges.  Rounded point scoops.  Blade of tempered high carbon tool steel.  Nickle-plated handle.  SAMPLE REQUIRED.  Price per dozen
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	204
	Washrags.  Terrycloth, 100% cotton.  12” x 12”.  Price per dozen.


	9.62/ DOZ.
	NO BID
	3.67/ DOZ.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	3.29/ DOZ.

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	3.58/ DOZ.

	205
	Wet floor signs
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	11.50 Not Ordering
	NO BID

	206
	Wet Mop Heads Rubbermaid F516
	5.66
	NO BID
	4.32
	3.25
	3.20
	2.45

*
	6.09
	3.10
	3.25

	207
	White handled knife w/10” blade
	25.01
	13.43
	9.25
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	4.70

*
	NO BID
	9.75

	208
	Wire Grates, heavy duty.  Fits full-size sheet pans.  Dimensions 24”l x 161/2”w x 7/8” h.  Chrome plated.  Hole diameter 7/16”.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	209
	Wire Grates, heavy duty.  Fits half-size sheet pans. Dimensions -  11 1/4”l x 8 13/16”w x 3/4” h.  Chrome plated.  Hole diameter 7/16”.


	11.96
	8.92

*


	2.00

NOT PER SPEC
	NO BID
	NO BID
	12.15
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	210
	Wire whisk, French style.  Stainless steel.  16” long.
	6.92
	6.92
	3.64
	NO BID
	NO BID
	9.15
	NO BID
	NO BID
	2.97

*

	211
	White beverage dispenser, with spigot for dispensing tea, lemonade, etc.  3-gallon capacity with quart measuring lines.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	212
	White beverage dispenser, with spigot for dispensing tea, lemonade, et.  5-gallon capacity with quart measuring lines.
	52.19 NOT PER SPEC
	25.84 Not per spec
	30.45


	NO BID
	NO BID
	25.40

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	48.50

	213
	Dissolve away labels.  Plain white labels, approximately 1”x2”.  500 per roll.
	9.51

*
	26.80/ 1000 ct
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	214
	Pan Rack – 38 Shelf, standard 18” x 26” size.  High strength, heavy-duty high tensile aluminum.  Angles are welded in place front and back, making sure all cracks are sealed.  Welded both horizontally and vertically.  Supporting cross braces has gussets welded into place to prevent “racking”.  Four 4” heavy-duty casters.  Caster plates welded to frame of unit and casters bolted to caster plate (not to frame) with 4 bolts.  5-year guarantee against defects and workmanship.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	215
	Hanging signage set for stainless steel coffee pots.  Adjustable chain with signs for “Coffee”, “Decaf”, and “Hot Water”.
	8.31

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	216
	Half size pan rack, orange, Rubbermaid, 12 shelves.  Heavy-duty
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	295.00

*

	217
	Spaghetti spoon, plastic, dishwasher safe.
	3.14
	NO BID
	1.00

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	2.55
	NO BID
	NO BID
	2.65

	218
	CAMBRO ¼ size, 2 ½” deep H-Pan, black, with camwear grip lid cover, using on steam table and in ovens up to 375*.
	10.16
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	9.25

*
	NO BID
	10.20

	219
	Pan rack, 18 shelves, no taller than 55” high.  Heavy-duty high tensile aluminum.  Angles are welded in place front and back.  Welded both horizontally and vertically.
	NO BID
	263.76

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	220
	Pan rack, short half size, 7 shelves, and Heavy-duty high tensile aluminum.  Angels are welded in place front and back.  Welded both horizontally and vertically.
	597.60
	272.67
	224.00

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	195.00

Not per spec

	221
	Pizza screens, All Aluminum heavy-duty 18”
	6.62
	NO BID
	4.32
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	4.34
	NO BID
	3.45

*

	222 
	Scoop, Ice Cream.  Stainless steel.  Size 12.  All 18-8 stainless steel.  Rapid non-fatique squeeze action.  Suitable for right or left hand use.  Heavy-duty compression ring.
	12.50
	6.27
	7.08
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	5.63
	NO BID
	3.57

*

	223
	Small 3-shelf cart, Stainless steel utility.  Comparable to Lakeside 370-019.  650# load capacity.  Overall dimensions W15 ½ x l 24” x H 31”.  18 Gauge stainless steel shelves.
	246.60
	NO BID
	206.28

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	221.00
	NO BID
	613.00

	224
	Steam table pan lid, flat, to fit 6 ½ w x 10 ½ l, ½ size with recessed handle, 18-8 stainless steel.
	6.02
	9.24
	3.57

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	5.25
	NO BID
	4.60

	225 
	Icing spreader, approximately 10”, high-carbon steel.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	3.12

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	11.60

	226
	Tablespoons – Stainless steel, plain design, priced per dozen.
	4.07
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	   8.00/

    Doz.

       *

	227
	Bakers sleeve.  Fits over the arm with no hand protection.  Resistant to high temperatures.
	3.14

*
	NO BID
	4.00
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	3.90

	228
	Piano whip, 10”, 18-8 Stainless steel, one-piece handle completely sealed.
	3.59
	4.62
	2.40
	NO BID
	NO BID
	6.10
	4.95
	NO BID
	1.80

*

	229
	Cake and Pie server, 3 x 5 stainless steel, one piece handle completely sealed.
	8.36
	7.06
	6.30

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	6.37

	230
	Server condiment pump Model #CP-F83330. 
	141.95
	NO BID
	102.50
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	96.00

*

	231
	Springs for server condiment pump, model #CB-F 83330.  Part #82077.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	.90
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	.86

*

	232
	Brillo Nylon Scrubbie, Green, 6” x 9 ½”.  6 packages of 10 per case.
	NO BID
	5.79/

per 20 ct
	NO BID
	13.80/ cs

*
	17.70/ cs
	57.00/cs
	NO BID
	NO BID
	 NO BID

	233
	Russell International Serrated bread knife,  10” Blade, P94804.
	NO BID
	NO BID
	9.57
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	8.75

*

	234
	Short Handle Squeegee
	11.60
	8.61
	4.77
	NO BID
	NO BID
	5.50
	NO BID
	NO BID
	4.60

*

	235
	Wire grates, Heavy duty, chrome plated, 18” x 10”.
	4.85
	14.03
	2.58
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	1.60

*

	236
	Folding Platform truck, steel deck with non-skid vinyl surface.
	339.30
	NO BID
	65.00

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID

	237
	Black 9” Cambro tongs, scalloped.  
	2.78
	NO BID
	1.70

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	3.69
	NO BID
	1.89

	238
	Cambro, 6-compartment tray, 1596 CW, blue. 
	164.05/ 24 ct.
	NO BID
	132.72/ 

24 ct

*
	NO BID
	NO BID
	NO BID
	5.95
	NO BID
	6.06


Hillyard submitted “
NO BID AT THIS TIME “.

