

Henderson County Schools

1805 Second Street, Henderson, Kentucky 42420
(270) 831-5000 Fax: (270) 831-5009
www.henderson.kyschools.us



TO: Thomas L. Richey, Superintendent
And Board Members

FROM: Walt Spencer

DATE: June 17, 2013

SUBJ: Bid Recommendations

Walt Spencer

BID # 14-13-5-6 FLEET INSURANCE

Invitations to bid were sent to E.J. Mabry, E.M.Ford, Latta Insurance, Ohio Valley Insurance, and Vaughn Insurance. E. M. Ford was the only company to return a bid totaling \$113,253.00. We have used this company in the past and have been very satisfied with their service. We are recommending the contract for Fleet Insurance Bid # 14-13-5-6 be awarded to E. M. Ford.

BID 15-13-5-6 PROPERTY & LIABILITY INSURANCE

Invitations to bid were sent to E. J. Mabry, E. M. Ford, Latta Insurance, Ohio Valley Insurance, and Vaughn Insurance. E. M. Ford returned a bid totaling \$339,010.00. E. M. Ford has been our insurance carrier in the past and has delivered excellent service to us. We are recommending that the contract for Bid # 15-13-5-6 Property & Liability Insurance be awarded to E. M. Ford.

Henderson County Board of Education
1805 Second Street
Henderson, Kentucky 42420

TABULATION SHEET PROPERTY & LIABILITY INSURANCE
BID # 15-13-5-6

VENDOR	E.J. Mabry	E.M.Ford	Latta Insurance	Ohio Valley Ins	Vaughan Insurance
Insurance Carrier Name	No Bid	Ohio Casualty Insurance Company	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
General Liability Insurance Annual Installment Premium		\$62,708.00			
General Liability Insurance Three Year Installment Premium					
Insurance Carrier Name		Ohio Casualty Insurance Company			
Educator's Legal Liability Insurance Annual Installment Premium		Included in General Liability Premium			
Educator's Legal Liability Insurance Three Year Installment Premium					
Insurance Carrier Name		Ohio Casualty Insurance Company			
Umbrella Liability Insurance Annual Installment Premium		\$31,196.00			
Umbrella Liability Insurance Three Year Installment Premium					
Insurance Carrier Name		Ohio Casualty Insurance Company			

VENDOR	E.J. Mabry	E.M.Ford	Latta Insurance	Ohio Valley Ins	Vaughan Insurance
Property Insurance Annual Installment Premium	No Bid	\$222,211.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Property Insurance Three Year Installment Premium					
Insurance Carrier Name		Ohio Casualty Insurance Company			
Boiler/Machinery Breakdown Insurance Annual Installment Premium		Included in Property Insurance			
Boiler/Machinery Breakdown Insurance Three Year Installment Premium					
Inland Marine		\$8,930.00			
Mine Subsidence		\$1,836.00			
TRIA (Terrorism Risk Insurance Act Property Coverage		\$10,388.00			
General Liability Coverage		\$579.00			
Crime		N/A			
Inland Marine		\$226.00			
Automobile		N/A			
Umbrella		\$936.00			
TRIA Total		\$12,129.00			
Grand Total Liability & Property Insurance		\$339,010.00			

Henderson County Board of Education
1805 Second Street
Henderson, Kentucky 42420

TABULATION SHEET VEHICLE INSURANCE
BID # 14-13-5-6

VENDOR	E.J. Mabry	E.M.Ford	Latta Insurance	Ohio Valley Ins	Vaughan Insurance
INSURANCE COMPANY NAME	No Bid	Ohio Casualty	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
SCHOOL BUSES USED DAILY		Included			
PREMIUM FOR SPARE BUSES		Included			
PREMIUM per CONTRACT BUS					
OTHER STUDENT CARRIERS		Included			
SERVICE VEHICLES		Included			
VEHICLES NOT RELATED TO		Included			
PUPIL TRANSPORTATION		Included			
HIRED CAR & NON OWNED					
AUTO COVERAGE		\$850.08			
AUTO EXTENSION		\$449.00			
ENDORSEMENT					
GRAND TOTAL PREMIUM		\$113,254.00			