Henderson County Schools

1805 Second Street, Henderson, Kentucky 42420 (270) 831-5000 Fax: (270) 831-5009 www.henderson.kyschools.us



To:

Dr. Thomas Richey, Superintendent

And School Board Members

From:

Walt Spencer, CPA

Wash Spancar Assistant Superintendent of Finance

Date:

April 16, 2013

Re:

Bid Recommendations

Renewal Letter for Bid # 12-11-5-4 Propane mailed March 20, 2013:

We are satisfied with the service and price of propane from Herron's Henderson Propane. Mrs. Herron has signed and returned a letter of agreement to continue to provide propane to Cairo Elementary at the original contract price. We recommend exercising the option of renewing the contract with Herron's Henderson Propane for one year.

BID # 6-13-5-4 Surplus Buses

Ten (10) buses and one (1) Ford Explorer were declared as surplus property and invitations to bid were sent to four vendors. Bids were returned from three vendors. Mr. O'Daniel and I estimated salvage price per bus at \$1,500. One vendor returned bids for six of the buses above the \$1,500 price as highlighted on the tabulation sheet. It is my recommendation that we sell bus number 19, 22, 66, 89, 142, and 144 to Mr. Benjie Allen and the remainder of the buses and the Ford Explorer be salvaged at the current dollar-per-pound price.

Henderson County Schools 1805 Second Street Henderson, KY 42420 TABULATION OF BIDS FOR SURPLUS SCHOOL BUSES BID #6-13-5-4

Action	Accept Bid	Accept Bid	Salvage	Salvage	Salvage	Accept Bid	Accept Bid	Salvage	Accept Bid	Accept Bid	Salvage
Benjie Allen	\$1,586.12	\$1,649.87	\$908.37	\$886.77	\$822.14	\$1,585.26	\$1,689.68	No Bid	\$1,651.49	\$1,681.12	\$502.68
Debra Samples	bia oN										\$200.00
Paul Marcelin	bia oM										
Hutchison Salvage	No Bid	\$900.00	No Bid	\$900.00	\$900.00	\$900.00	No Bid	\$900.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$400.00
Gospel Light Baptist Church	No Bid	\$1,200.00	\$500.00	\$500.00	\$500.00	No Bid	\$800.00	No Bid	\$1,000.00	\$800.00	No Bid
Mileage	221,291	175,803	231,170	195,067	172,438	210,261	198,557	175,612	194,103	196,520	138,749
Mfg. Year	1996	1994	1993	1995	1995	1996	1995	1992	1993	1994	1999
Unit No.	19	22	58	63	64	99	68	139	142	144	5041