
FORT THOMAS INDEPENDENT SCHOOLS - BID RESULTS FOR 07/01/21 - 06/30/22

Item # Item Name All Pro Supply HP/Ferguson Hillside Maintenance Supply Mailender Murphy Supply Company Pyramid School Products (#41122FORT on all orders) Mersi Distribution Phillips Supply Co.     (min. order $150.00) Interboro Packaging Corp.

1 Carpet Spotter Franklin - 32oz/12 per case                  $29.98    #F374012 Claire - 20oz can        12/case                           $50.01   #9627288 P&G   3/25oz                                              $18.30        #20 No Bid WePak - 12/qts                                 $29.00   No Bid No Bid Diversey   6/32oz              $34.71   SCJ4192 no bid

2 Lysol disinfectant spray – Lysol Only Lysol - 12/case                                   $102.12      #12483 Spartan Steriphene - 20ox can 12/case  $49.96    # 5051495 Proline - 12/case                             $74.76   #1CL527 No Bid Lysol - 12/case                                $79.00   #3100.0113 Lysol - 12/19oz/case                   $107.98   #RAC74828CY No Bid Lysol   12/19oz/case        $105.47     #SAAIT467508 no bid

3 KC Instant Hand Sanitizer Gel No Bid Not on list Not on list No Bid Not on list No Bid No Bid not on list no bid

4 Lysol Disinfecting Wipes Lysol - 6 canisters/case                       $40.44     #77182 Lysol - flat pack, 80 wipes/pack          $5.56   ($33.36/case)   #9055421 Lysol - 6/80/case                              $42.27   #99716 No Bid Lysol - 6/80                                      $26.00   #9200.5703 Lysol - 80/tub, 6 tubs/case               $27.98   #RAC99716CT No Bid no bid
no bid

5 Bleach Austin   6G/case                                        $17.60    KK11008 Champion 6% - 1G                                $2.17   ($13.02/case)   #7483694 No Bid No Bid Austin - 6/1G                                   $17.94   #1500.0101 No Bid No Bid Clorox   3/121oz                 $19.88/cs    LAGCLO30966
no bid

6 Mr. Clean Magic Eraser – Original P&G - 36/case                                     $35.18   #79009 Mr. Clean - 36/case                              $35.39   #7962685 P&G - 36                                            $35.09   #79009 No Bid Mr.Clean - 36/case                                 $31.00   #79009 Mr. Clean  - 6/6 case                               $36.98   #PGC79009 No Bid P&G  24/case                      $35.52    #LAG82027MCEPEA
no bid

7 Cone Bowl Mop Better Brush                                         $1.20    #280712 Impact                                                     $2.43   #207233 Prolink                                                   $6.66   #3600 No Bid Cone Bowl Mop                                $1.29   #1700.01 Tolco - 100 ea/case                             $0.99 ea   #280105 No Bid no bid
no bid

8 Toilet Bowl Cleaner Franklin - 32oz/12 per case                  $28.80   #F270012 Spartan - 12qt/case                              $20.40   #7575514 ProLink - 12/qt                                      $47.83   #B14153 No Bid MSC - 12/qts                                     $18.74   #1800.050 No Bid No Bid Diversey   12/32oz               $21.99      #SCJ100925283
no bid

9 Chewing Gum Remover Chase - 12/case                                      $38.78   #4334105 Claire Mfg - 12oz can                                       $2.70  ($32.40/case)   #5051304 ProLink - 12/case                                 $49.02  ($4.09ea)     #CA002 No Bid MSC - 12 can/case                           $25.00   Gum remover Chase (spraypail) - 12/12oz/case                     $24.98   #433-4107 No Bid Diversey   12/6.5oz                 $48.89     #SCJ4198
no bid

10 TIDE Laundry Detergent discontinued the specific one on list No Bid No Bid No Bid MSC  4/1gal                                   $44.00   #HE Liquid laundry det. No Bid No Bid no bid
no bid

11 Furniture Polish Franklin - 12/case                                  $29.46   #F801015 Claire Mfg - 20oz can lemon oil                                 $3.45  ($41.40/case)     #5051303 ProLink - 12/19oz                                $67.71   #YA006 No Bid Chase - 12/20oz/case                      $32.00   #5400.0121 Chase - 12/20oz/case                       $28.98   #433-4109 No Bid Diversey     12/32oz                 $42.61   #SCJ04415
no bid

12 Stainless Steel Cleaner Franklin - 12/case                                   $32.98   #F423015 Claire Mfg - 20oz can                                   $4.21  ($50.52)     #5051308 ProLink - 12/18oz                               $66.86   #KA006 No Bid Chase - 12/20oz/case                     $30.00   SS Cleaner Chase - oilbased 12/20oz/case                              $30.98  #433-4111 No Bid Bright Solutions   6/16oz        $49.86    #BSL954500006
no bid

13 Absorbent Powder Nilodor/Fresh   - 6/case                       $37.86  #SUPERSORB Hospeco - 16oz/12/case                      $52.32   #7482877 VOBAN      1 lb                                              $3.06   ($18.36)         #VOBAN No Bid Fresh - 6/case                                   $36.00    absorbent powder Fresh - 6/12oz/case                            $35.99   #6-14-SS No Bid Big D    6/1lb                              $53.38   #BIG166
no bid

14 Graffiti Remover Chase - 12/case                                   $44.92   #4334107 Claire Mfg - 20oz/12/case                                $47.10   #7963138 No Bid No Bid Chase - 12/20oz/case                        $48.00   graffiti remover Chase - 12/20oz/case                       $39.96   #433-4105 No Bid no bid
no bid

15 Floor Stripper Franklin - 5G container                            $59.90   #F200026 Spartan NAD-75 - 5G pail                                   $41.08   #7481055 No Bid No Bid MSC - 5G                                        $34.00   HD floor stripper No Bid No Bid Diversey     5GL                        $84.33   #SCJ04157
no bid

16 Floor Finish Franklin - 5G container                            $89.65   #9605 Spartan iShine - 5G pail                                  $82.12   #5051584 no No Bid Hard As Diamond - 5G                       $56.85   #4900.5012 No Bid No Bid Diversey   5GL                          $94.21   #SCJ4210179
no bid

17 Terrazzo Floor Finish Franklin - 5G container                          $79.85   #F139026 Spartan Terra Glaze sealer - 5G pail                                    $80.88   #5051581 No Bid No Bid Iron Man - 5G                                  $59.95   #4900 No Bid No Bid Diversey    5GL                       $100.12    #SCJ04171
no bid

18 Restorer Franklin - 4G/case                                  $38.82   #F191022 Spartan Bounce Back - 5G pail                                  $69.91   #7438766 No Bid No Bid Flash Back - 12/qts                          $55.00  Flash back  SB No Bid No Bid Diversey    5GL                        $69.00    #SCJ04636
no bid

19 Vacuum Bags - Windsor Windsor - 10/pack                                   $20.50   #WI-1405-10 Windsor 5300 - 10/pack                               $17.11   #5147652 No Bid No Bid Windsor - 10/pack                           $12.00   #WIN5300 No Bid No Bid Karcher   10/pk                          $13.58    #WIN5300
no bid

20 Vacuum Bags - HEPA Bags Panasonic - 9/pack                               $8.95   #PR-1471-9 Panasonic Type U - 3/pack                    $1.96   ($5.88/9)    #7463776 No Bid No Bid Panasonic - 9/pack                           $6.98   #U-6 No Bid No Bid no bid
no bid

21 Stripper Pads 20”  BLACK ACS - 5/case                                        $15.40  #51-20 3M Niagara 20" - 5/case                                          $14.16   #7256033 ProLink - 5/case                                  $24.62   #FS120K No Bid Americo - 5/case                             $17.50   #400120 ACS - 5/case                                   $12.79   #72-20 No Bid Niagara   5/bx                           $14.39    #  MMM20NTKB
no bid

22 Scrubbing  Pads 20” green ACS - 5/case                                        $15.40   #55-20 3M Niagara 20" - 5/case                                       $14.16   #7068325 No Bid No Bid Americo - 5/case                            $17.50   #400320 ACS - 5/case                                    $12.79   #55-20 No Bid Americo   5/bx                            $14.92    #AMC2051G
no bid

23 Scrubbing Pads 20” blue ACS - 5/case                                         $15.40   #53-20 3M Niagara 20" - 5/case                                           $14.16   #7178311 ProLink - 5/case                                 $24.62   #FS320A No Bid Americo - 5/case                           $17.50   #400420 ACS - 5/case                                   $12.79   #53-20 No Bid Niagara   5/bx                           $14.34    #  MMM20NBL
no bid

24 Polishing Pads 20” tan or white ACS - 5/case                                         $15.40   #41-20 3M Niagara 20" white - 5/case                                          $14.16   #7178315 ProLink - 5/case                                   $24.62   #FB620K No Bid Americo - 5/case                                $17.50   #401220 ACS - 5/case                                    $12.79   #41-20 No Bid Niagara 5/box                              $14.34    #MMM20NW
no bid

25 Buffing Pads 20” red ACS - 5/case                                          $15.40   #51-20 3M Niagara 20" - 5/case                                         $14.16   #7068320 ProLink - 5/case                                    $24.62   #FB520K No Bid Americo - 5/case                               $17.50   #404420 ACS - 5/case                                        $12.79   #51-20 No Bid Niagara   5/bx                          $14.34   #MMM20NR
no bid

26 Burnishing Pads 20” natural ACS - 5/case                                         $15.40   #37-20 3M Niagara 20" tan - 5/case                                          $14.16   #7178305 Prolink - 5/case                                       $26.00         #FB120A No Bid Americo - 5/case                            $19.00  #401720 ACS - 5/case                                      $12-79   #35-20 No Bid Niagara    5/bx                         $14.39   #MMM20NNB
no bid

27 Latex gloves Prime Source - 100/box                          $5.95   #75000595 Westcraft Vinyl PF - 100/box                   $4.03      S - 9722227; M - 9722225;             L - 9722226 No Bid No Bid MSC - 100/box                                 $7.40   #5610.012100 Hospeco   100/bx                                    $7.99    #GLL

Noble Products  

100ct/bx,10bx/case         

$68.99  ($6.90/bx)   # 

394380

Tradex   10/100cs                    $40.33  ($4.03/box)  

TRALLG5102

Medpride/JobGuard   100/bx  $15.00/bx  #JGEL103-

(size)

28 Toilet Paper - NOVA 4530 Only Nova - 96 rolls/case                              $35.60   #4535 Westcraft - 500sht/roll/96 rolls/case                     $40.98   #7800432 Vondrehle - 96rolls/500sheets                                 $39.50   #B50096 No Bid NOVA - 96 rolls/case                        $37.49   #8600.245 No Bid No Bid no bid
no bid

29 Toilet Paper BAYWEST large rolls (HHS)  Only TORK / BW-     36/case                          $65.15   #161990 No Bid Vondrehle - 36rolls/900sheets                               $46.50  #300HC Baywest - Essity   36/865                      $39.89   #161990 Baywest - 36 rolls/case                     $37.74   #161990 No Bid No Bid no
no bid

30 Roll Towels Nittany - 800'/roll - 6 rolls/case                           $18.00   #6800EN Westcraft - 800'/roll - 6 rolls/case                        $23.73   #7800426 Vondrehle - 6rolls/800'                                   $25.38   #880N No Bid MSC - 6/800'/case                            $17.74      #RK8002 No Bid No Bid no
no bid

31 Roll Towels - BAYWEST  Only TORK / BW - 6/case                                    $46.95    #31300 No Bid Vondrehle - 6rolls/800'                                   $35.38   #880NS Baywest - Essity   6/800'/case                    $35.25   #8031300 No Bid No Bid No Bid no
no bid

32 GOJO luxury hand wash GOJO - 2/case                                        $58.94   #5262-02 GOJO 5262-02 FMX20 - 2/case,  2000ml $56.74   #7104437 No Bid GOJO - 2/case                                 $42.55   #5262-02 GOJO - 2000ml/2/case                    $49.95   #5262-02 No Bid No Bid GOJO    2/2000 cs                   $40.33   #GJI5262-02
no bid

33 GOJO dispenser FMX was discontinued by GOJO GOJO 5271-06 FMX20 dispenser                                                    $8.87   #5161704 No Bid GOJO - 6/case  Free w/soap purchase               #5271-06 No Bid No Bid No Bid GOJO  6/cs                                    $.00     #GJI5255-06
no bid

34 Scotch-Brite pad Primesource - 10/pack                         $3.84   #75004161 3M 9650 - 40/pack                                         $17.11   #4871651 No Bid No Bid No Bid ACS - 60/case                              $12.99   #96-050 No Bid no bid
no bid

35 WAVE urinal screen – Fresh Products Fresh - 10/box                                      $1.98ea ($19.98/box)   #WAVE 3D HP/Fresh apple spice - 12/box                               $25.12   #7482498 Fresh - 2/pack                                         $4.54   #3WDS-F-060M-04 No Bid Fresh - 10/box                                 $16.99    #WD  S/O  AC PHS Fresh - 10/box, 6 boxes/case           $17.19/box    #WDS-SA No Bid no bid
no bid

36 Garbage Can Liners  30x36 - Black North American - 200/case                             $18.85   #RT 3036-XH Westcraft black - 250/case                           $34.60   #5025025 Berry ProLink - 250/case                              $19.53   #LBR3036HC-C Victoria Bay- 500/case                      $36.69   #R3037K16 200/case     $16.90     #UC-202RL     500/case     $29.94     #S303716K No Bid No Bid Pitt Plastics     250/cs               $19.28    PITB73720XK
INT-3036-XXH    250/case   $24.34   (sample B)

37 Garbage Can Liners  38x58 - Black North American - 100/case                             $27.60   #RT 3858-XXH Westcraft black - 100/case                            $37.82   #5025067 Berry ProLink - 150/case                               $34.61   #TB223860-C Victoria Bay - 150/case                        $29.35   #R3860K22 100/case     $20.32   #UC201TXHRL   150case       $25.90   #SN386022N No Bid No Bid Pitt Plastics     100/cs           $27.15    PITEL385815K
INT3858-Super Exh    100/case   $25.34   (sample B)

38 Garbage Can Liners 38x58 CLEAR North American - 150/case                            $28.84   #R386022N Westcraft clear - 100/case                          $43.24   #5025058 Berry  ProLink - 150/case                             $34.61   #TN223860N Victoria Bay - 150/case                      $32.20   #R386N22 MSC - 150/case                               $25.90   #SN386022N No Bid No Bid no bid no bid

39 Red Wipers KC - 200/case                                      $29.30   #41029 KC 41029 - 4 packs/case                               $30.46   #1282846 No Bid No Bid KC - 50 per box/4 boxes per case      $30.00   #KCC41029 Wypall - 50/box, 4 boxes/case           $38.99  #KCC41029 No Bid KC   200/cs                             $26.02    MAI5720 no bid

40 Blue Wipers KC - 160/case                                      $28.32   #41041 KC 41041 - 160/case                                    $27.65   #8116687 No Bid No Bid KC - 160/case                                 $26.95   #41041 Wypall - 160/case                            $32.98   #KCC41041 No Bid KC    160/cs                                $25.70    MAI41044 no bid

41 Steel Janitor Dust Pans Better Brush                                                    $7.38   #410612 Impact 4212                                              $8.71   #6169288 No Bid No Bid Impact                                                  $3.95   #4212 Impact - 12ea/case                               $6.99 ea   #4212 No Bid Impact    ea                                $8.18     #FUL182 no bid

42 Lobby Broom Better Brush                                                 $4.35   #431106 RM 6374 black 35"                                                         $4.06   #3442639 ProLink                                                 $4.89   #SB003 No Bid MSC      flagged lobby broom                                         $3.00 ABCO - 12ea/case                                 $2.73 ea   #00321NB No Bid Rubbermaid   ea                                      $10.98   #RUB6374 no bid

43 Lobby Dustpan Better Brush                                         $10.79   #410106 RM 2531 black                                                     $9.84   #3441903 Nexstep                                                 $12.64   #96208 No Bid Impact                                               $7.74   #2007 Continental   12ea/ctn                          $6.78 ea    # 912BK No Bid Rubbermaid   ea                                      $29.49  #RUB2007 no bid

44 Warehouse Broom (Corn) Better Brush                                           $6.72   #432033 Carlisle 4135067 56"                                               $9.84   #7472190 ProLink                                               $8.13   #PL CB005 No Bid MSC                                                $6.44   #932C ABCO - 12ea/pkg                            $6.99 ea   #BRZ85E No Bid MIL      ea                                  $16.61   #MIL437050 no bid

45 Stiff Polypropylene Floor Sweep Better Brush                                                    $9.13   #100324 Carlisle 24" omni (no handle)                                                  $15.65   #4940079 No Bid No Bid No bid Better Brush - 12ea/case              $7.99 ea   #101124 No Bid no bid no bid

46 Aluminum handle Fuller                                                      $7.55   #808C RM 6355 gray w/ plastic tip                                                     $8.59   #3441518 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid no bid no bid

47 Mop Bucket Better Brush                                          $71.45   #153035 RM 7580-88 35qt yellow                                                    $72.93   #3442342 Nexstep                                               $87.73   #96975 No Bid Impact                                                  $69.00   35qt w/ side press RM                                                      $59.98  #7580-88YEL No Bid no bid no bid

48 Wet Mop Head(Web Foot) TUWAY                                                 $8.87   #DOL 24-1 Green RM D212                                                          $8.24   # 3442586 No Bid No Bid ABCO - 12/pack                                $68.00   #SECO M
ABCO - 12ea/case                                 $5.29ea ($63.48/case)  

#CLM303MB
No Bid Golden Star   ea                    $5.88   #GSI137946 no bid

49 Folding Wet Floor Sign Better Brush                                           $9.68   #150325 RM 6112-77                                                        $8.79  #3441797 ProLink                                                  $10.17   #WFCS25 No Bid RM                                                    $6.99   #6112-77 ABCO - 10ea/case                                 $6.79 ea    #WS0001 No Bid Rubbermaid    ea                        $17.35    RUB6112-77 no bid

50 Side gate mop handle Better Brush                                            $10.99   #151360 RM H146 Invader                                                         $10.16   #3441730 Nexstep                                                        $9.33   #6516 No Bid ABCO                                                 $7.75     side-gate RM - 12ea/case                              $8.98 ea     #H146 No Bid Rubbermaid   ea                      $21.61     #RCPH146 no bid

51 Floor finish mop head Better Brush                                     $4.96   #160818 Golden Star AEW3020                                           $3.26   #7464369 ProLink                                                 $7.74   #WM19MD No Bid No Bid ABCO - 12ea/case                         $3.99 ea     #LM203LCSNB No Bid Wil    ea                                       $4.63   #WIL502-24 no bid

52 SS squeegees Better Brush                                           $3.68   #260414 Unger PR35 14"                                                   $14.08   #6230451 No Bid No Bid No Bid Unger   10ea/case                                  $16.99 ea    PR350 No Bid Unger   ea                                $18.02   #UNGPR35 no bid

53 Feminine Napkin Container Impact                                                    $26.80   #1100 RM 6140                                                          $22.13      #3441852 No Bid No Bid No Bid Impact - 4ea/case                        $14.33 ea    #1102 No Bid Rubbermaid   ea                      $59.20   #RUB614 no bid

54 Feminine Napkin Liner bags Rubermaid - 250/case                                 $34.20   #6141 Hospeco - 250/case                              $14.63   #5051351 No Bid No Bid HOPSECO - 500/case                                 $17.99   #260 Hospeco - 250/case                          $15.89   #HS6141 No Bid Rubbermaid     500/cs             $40.90    #ROC77 no bid

55 Health care bags No Bid Westcraft - 250/case                          $25.95   #7048502 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid no bid no bid

56 Brute Garbage Cans  44G Impact                                                    $49.96   #7744-3 RM 2643        gray                                                $35.89   #3442792 Nexstep                                                       $43.81     #6844 No Bid RCP                                                    $30.00   #2643 No Bid No Bid Rubbermaid   ea                          $71.55    #RUB2643G no bid

57 Brute Garbage Cans    55G Impact                                                    $86.80   #7755-3 RM 2655      gray                                                  $42.85   #287337 No Bid No Bid RCP                                                   $60.00   #2655 No Bid No Bid Rubbermaid    ea                       $109.76   #RUB2655G no bid

58 Brute Container Lid  44G Impact                                                   $29.93   #7745-3 RM 2645-60  black                                                    $11.28   #3442165 Impact                                                         $32.64    #7745 No Bid RCP                                                   $10.00   #2645-60  BLA No Bid No Bid Rubbermaid    ea                     $24.65    #RUB2645G no bid

59 Brute Container Lid  55G Impact                                                     $31.85   #7756-3 RM  2654  gray                                                    $14.74   #3442358 No Bid No Bid RCP                                                $17.99   #2654-6RA No Bid No Bid Rubbermaid    ea                      $33.39     #RUB2654G no bid

60 28 Quart Garbage Cans Impact                                                   $7.26   #7702-5 RM 2965 black                                                        $5.16   #3441831 No Bid No Bid RM                                                    $6.99   #2956 RM - 12es/case                              $4.39 ea     #2956BLA No Bid Rubbermaid    ea                    $8.54       #RUB2956BL no bid

61 41 Quart Garbage Cans Impact                                                    $11.76   #7703-3 RM 2957 black                                                      $8.54   #3442640 No Bid No Bid RCP                                                   $9.74   #2957 RM - 2ea/case                               $6.99 ea  #2957BLA No Bid Rubbermaid  ea                        $16.07   RUB2957BL no bid

62 Doodlebug Cleaning System Pad Holder Kit ACS  ea kit                                                           $9.13   #619KIT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ACS - 4 kits/case                           $25.84 cs   #619-4 No Bid 3M   kit                                     $34.96    #MMM6473 no bid

63 Doodlebug Orange Pad Holder Kit ACS   ea kit                                                           $9.13   #619KIT 3M 6472 intro kit                                                          $29.68   #1446738 No Bid No Bid No Bid ACS - 4 kits/case                              $31.92 cs    #280157-4 No Bid 3M   kit                                     $20.23    #MMM6472 no bid

64 Doodlebug White Pad ACS -  20 pads/case                                        $14.40   #621 3M 8440 white   -     5/pack                                         $8.30   #5051898 No Bid No Bid No Bid ACS - 5/bx, 4 bx/case                 $14.73 cs    #621 No Bid 3M   5/bx                                $6.13/bx     #MMM844ON no bid

65 Doodlebug Blue Pad ACS - 20 pads/case                                          $14.40   #626 3M 8242 blue     -     5/pack                                      $8.33   #7210419 No Bid No Bid No Bid ACS - 5/bx, 4 bx/case                  $14.74 cs  #626 No Bid 3M   5/bx                                $6.13/bx     #MMM8242N no bid

66 Doodlebug Brown Pad ACS - 20 pads/case                                       $14.40   #631 3M 8541 brown      - 5/pack                                          $8.31   #5051920 No Bid No Bid No Bid ACS - 5/box, 4 boxes/case                 $14.76 cs  #631 No Bid 3M   5/bx                               $6.13/bx       #MMM8541N no bid

67 Doodlebug High Strip Pad ACS   20 pads/case                                          $14.40   #673 3M 8550 black - 10/pack                                        $35.91   #5051919 No Bid No Bid No Bid ACS - 5/bx, 4 bx/case                   $14.75 cs   #672 No Bid 3M   10/bx                             $34.50/bx    #MMM8550 no bid

68 Swiffer 360 Duster Starter Kit P&G - 12case                                       $36.60   #16942 Swiffer 61712  - 4/case                                    $31.85   #SP-PGC61712 P&G - 12/pack                                     $36.51   #16942 No Bid P&G - 12/case                                $24.95   #77300 No Bid No Bid no bid no bid
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69 Swiffer 360 Duster/Extendable Handle w/ refill kit P&G - 6/case                                          $62.56   #82074 PGC Swiffer 82074 - 6/case                                          $64.79   #4442461 P&G -   each                                         $10.80   #82074 No Bid P&G - 6/case                                     $68.00   #82074CT Swiffer - 6 kits/case                             $57.99   #PGC82074 No Bid no bid no bid

70 Swiffer 360 Duster Refills P&G - 36/case                                     $35.72   #16944 PGC 21620 Swiffer - 4 packs/case                               $40.51   #7311489 P&G -    6                                               $9.94   #16944 No Bid discontinued No Bid No Bid no bid no bid

71 Dust Mopping Pad  24” Tuway - each                                        $5.78  (69.36/case)    #MFG-24FR Tuway 24" green -  12/case                                     $74.84   #SP-TMFG-24FR No Bid No Bid Tuway        12 per                                       $79.00   #MFG-24FR Tuway - 12/case                               $67.08     #MFG-24FR No Bid no bid no bid

72 Pad Holder / RCP Q426 – Tuway only Tuway - each (10/case)                                $9.35 ($93.50/case)   #24 ALM-FRM Tuway 24" frame - 10/case                                   $100.84   #SP-T24ALM-FRM No Bid No Bid Tuway - must order 10                                          $119.00   #24ALM-FRM Tuway - 10/case                           $86.40     #24ALM-FRM No Bid no bid no bid

73 Dust Mopping Pad  36” - Tuway only Tuway - each                                      $7.82 ($93.84)    #MFG-36FR Tuway 36" green - 12/case                                  $101.13   #SP-TMFG-36FR No Bid No Bid Tuway - must order 12                     $114.00  #MFG-36FR Tuway - 12/case                              $82.56      #MFG-36FR No Bid no bid no bid

74 Pad Holder / RCP Q438 – Tuway only Tuway - each (10/case)                                    $18.17  ($181.70)    #36 ALM-FRM Tuway 36" frame - 10/case                                  $196.35   #SP-T36ALM-FRM No Bid No Bid Tuway - must order 10                     $175.00 #36ALM-FRM Tuway - 10/case                         $136.90     #36ALM-FRM No Bid no bid no bid

75 Dust Mopping Pad  48” - Tuway only Tuway - each   (12/case)                                    $9.69  ($116.28)    #MFG-48FR Tuway 48" green - 12/case                                     $125.40   #SP-TMFG-48FR No Bid No Bid Tuway - must order 12                   $139.00  #MFG-48FR Tuway - 12/case                               $107.88      #MFG-48R No Bid no bid no bid

76 Pad Holder / RCP Q449 - Tuway Tuway - each   (10/case)                                    $17.88   ($178.80)    #48 ALM-FRM Tuway 48" frame - 10/case                                    $193.26   #SP-T48ALM-FRM No Bid No Bid Tuway - must order 10               $170.00  #48-ALM-FRM Tuway - 10case                               $169.90     #48ALM-FRM No Bid no bid no bid

77 Microfiber Cleaning Cloth 16"x16" Tuway - 300/case                                  $183.75    #MFB-74 HP Textiles - 12/pack                              $8.90   #5051275
Better Brush    ea.                                                 $0.88 ($264.00/300)  

#10010500
No Bid Tuway - 300/case                                  $174.00    #MFB-74

Monarch - 12ea/pkg                     $0.52 ea ($156.00/300)     #M915107-

color
No Bid Golden Star   12/pk                  $18.32    #GSIIMFC16XIB no bid

78 Microfiber Wet Mop MicroFiber & More         Dozen                         $89.70    #BLUE-MD RM A812                                                         $7.16   #4388456 ProLink   ea                                                 $7.74     #W31MDB No Bid Tuway - 12/case                            $144.00      #MD MF Monarch - 12ea/case -                 $6.22 ea     #M830018B No Bid Golden Star      ea                    $6.22     #GSIAWM55MB no bid

79 Procell AAA Batteries Duracell - 144/case                               $89.70    #PC2400BKD Duracell PC2400 AAA - 24/pack                                $7.86   #4631243 No Bid No Bid no bid Duracell - 24/box                              $8.98   #PC2400BKD No Bid no bid no bid

80 Procell AA Batteries Duracell - 144/case                               $57.62    #PC1500BKD Duracell PC1500 AA - 24/pack                               $8.47   #4631240 No Bid No Bid No Bid Duracell - 24/box                               $8.98   #PC1500BKD No Bid no bid no bid

81 Procell C Batteries Duracell - 72/case                                 $64.68    #PC1400 Duracell PC 1400   - 12/pack                                  $8.83   #4631237 No Bid No Bid No Bid Duracell - 12/box                               $7.99   #PC1400 No Bid no bid no bid

82 Procell D Batteries Duracell - 72/case                                 $86.04   #PC1300 Duracell PC 1300  - 12/pack                                 $10.64   #4631244 No Bid No Bid No Bid Duracell - 12/box                              $10.99   #PC1300 No Bid no bid no bid

83 Procell 9V batteries Duracell - 72/case                                  $120.88   #PC1604BKD Duracell PC 1604   - 12/pack                                  $16.86   #4631239 No Bid No Bid No Bid Duracell - 12/box                              $15.99    #PC1604BKD No Bid no bid no bid

84 Tissue Dispenser – 1 roll Impact                                                 $18.95   #2500 Impact 2500                                                   $7.93   #7460872 No Bid No Bid No Bid Impact - 12ea/case                       $8.99 ea     #2500 No Bid no bid no bid

85 Tissue Dispenser – 2 rolls Impact                                              $21.45   #2501 Impact 2501                                                  $22.93   #7461419               No Bid No Bid No Bid Iimpact - 12ea/case                       $17.99 ea     #2501 No Bid no bid no bid

86 Bobrick Dispenser – stainless steel Bobrick                                                     $138.60    #B4288 Bobrick B4288                                                   $105.67   #4100824 No Bid No Bid Bobrick                                             $69.00   #4288 No Bid No Bid no bid no bid

87 Tissue Dispenser – Baywest 3 rolls No Bid No Bid No Bid Baywest - Part # 80300 $0 with purchase of product Baywest                                              $10.00   #80300 No Bid No Bid no bid no bid

88 Dust Mop Treatment Chase - 12/case                                      $29.56   #4385152 Spartan - 4G/case                                 $28.51   #7485166 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Claire   12/15oz                     $57.41    #CIACP875BSOL no bid

89 Steri-Fab Sterifab - 4G/case                                 $240.20   #Sterifab Sterifab - 4G/case                              $272.50   #7482767 Steri-Fab   4/1gal.                                       $200.97   #SFDGL No Bid Steri-Fab - 4-1G                               $189.00   #6100.1551 No Bid No Bid no bid no bid

90 Neutral Floor Cleaner Fuller - 4G/case                                     $23.70   #9291 Spartan - 4G/case                                 $28.14   #8203123 ProLink - 4/1gal.                                      $42.29   #PL06217 No Bid MSC - 4-1G                                       $21.75   #4800.4000 No Bid No Bid Diversey    4GL/cs                  $25.49    #SCJ03904 no bid

91 Baseboard Stripper Chase - 12/case                                     $28.26   #4334112 HP/Claire - 12/case                                $45.13   #7481503 ProLink        12                                          $72.00   #FA003 No Bid No Bid Chase - 12/20oz/case                     $28.98   #433-4112 No Bid Diversey   12/23oz               $77.00      #SCJ04640 no bid

92 Maxithins napkins Hospeco - 250/case                                     $46.70   #MT-4 Hospeco MT-4 - 250/case                             $43.89   #6229256 Hospeco      200/case                                                $53.24   #MT200 No Bid Hospeco - 250/case                        $39.00            # MT-4 Hospeco - 250/case                           $38.95   #MT4 No Bid no bid no bid

93 Tampax tampons P&G - 500/case                                      $62.85   #02500 Hospeco T-500   - 500/case                           $69.41   #5051356 Tampax - 500/case                                     $71.33   #T-500 No Bid Hospeco - 500/case                         $68.00   #HOS T500 Hospeco - 500/case                        $64.95   #T500 No Bid no bid no bid

94 Microfiber cloths - Rubbermaid Microfiber & More   288/case                              $142.18   #C12B RM 1820579  12x12                                                         $0.44 each ($126.72/288)  #4582980 No Bid No Bid No Bid RM - 288/case                                   $198.72   #1820579 No Bid Golden Star      12/pk            $18.32    #GSIIMIC16XBG no bid

95 Multi-fold towels Right Choice - 250/pack, 16/case         $17.05   #78000012 Westcraft WC4100N - 16pks/250/case       $17.68   #7800424 No Bid No Bid Nittany - 4000/case                          $18.95   #MFN4000 No Bid No Bid Georgia Pacific    4000/cs      $28.87    #JAM23304 no bid

96 Kitchen roll towels Marcal - 30 rolls/case                           $19.55   #06350 Westcraft WC5501 - 30 rolls/case                     $25.12   #7800430 Vondrehle - 30rolls/80sheets                                 $33.42   #HT102A No Bid Tork - 30/case                                  $22.95   #1990 No Bid No Bid Essity   30rls/cs                     $24.98    #BAY41859 no bid

97 12 oz Foam Cup Dart - 1000/case                            $59.86   #12J12 Dart 12J12  - 1000/case                  $63.80     #7469873 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid no bid no bid

98 Doodlebug cleaning brushes No Bid 3M 4020                                                         $38.43   #7480697 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid no bid no bid

99 Vacuum Bags – Hoover Hoover - 10/pack                                   $34.64   #AH10170 Hoover Insight  - 10/pack                                    $18.17   #4850642 No Bid No Bid Hoover - 10/package                        $44.009   #440001915 No Bid No Bid no bid no bid

100 Vacuum Bags - RICCAR RICCAR - 12/pack                                      $17.44   #1436-12 Green Kleen  GKRIC80 type B Simplicity - 10/pack                                                $6.25   #7463330 No Bid No Bid Riccar   9/pack                                       $12.00      #8000 No Bid No Bid no bid no bid

101 Vacuum Bags - Sebo No Bid Windsor 5300 - 10/pack                              $15.79   #5147652 No Bid No Bid Sebo 370  - 9/pack                                 $10.95   #370 No Bid No Bid no bid no bid

102 Swiffer Wet Jet Mop Starter Kit P&G - 2/case                                         $57.86   #92811 PGC Swiffer 92811 - 2/case                                         $57.99   #7465569 No Bid No Bid P&G - 2/case                                $58.00   #PGC92811CT No Bid No Bid no bid no bid

103 Swiffer Wet Jet Cleaning Solution Refill P&G - 4/case                                         $24.62   #77810 PGC Swiffer 77810  - 4/case                                        $24.07   #8054812 No Bid No Bid P&G - 4/case                                    $24.00   #PGC77133 No Bid No Bid no bid no bid

104 Swiffer Wet Jet Mopping Pad Refill P&G - 24/box  4/case                                        $61.36   #08443 PGC Swiffer 08443 - 4/case                                      $57.98   #74636080 No Bid No Bid P&G - 24/box                                 $18.00 ($72.00/case)   #PGC08443 No Bid No Bid no bid no bid

105 Bleach 8.25% Clorox - 3/case                                    $21.20   #30966 Clorox 121oz.     Germicidal 8.25%  $7.04    # 4779723 No Bid No Bid HI-LO    5 gal                                         $39.00     #825 No Bid No Bid Clorox   3/121oz                 $19.88/cs    LAGCLO30966 no bid

106 Gray - 28 Qt Plastic Garbage Can Impact                                                         $7.26     7702-5 RM 2956      gray                                       $5.16        #3442524 No Bid No Bid No Bid RM  12ea/case                                       $4.89 ea    #295664 No Bid Rubbermaid   ea                     $8.54    #RUB2956G no bid

107 Gray - 41 Qt Plastic Garbage Can Impact                                                         $11.76    7703-5 RM 2957   gray                                   $8.54     #285900 No Bid No Bid No Bid RM  12ea/case                                       6.99 ea    #295764 No Bid no bid no bid

108 Nitrile - PF Exam grade gloves Prime Source - 100/box                          $6.95   #75000765
Safety Zone blue    100/box 10bx/case   $8.97 (S,M,XL)   $19.20 (L)                          S - 9617506;  M - 

9634418;                    XL - 9634419  
Main Street    5mil    1000                        $98.54    #MS61223 No Bid MSC   10 boxes  100/carton              $49.00   #21081-999 Hospeco    100/bx, 10bx/carton                 $109.90     #GLN106F-Size

AdvanCare 100ct/bx, 

10bx/case     $59.99    

ANMB1000

no bid
SheildLine    1000/case                   $62.00   Sm - SHL-

50523; M - SHL-50524;  Lg -- SHL-50525: XL - SHL-50526

109 KC WYPALL Blue KC   2240/ Case                                       $38.15     #05123 KC Wypall L10 blue   10pks/case            $39.27     # 7458964 No Bid No Bid KCC    224/pack   10/carton              $60.00    # 05123 No Bid No Bid no bid no bid

110 WYPALL L10 White KC   18/125 pack                                       $109.36     #05320 KC L10 white     18bx/case                         $75.81      #7459079 No Bid No Bid KCC     125/box   18boxes/case        $149.00   #05320 No Bid No Bid no bid no bid


