
Item # Item Name All Pro Supply CPS Ferguson Hillside Maintenance Supply Mailender

1 Carpet Spotter
Franklin - 32oz/12 per case                  

$29.98    #F374012

Proline - 15/case                                    

$36.70   #PRL03446

Claire - 20oz can                                   

$3.03   #7472930
No Bid No Bid

2 Lysol disinfectant spray – Lysol Only
Chase - 12/case                                      

$28.20      #4334104

Lysol - 12/case                                       

$74.78   #RAC74828CT

Spartan - 12/20oz/case                       

$38.39   #5051495

Lysol - 12/19oz/case                             

$97.33   #10325700/74276
No Bid

3 KC Instant Hand Sanitizer Gel
KC - 2/case                                          

$72.20     #91590

Betco - 1G                                              

$17.11   #BET7960400

KC - 1200ml, 2/case                               

$60.01   #7514827
No Bid No Bid

4 Lysol Disinfecting Wipes
Lysol - 6 canisters/case                       

$33.20     #RB77182

Lysol                                                       

$5.09   #RAC99716EA

Lysol - flat pack, 80 wipes/pack          

$5.56   #9055421

Lysol - 6/110/case                              

$48.27   #179740/78849
No Bid

5 Bleach
Sunbrite - 6G/case                              

$15.36    #SB110016

Pure Bright - 6/case                               

$18.46   #KIKBLEACH6

Champion 6% - 1G                                

$1.70   #7483694

Clorox - 3/1                                            

$18.69   #10109300/30966
No Bid

6 Mr. Clean Magic Eraser – Original
P&G - 36/case                                     

$36.60   #79009

Mr. Clean - 6/6 count (36)                   

$30.00   #PGC79009CT

Mr. Clean - 36/case                              

$33.39   #7962685

P&G - 6/6                                              

$34.25   #117139/79009

P&G - 6/6 (36 total)                         

$32.20   #79009

7 Cone Bowl Mop
Better Brush                                         

$0.68    #280712

Genuine Joe - 25/ct                              

$1.16 each   #GJO85150

Impact                                                     

$1.51   #207233

Impact                                                    

$4.20   #107866/3600
No Bid

8 Toilet Bowl Cleaner
Franklin - 32oz/12 per case                  

$17.94   #F270012

Betco - 12/case                                     

$24.72   #BET0751200

Spartan - 12qt/case                              

$19.20   #7575514

ProLink - 12/qt                                      

$41.44   #159639/B14153

Spartan - 12qt/case                          

$18.99   #7116-03

9 Chewing Gum Remover
Chase - 12/case                                      

$25.36   #4334107

Diversey - 12/case                                

$26.65   #DIV95628817

Claire - 12oz can                                       

$2.32   #5051304

ProLink - 12/case                                 

$45.76   #106795/CA002
No Bid

10 TIDE Laundry Detergent
P&G - 15/case                                     

$93.15   #27782

Tide - 20oz, 15/case                              

$79.34   #PGC27782

Tide - 6/20oz box/case                        

$33.49   #8053908
No Bid

Tide - 2/143/oz                                  

$47.60   #85006

11 Furniture Polish
Chase - 12/case                                  

$29.46   #4334109

Claire - 12/20oz/case                             

$40.88   #CCAC811

Claire - 20oz can                                  

$2.76   #5051303

ProLink - 12/19oz                                

$63.20   #106801/YA006
No Bid

12 Stainless Steel Cleaner
Chase - 12/case                                   

$28.38   #4334111

Claire - 12/20oz/case                             

$54.42   #CL841

Claire - 20oz can                                   

$3.96   #5051308

ProLink - 12/18oz                               

$51.68   #106778/KA006
No Bid

13 Absorbent Powder
Nilodor Nilogel - 6/case                       

$41.80   #NL8NLC

Fresh Products - 24/12oz/case            

$31.99   #FP614SSLEFS

Hospeco - 12/16oz/case                      

$47.64   #7482877
No Bid No Bid

14 Graffiti Remover
Chase - 12/case                                   

$45.90   #4334105

Betco - 12/15oz/case                           

$52.86   #BET0152300

Claire - 20oz can                                   

$3.28   #5051287
No Bid No Bid

15 Floor Stripper
Fuller - 5G container                            

$28.90   #9555

Betco - 4/1gal/case                               

$58.35   #BET8880400

Spartan - 5G pail                                   

$33.55   #7481055

P&G - 5G                                              

$77.67   #10275700/64844
No Bid

16 Floor Finish
Fuller - 5G container                            

$57.80   #9655

Betco - 5G each                                     

$53.30   #BET6050500

Spartan - 5G pail                                  

$67.07   #5051584

P&G Presence - 5G                                       

$75.66   #222926/70025
No Bid

17 Terrazzo Floor Finish
Franklin - 5G container                          

$57.25   #F139026

Betco - 5G each                                   

$78.24   #BET6060500

Spartan - 5G pail                                    

$66.06   #5051581
No Bid No Bid

18 Restorer
Franklin - 4G/case                                  

$29.84   #F455822

Betco - 4/1gal/case                               

$66.92   #BET6180500

Spartan - 5G pail                                  

$57.11   #7438766

ProLink - 12/qt                                     

$46.44   #10124500/B14095
No Bid

19 Vacuum Bags - Windsor
Windsor - 10/pack                                   

$12.75   #WI-5300

Windsor - 100/box                                

$196.65   #WGB254082

Windsor - 10/pack                               

$18.95   #5147652
No Bid No Bid

20 Vacuum Bags - HEPA Bags
Panasonic - 3/pack                               

$1.75   #PR-1471

Panasonic - 100/box                            

$88.95   #WCB254042

Panasonic Type U - 3/pack                    

$2.17   #7463776
No Bid No Bid

21 Stripper Pads 20”  BLACK
ACS - 5/case                                        

$13.10   #72-20

Prime Source - 5/case                          

$14.95   #PRS75004451

3M - 5/case                                          

$13.02   #7256033

ProLink - 5/case                                  

$20.85   #108533/FS120K
No Bid

22 Scrubbing  Pads 20” green
ACS - 5/case                                        

$13.10   #55-20

Prime Source - 5/case                          

$14.95   #PRS75004452

3M - 5/case                                       

$13.02   #7068325

ProLink - 5/case                                 

$22.93   #231324/FS620A
No Bid

23 Scrubbing Pads 20” blue
ACS - 5/case                                         

$13.10   #53-20

Prime Source - 5/case                           

$12.75   #PS75004450

3M - 5/case                                           

$13.02   #7178311

ProLink - 5/case                                 

$20.87   #108532/FS320A
No Bid

24 Polishing Pads 20” tan or white
ACS - 5/case                                         

$13.10   #41-20

Prime Source - 5/case                           

$14.90   #PRS75004448

3M - 5/case                                          

$13.02   #7178315

ProLink - 5/case                                   

$20.87   #108519/FB620K
No Bid



25 Buffing Pads 20” red
ACS - 5/case                                          

$13.10   #51-20

Prime Source - 5/case                           

$14.90   #PRS75004453

3M - 5/case                                         

$13.02   #7068320

ProLink - 5/case                                    

$20.87   #108524/FB520K
No Bid

26 Burnishing Pads 20” natural
ACS - 5/case                                         

$13.10   #35-20

Prime Source - 5/case                          

$14.20   #PRS75004399

3M - 5/case                                          

$13.02   #7178305

Ponko - 5/case                                       

$137460/FB120A
No Bid

27 Latex gloves
Safety Zone - 100/box                          

$9.37   #GRDR-1-T

Prime Source - 100/box                           

$10.17   #CPSGLOVEXL

Westcraft Vinyl PF - 100/box                   

$9.03  M, L, XL
No Bid No Bid

28 Toilet Paper - NOVA 4530 Only
Nova - 96 rolls/case                              

$30.94   #NV4535

CPS/Right Choice - 96 rolls/case       

$35.72   #CPSBT500

Westcraft - 96 rolls/case                     

$37.62   #7800432

ProLink - 96/500                                 

$33.63   #BL1007D
No Bid

29
Toilet Paper BAYWEST large rolls (HHS)  

Only

Nittany - 12 rolls/case                          

$16.25   #5206

Tork - 12/case                                        

$34.35   #R-14104402
No Bid

Vondrehle - 36/900                               

$36.88   #10406800/300HC

Baywest - 36/865                      $37.87   

#161990

30 Roll Towels
Nittany - 6 rolls/case                           

$17.35   #6800EN

Tork - 6/carton                                        

$37.91   #SCA290088

Westcraft - 6 rolls/case                        

$22.06   #7800426

ProLink - 6/800                                   

$18.60   #BC1004D
No Bid

31 Roll Towels - BAYWEST  Only No Bid
Tork - 6/carton                                      

$41.59   #R-14100489
No Bid No Bid

Baywest - 6/800'/case                    

$33.25   #8031300

32 GOJO luxury hand wash
GOJO - 2/case                                        

$56.58   #5262-02

GOJO - 2/case, 2000ml each                

$50.39   #GOJ526202

GOJO - 2/case, 2000ml                       

$53.64   #7104437
No Bid

GOJO - 2/case                                 

$37.92   #5262-02

33 GOJO dispenser
GOJO                                                         

$15.50   #5255-06

GOJO - 6/case                                         

$99.60   #GJO527106

GOJO                                                       

$10.64   #5161704
No Bid GOJO - Free w/soap purchase

34 Scotch-Brite pad
Primesource - 10/pack                         

$4.86   #75004161

Scotch Brite 3M - 80/case                    

$26.26   #MMM59166

3M - 40/pack                                         

$14.18   #4871651
No Bid No Bid

35 WAVE urinal screen – Fresh Products
Fresh - 10/box                                      

$17.90   #3UDS

Fresh Products - 10/box                         

$17.70   #FRSWE10AC

HP/Fresh - 12/box                               

$20.61   #7482498

Fresh - 2/pack                                         

$3.88   #208474/3WDS-F
No Bid

36 Garbage Can Liners  30x36 - Black
Noramco - 200/case                             

$19.46   #T-3036-XH

Heritage Bag - 250/case                      

$25.16   #HERZ664OVKR01

Westcraft - 250/case                           

$27.39   #5025025

ProLink - 250/case                              

$17.93   #10338500/LSR3036HB-C

Revolution - 250/case                      

$16.35   #PC39MRN

37 Garbage Can Liners  38x58 - Black
Noramco - 100/case                             

$27.34   #T-3858-XKH

Heritage Bag - 150/case                       

$37.14   #HERZ660WKR01

Westcraft - 100/case                            

$30.84   #5025067

ProLink - 150/case                               

$31.69   #108414/TB223860

Revolution - 100/case                        

$17.45   #PC58100BK

38 Garbage Can Liners 38x58 CLEAR
Noramco - 150/case                            

$27.25   #R386022N

Heritage Bag - 100/case                        

$40.50   #HERH765BAC

Westcraft - 100/case                          

$37.05   #5025058

ProLink - 150/case                             

$31.69   #108415/TN223860

Revolution - 100/case                      

$17.45   #PC58100N

39 Red Wipers
KC - 200/case                                      

$29.15   #41029

KC - 200/case                                       

$26.70  #KCC41029

KC - 4 packs/case                               

$27.12   #1282846
No Bid No Bid

40 Blue Wipers
KC - 160/case                                      

$26.35   #41041

KC - 160/case                                     

$24.40   #KCC41041

KC - 160/case                                    

$24.08   #8116687
No Bid No Bid

41 Steel Janitor Dust Pans
Fuller                                                      

$3.88   #39312

Janico                                                   

$4.67   #JAN1092

Impact                                                    

$4.26   #6169288
No Bid No Bid

42 Lobby Broom
Fuller                                                      

$4.32   #6415

RM                                                          

$7.74   #RCP637400BK

RM                                                         

$3.03   #3442639

ProLink                                                 

$4.56   #106541/SB003
No Bid

43 Lobby Dustpan
Better Brush                                         

$6.79   #410112

RM                                                          

$16.37   #RCP253100BK

RM                                                       $7.79   

#3441903

Nexstep                                                 

$10.56   #110498/96208
No Bid

44 Warehouse Broom (Corn)
Better Brush                                           

$6.45   #432033

Prime Source                                          

$29.12   #PSRB4066PK

Carlisle                                                  

$8.62   #7472190

ProLink                                               $7.59   

#109429/CB005
No Bid

45 Stiff Polypropylene Floor Sweep
Fuller                                                      

$7.68   #3CT-124

RM - 12/case                                                          

$198.54   #RCP9B17MARD21

RM                                                        

$15.87   #807039
No Bid No Bid

46 Aluminum handle
Fuller                                                      

$3.45   #808C

Unger                                                        

$15.68   #UNGAL140

RM                                                            

$6.99   #3441518
No Bid No Bid

47 Mop Bucket
Rubbermaid                                          

$79.98   #7580-88

RM                                                             

$74.18   #RCP768000YW

RM                                                         

$50.70   #3442342

Nexstep                                               

$68.87   #222558/96975
No Bid

48 Wet Mop Head(Web Foot)
Rubbermaid                                          

$12.89   #A112

Zephyr - 12/case                                    

$65.11   #ZEP28232

RM                                                         

$4.13  No part #
No Bid No Bid

49 Folding Wet Floor Sign
Better Brush                                           

$5.98   #150325

Zephyr                                                        

$6.87   #ZEP45100

RM                                                         

$6.55   #3441797

ProLink                                                  

$9.15   #123443/WFC525
No Bid



50 Side gate mop handle
Janico                                                     

$12.32   #3201

Janico                                                   

$10.99   #JAN3201

RM                                                          

$8.40   #3441730
No Bid No Bid

51 Floor finish mop head
Tuway - 12/case                                     

$40.20   #FM20-1

Zephyr                                                      

$43.30   #ZEPH20516

Golden Star                                            

$3.07   #7464639

ProLink                                                 

$4.17   #106009/W6420
No Bid

52 SS squeegees
Better Brush                                           

$3.94   #260414

Unger                                                       

$14.56   #UNGPR350

Unger                                                    

$13.73   #6230451
No Bid No Bid

53 Feminine Napkin Container
Impact                                                    

$14.35   #1102

Bobrick                                                     

$27.58   #BOB270

RM                                                          

$18.91   #3441852
No Bid No Bid

54 Feminine Napkin Liner bags
Impact - 250/case                                 

$22.32   #1101

Hospeco - 500/case                               

$15.93   #HOSKL

Hospeco - 250/case                              

$13.30   #5051351

Hospeco - 500/case                              

$21.55   #169203/260
No Bid

55 Health care bags
National - 100/case                               

$36.25   #NP SL404612

Hospeco - 500/case                             

$56.04   #HERA4823PR

Westcraft - 250/case                          

$20.81   #7048502
No Bid No Bid

56 Brute Garbage Cans  44G
Impact                                                    

$38.70   #7744-3

Genuine Joe                                             

$30.93   #GJO11581

RM                                                        

$25.72   #3442792
No Bid

Brute                                                  

$25.60   #2643-60

57 Brute Garbage Cans    55G
Impact                                                    

$67.65   #7755-3

Genuine Joe                                           

$57.11   #GJO00246

RM                                                         

$31.44   #287337
No Bid

Brute                                                

$31.29   #2655

58 Brute Container Lid  44G
Impact                                                   

$15.98   #7745-3

RM                                                          

$17.67   #RCP264560BK

RM                                                         

$8.83   #3442165
No Bid

Brute                                                 

$8.95   #2645

59 Brute Container Lid  55G
Impact                                                     

$24.97   #7756-3

RM                                                          

$36.68   #RCP265400GY

RM                                                        

$11.30   #3442358
No Bid

Brute                                                 

$11.25   #2654

60 28 Quart Garbage Cans
Impact                                                   

$5.89   #7702-3

Genuine Joe                                            

$3.25   #SPR02160

RM                                                         

$4.03   #3441831
No Bid

RM                                                     

$4.15   #2956

61 41 Quart Garbage Cans
Impact                                                    

$8.36   #7703-3

Boardwalk                                                

$6.12   #BWK41QTWBBLA

RM                                                       $6.18   

#3442640
No Bid

RM                                                     

$6.25   #2957

62
Doodlebug Cleaning System Pad Holder 

Kit

3M                                                           

$41.33   #6472
Discontinued No Bid No Bid No Bid

63 Doodlebug Orange Pad Holder Kit
3M                                                           

$41.33   #6472

3M - 4/case                                           

$140.11   #MMM08542

3M                                                           

$25.85   #1446738
No Bid No Bid

64 Doodlebug White Pad
ACS - 5/box                                          

$4.20   #621

3M - 20/case                                           

$43.44   #MMM08003

3M - 5/pack                                         

$7.19   #5051898
No Bid No Bid

65 Doodlebug Blue Pad
ACS - 5/box                                          

$4.20   #626

3M - 20/case                                          

$43.44   #MMM08005

3M - 5/pack                                      $7.19   

#7210419
No Bid No Bid

66 Doodlebug Brown Pad
ACS - 5/box                                            

$4.20   #631

3M - 20/case                                         

$35.60   #MMM08004

3M - 5/pack                                          

$7.19   #5051920

ProLink - 5/case                                    

$5.07   #107761/FUP02 - ADB
No Bid

67 Doodlebug High Strip Pad
3M - 10/box                                          

$35.45   #8550

3M - 10/case                                           

$29.45   #MMM05241

3M - 10/pack                                        

$29.78   #5051919
No Bid No Bid

68 Swiffer 360 Duster Kit
P&G - 12case                                       

$37.60   #16942

P&G - 12/case                                        

$28.70   #PGC16942CT

P&G - 12/case                                    

$36.25   #7465830

P&G - 12/pack                                     

$33.77   #199047/16942
No Bid

69 Swiffer 360 Duster/Extendable Handle
P&G - 6/case                                          

$57.84   #82074

P&G - 6/case                                         

$50.50   #PGC82074CT

P&G - 6/case                                          

$53.09   #4442461

P&G - 6/pack                                         

$57.00   #129011/82074
No Bid

70 Swiffer 360 Duster Refills
P&G - 36/case                                     

$38.20   #16944

P&G - 24/case                                        

$31.96   #PGC21620CT

P&G - 4 packs/case                               

$33.21   #7311489

P&G - 4/6                                               

$36.86   #199048/16944
No Bid

71 Dust Mopping Pad  24”
Tuway - 12/case                                     

$61.64    #MFG-24FR

RM                                                        

$19.89   #RCPQ42600GR

Tuway - 12/case                                     

$61.08   #SP-TMFG-24FR
No Bid No Bid

72 Pad Holder / RCP Q426 – Tuway only
Tuway - 10/case                                     

$83.44    #24 ALM-FRM

Zephyr                                                      

$2.78   #ZEPH22512

Tuway - 10/case                                   

$82.69   #SP-T24ALM-FRM
No Bid No Bid

73 Dust Mopping Pad  36” - Tuway only
Tuway - 12/case                                     

$82.56    #MFG-36FR

RM                                                          

$20.43   #RCPQ438

Tuway - 12/case                                  

$81.82   #SP-TMFG-36FR
No Bid No Bid

74 Pad Holder / RCP Q438 – Tuway only
Tuway - 10/case                                    

$132.50    #36 ALM-FRM

RM                                                            

$3.62   #RCPQ438

Tuway - 10/case                                  

$133.47   #SP-T36ALM-FRM
No Bid No Bid



75 Dust Mopping Pad  48” - Tuway only
Tuway - 12/case                                    

$102.34    #MFG-48FR

RM                                                         

$25.58   #RCP0449

Tuway - 12/case                                     

$101.40   #SP-TMFG-48FR
No Bid No Bid

76 Pad Holder / RCP Q449 - Tuway
Tuway - 10/case                                    

$157.56    #48 ALM-FRM

Zephyr                                                     

$4.75   #ZEPH09057

Tuway - 10/case                                    

$140.25   #SP-T48ALM-FRM
No Bid No Bid

77 Microfiber Cleaning Cloth 16"x16"
Tuway - 300/case                                  

$165.60    #MFB-74

Microworks - 12/box                              

$8.02   #MIC2502BDZ

HP Textiles - 12/pack                              

$8.90   #5051275

ProLink                                                   

$0.69   #10314800/C16BLU
No Bid

78 Microfiber Wet Mop
MicroFiber & More                                  

$6.75    #BLUE-MD

RM - 6/case                                          

$64.62   #RCPA81206GRE

RM                                                          

$6.23   #4388456
No Bid No Bid

79 Procell AAA Batteries
Duracell - 144/case                               

$53.76    #PC2400BKD

Duracell - 24/box                                   

$6.56   #DURPC2400BKD

Duracell - 24/pack                                

$7.21   #4631243
No Bid No Bid

80 Procell AA Batteries
Duracell - 144/case                               

$55.10    #PC1500BKD

Duracell - 24/box                                  

$6.56   #DURPC1500BKD

Duracell - 24/pack                               

$7.21   #4631240
No Bid No Bid

81 Procell C Batteries
Duracell - 72/case                                 

$58.57    #PC1400

Duracell - 12/box                                 

$8.46   #DURPC1400

Duracell - 12/pack                                  

$8.11   #4631237
No Bid No Bid

82 Procell D Batteries
Duracell - 72/case                                 

$81.26   #PC1300

Duracell - 12/box                                 

$10.79   #DURPC1300

Duracell - 12/pack                                 

$9.76   #4631244
No Bid No Bid

83 Procell 9V batteries
Duracell - 72/case                                  

$113.35   #PC1604BKD

Duracell - 12/box                                   

$13.04   #DURPC1604BKD

Duracell - 12/pack                                  

$16.92   #4631239
No Bid No Bid

84 Tissue Dispenser – 1 roll
San Jamar                                              

$0.00   #R200XC

San Jamar                                              

$10.14   #SJMR200XC

Impact                                                       

$7.35   #7460872
No Bid No Bid

85 Tissue Dispenser – 2 rolls
San Jamar                                              

$26.58   #R260XC

San Jamar                                            

$18.50   #SJMR260XC

Impact                                                   

$12.88   #7461419               
No Bid No Bid

86 Bobrick Dispenser – stainless steel
Bobrick                                                     

$115.55    #B4288

San Jamar                                             

$23.65   #SJMR3500TBK

Bobrick                                                    

$95.16   #4100824
No Bid No Bid

87 Tissue Dispenser – Baywest 3 rolls No Bid
Tork                                                       

$10.59   #TRK565828
No Bid No Bid No cost with Paper

88 Dust Mop Treatment
Chase - 12/case                                      

$29.54   #4385152

Misty - 4/1g/case                                

$76.92   #AMR1003411

Spartan - 4G/case                                 

$26.16   #7485166
No Bid No Bid

89 Steri-Fab
Sterifab - 4G/case                                 

$168.10   #STF4

Claire - 12/case                                      

$44.29   #CLAC006

Sterifab - 4G/case                              

$303.64   #7482767

Noble - Gallon                                        

$46.91   #106304/SFDGAL
No Bid

90 Neutral Floor Cleaner
Fuller - 4G/case                                     

$19.26   #9221

Betco - 4G/case                                     

$55.10   #BET2580400

Spartan - 4G/case                                 

$24.20   #8203123

ProLink - Gallon                                      

$11.36   #156416/B14049
No Bid

91 Baseboard Stripper
Chase - 12/case                                     

$28.76   #4334112

Claire - 12/20oz/case                       

$46.15   #CLAC856

HP/Claire - 12/case                                

$38.60   #7481503

ProLink                                                  

$4.60   #106780/FA003
No Bid

92 Maxithins napkins
HOS - 250/case                                     

$43.56   #MT-4

Hospeco - 250/case                                

$36.21    #HOSTMT4FS

Hospeco - 250/case                             

$31.79   #6229256

200/case                                                

$58.76   #109441/MT200
No Bid

93 Tampax tampons
P&G - 500/case                                      

$62.20   #02500

Hospeco - 500/case                               

$54.66   #HOST500

Hospeco - 500/case                           

$63.71   #5051356

P&G - 500/case                                     

$67.79   #106269/T-500
No Bid

94 Microfiber cloths - Rubbermaid
Microfiber & More                                 

$72.35   #C12B

Microfiber Cloths - 12/case                   

$20.95   #RCP1820579

RM                                                          

$0.52 each   #4582980
No Bid No Bid

95 Multi-fold towels
Right Choice - 250/pack, 16/case         

$15.50   #78000012

KC - 250/pack, 4000/case                 

$26.70   #KCC01801

Westcraft - 16 pks of 250/case       $16.22   

#7800424

ProLink - 4000/case                           

$16.50   #196302/BC1006D
No Bid

96 Kitchen roll towels
Marcal - 30 rolls/case                           

$18.95   #06350

Right Choice - 30/case                             

$20.22   #CPSKT85

Westcraft - 30 rolls/case                     

$22.71   #7800430

Vondrehle - 30/80                                 

$23.25   #T7100/HT102A
No Bid

97 12 oz Foam Cup
Dart - 1000/case                                    

$41.15   #12J2

Dart - 1000/case                                  

$33.63   #DCC12J12

Dart - 1000/case                                  

$39.51   #7469873
No Bid No Bid

98 Doodlebug cleaning brushes
3M                                                          

$45.38   #14020E

3M                                                        

$39.29   #MMM4020

3M                                                          

$36.22   #7480697
No Bid No Bid

99 Vacuum Bags – Hoover
Hoover - 10/pack                                   

$16.77   #44001915

Hoover                                                    

$2.25   #H-440001915

Hoover - 10/pack                                    

$18.17   #4850642
No Bid No Bid



100 Vacuum Bags - RICCAR
RICCAR - 6/pack                                      

$5.65   #RSR-1436

RICCAR - 12/pack                                 

$18.68   #RICCAR8000

Green Kleen - 10 pack                          

$6.25   #7463330
No Bid No Bid

101 Vacuum Bags - Sebo
Windsor - 10/pack                                  

$10.28   #WIR-1460

Sebo - 8/box                                          

$23.00   #S-5093AM

Windsor - 10/pack                              

$20.43   #5147652
No Bid No Bid

102 Swiffer Wet Jet Mop Starter Kit
P&G - 2/case                                         

$55.50   #92811

P&G - 2/case                                      $46.26   

#PGC92811CT

P&G - 2/case                                         

$50.39   #7465569
No Bid No Bid

103
Swiffer Wet Jet Cleaning Solution 

Refill

P&G - 4/case                                         

$22.95   #77810

P&G - 4/case                                    $20.65   

#PGC77133

P&G - 4/case                                        

$20.50   #8054812
No Bid No Bid

104 Swiffer Wet Jet Mopping Pad Refill
P&G - 24/box                                         

$57.08   #08443

P&G - 24/box                                       

$12.81   #PGC08443

P&G - 4/case                                      $53.13   

#74636080
No Bid No Bid

105 Bleach 8.25%
Clorox - 3/case                                    

$19.90   #30966

Pure Bright - 6/case                                

$18.45   #KIKBLEACH6

Champion 6% - 1G                                

$1.70   #7483694
No Bid No Bid



Murphy Supply Company Pyramid School Products
WePak - 12/qts                                 

$26.99   

Chase - 12/18oz/case                      

$34.98   #438-5146

Lysol - 12/case                                

$78.00   #3100.0113

Chase - 12/16.5oz/case                   

$31.98   #433-4104

KC - 2/case                                      

$58.00   #91600

Scott - 2/1200ml/case                       

$73.98   #KCC91600

Lysol - 6/80                                      

$26.40   #9200.5703

Lysol - 80/tub, 6 tubs/case               

$34.98   #RAC77182CT

Austin - 6/1G                                   

$16.94   #1500.0101
No Bid

P&G - 36/case                                 

$29.50   #79009

P&G - 6/6 case                               

$32.99   #PGC79009

Cone Bowl Mop                                

$1.19   #1700.01

Tolco - 100/case                               

$109.00   #280105

MSC - 12/qts                                     

$16.75   #1800.050
No Bid

MSC - 12 can/case                           

$23.00

Chase - 12/12oz/case                     

$24.89   #433-4107

P&G 20oz box                                   

$7.99   #PGC27782

Tide - 6/20oz/case                            

$34.98   #PGC81244

Chase - 12 cans/case                      

$30.00   #5400.0121

Chase - 12/20oz/case                       

$28.98   #433-4109

Chase - 12/20oz/case                     

$26.74

Chase - 12/20oz/case                       

$27.98   #433-4111

Fresh - 6/case                                   

$32.34 

Fresh - 6/12oz/case                            

$32.32   #6-14-SS

Chase - 12/20/case                        

$39.00

Chase - 12/20oz/case                       

$40.92   #433-4105

Betco - 5G                                        

$27.94   #10405-00
No Bid

Hard As Diamond - 5G                       

$49.00   #4900.5012
No Bid

Iron Man - 5G                                  

$58.00   #4900
No Bid

Flash Back - 12/qts                          

$44.00
No Bid

Windsor - 10/pack                           

$14.95   #8840.210
No Bid

Panasonic - 9/pack                           

$10.95   #U-3
No Bid

Americo - 5/case                             

$14.98   #400120

ACS - 5/case                                   

$11.92   #0010120

Americo - 5/case                            

$14.98   #400320

ACS - 5/case                                    

$11.92   #0010320

Americo - 5/case                           

$14.98   #400420

ACS - 5/case                                   

$11.92   #0010420

Americo - 5/case                                

$14.98   #401220

ACS - 5/case                                    

$11.92   #0010820



Americo - 5/case                               

$14.98   #404420

ACS - 5/case                                        

$11.92   #0010520

Americo - 5/case                            

$15.98   #401720

ACS - 5/case                                      

$11.92   #0050120

MSC - 100/box                                 

$14.95   #5610.012100
No Bid

NOVA - 96 rolls/case                        

$31.74   #8600.245
No Bid

Baywest - 36 rolls/case                     

$37.90   #61990
No Bid

MSC - 6/800'/case                            

$16.98   #RK800
No Bid

No Bid No Bid

GOJO - 2000ml/2/case                    

$44.00   #5262-02
No Bid

GOJO                                                 

$17.00
No Bid

No Bid
ACS - 10/box, 4 box/case                  

$3.75/pack of 10  #5088

Fresh - 10/box                                 

$15.45

Fresh - 10/box, 6 boxes/case           

$15.42/box of 10  #WDS-SA

200/case                                         

$12.87   #UC-202RL
No Bid

100/case                                           

$15.99   #UC201TXHRL
No Bid

MSC - 150/case                               

$22.76   #SN386022N
No Bid

KC - 50 per box/4 boxes per case      

$26.00   #KCC41029

Wypall - 50/box, 4 boxes/case           

$28.99  #KCC41029

KC - 160/case                                 

$21.69   #41041

Wypall - 160/case                            

$24.79   #CC41041

Impact                                                  

$3.50   #4212

Impact - 12/case                               

$46.44   #4212

MSC                                                   

$2.74

ABCO - 12/case - Full case only                                  

$2.98 each ($35.76)  #00321NB

Impact                                               

$7.74   #2007

Impact - 6/case - Full case only         

$6.98 each ($41.88)  #2600

MSC                                                $5.74   

#932C

ABCO - 12/case - Full case only        

$6.57 each ($78.84)  #BRZ85E

ABCO                                                

$14.00

Better Brush - 12/case - Full case only 

$8.98 each ($107.76)  #101124

ABCO                                                

$6.74   #AL-57

RM - 12/case - Full case only           

$6.79 eacg ($81.48)  #FG6355

RM                                                    

$99.00   #7580-88YEL

RM                                                      

$50.68  #758088YEL

ABCO - 12/case                                

$68.00   #SECO M

ABCO - 12/case                                 

$67.68   #LMZ04MDWG

RM                                                    

$8.74   #6112-77

ABCO - 10/case - Full case only                                   

$6.64 each ($66.40)  #WS0001



ABCO                                                 

$7.75

RM - 12/case - Full case only           

$8.09 ($97.08)  #H146

ABCO                                                

$4.95   #8960.624

ABCO - 12/case - Full case only        

$3.09 ($37.08)  #LM203MCSNB

No Bid
Better Brush - 12/case - Full case only 

$4.99 each ($59.88)  #260414

Hospeco                                            

$17.99   #R06140

Impact - 4/case - Full case only       

$18.69 each ($74.76)  #1100

RCP - 500/case                                 

$19.74   #260

Hospeco - 500/case                          

$19.65   #KL260

No Bid No Bid

RCP                                                    

$28.99   #2643

RM - 4/case - Full case only                                       

$39.98 each ($159.92)   #2643GRA

RCP                                                   

$44.00   #2655

RM - 3/case - Full case only               

$45.98 ($137.94)  #2655GRA

RCP                                                   

$13.99   #2645-60

RM - 4/case - Full case only               

$8.82 each ($35.28)  #2645-6064

RCP                                                

$18.99   #2654-6RA

RM - 3/case - Full case only              

$11.29 each ($33.87)  #7654GRA

RM                                                    

$4.49   #2956

RM - 12/case - Full case only             

$4.01 each ($48.12)  #2956BLA

RCP                                                   

$7.43   #2957

RM - 2/case - Full case only                

$6.14 each ($12.28)  #2957BLA

No Bid
ACS - 4 kits/case - Full case only      

$8.98 kit ($35.92)  #619-4

No Bid
ACS - 4 kits/case - Full case only     

$8.98 kit ($35.92)  #619-4

No Bid
ACS - 5/box, 4 boxes/case                

$14.76   #621

No Bid
ACS - 5/box, 4 boxes/case                

$14.76   #626

No Bid
ACS - 5/box, 4 boxes/case                 

$14.76   #631

No Bid
ACS - 5/box, 4 boxes/case                   

$14.76   #672

P&G - 12/case                                

$35.00   #PGC 16942CT

P&G - 12 kits/case                            

$29.72   #PGC16942

P&G - 6/case                                     

$49.00   #82074CT

P&G - 6 kits/case                             

$47.98   #PGC16942

P&G - 6 per box/36 per case           

$54.00   #16944

P&G - 36/case                                   

$55.98   #PGC21620BX(x6)

Tuway                                               

$5.22   #24FR

Tuway - 12/case - Full case only      

$5.21 each ($62.52)   #MFG24FR

Tuway - must order 10                                          

$8.66 each($86.60)   #24ALM-FRM

Tuway - 10/case - Full case only       

$8.19 each ($81.90)  #24ALM-FRM

Tuway - must order 12                     

$6.89 each ($82.68)  #MFG-36R

Tuway - 12/case - Full case only      

$6.84 each ($82.08)  #MFG-36FR

Tuway - must order 10                     

$12.00 ($120.00)  #36ALM-FRM

Tuway - 10/case - Full case only    

$13.22 ea ($132.20)  #36ALM-FRM



Tuway - must order 12                   $8.53 

($102.36)  #MFG-48FR

Tuway - 12/case - Full case only    $8.49 

ea ($101.88)  #MFG-48FR

Tuway - must order 10               $19.95 

($199.50)  #48-ALM-FRM

Tuway - 10case - Full case only        

$15.82 ea ($158.20)  #48ALM-FRM

No Bid
Monarch - 12/case - Full case only     

$0.48 ea ($5.76)  #M915107-color

Tuway - 12/case                            

$288.00

Monarch - 12/case - Ful case only   

$6.99 ea ($18.99)  #M830018B

Procell - 24/box                               

$8.00   #DURPC 2400BKD

Duracell - 24/box                              

$6.96   #PC2400BKD

Procell - 24/box                                

$7.94   #DURPC 1500BKD

Duracell - 24/box                               

$6.96   #PC1500BKD

Procell - 12/box                              

$8.49   #DURPC 1400

Duracell - 12/box                               

$7.68   #PC1400

Procell - 12/box                               

$10.50   #DURPC 1300

Duracell - 12/box                              

$10.98   #PC1300

Procell - 12/box                                 

$16.50   #DURPC 1604BKD

Duracell - 12/box                              

$16.80   #PC1604BKD

No Bid
Impact - 12/case - Full case only       

$6.83 ea ($81.96)  #2500

No Bid
Iimpact - 12/case - Full case only       

$11.99 ea ($143.88)  #2501

Bobrick                                             

$69.00   #4288

Bobrick - 12/case - Full case only     

$99.98 ($1199.76)  #B4288

Baywest                                              

$10.00   #80300
No Bid

No Bid No Bid

Steri-Fab - 4-1G                               

$164.00   #6100.1551
No Bid

MSC - 4-1G                                       

$17.94   #4800.4000
No Bid

Chase - 12/20/case                        

$28.74

Chase - 12/20oz/case                     

$29.98   #433-4112

Hospeco - 250/case                        

$27.95

Hospeco - 250/case                           

$29.98   #MT4

Hospeco - 500/case                         

$60.00   #T500

Hospeco - 500/case                        

$56.98   #T500

RM - 24/pack blue                            

$18.00   #RCP1820579

RM - 288/case                                   

$138.24   #1820579

Nittany - 4000/case                          

$15.50   #MFN4000
No Bid

Tork - 30/case                                  

$19.74   #1990

Boardwalk - 85/roll, 30 rolls/case     

$25.98   #BWK6272

No Bid
Dart - 25/40/case                           

$40.89   #DCC12J12

No Bid
RM - 6/case - Full case only              

$13.96 ea ($83.76)  #FG6337

Hoover - 10/package                        

$38.79   #440001915
No Bid



No Bid No Bid

Sebo - 10/pack                                 

$14.95   #5093AM
No Bid

P&G - 2/case                                $48.00   

#PGC92811CT

P&G - 2/case                                 $47.99   

#PGC92811CT
P&G - 4/case                                    

$19.75   #PGC77133

P&G - 4/case                                     

$19.98   #PGC77133
P&G - 24/box                                 

$15.00   #PGC08443

P&G - 24/box, 4 boxes/case           

$51.24   #PGC08443
MSC - 3/case                                   

$20.00   #30966

Clorox - 3/121oz/case - Must order 10 

cases    $29.98 ($299.80)


