BID DUE DATE: March 30, 2017 @ 2:00 PM at Fort Thomas Independent Schools Central Office

BID TABULATION

OWNER: Fort Thomas Independent Board of Education

PROJECT: Custodial Supplies

ltem Item Name ALL PRO HILLYARD HP PRODUCTS MAILENDER MURPHY

#

1 Carpet Cleaner Franklin Hillyard Spartan NO BID Pro Rug Shampoo
G 4G/cs 12agt/cs 4-1G/cs
$10.33 $53.00 $19.47 $24.00

2 Carpet Spotter Franklin Hillyard Claire NO BID We Pak
12qgt/cs 12gt/cs 12-200z/cs 12/qt/cs
$30.96 $53.76 $29.69 $23.99

3 Lysol disinfectant spray Franklin Hillyard HP Spartan Lysol
12/cs 12/cs 12-190z/cs 12-17 oz 12/case
$37.14 $34.92 $23.13 $36.75/cs $65.98

4 KC Instant Hand Sanitizer Gel | NO BID Hillyard 2/cs 2/cs $29.95 ea

1000m. 4/cs $32.62/cs $33.00
$54.73

5 Lysol Disinfecting Wipes Lysol Hillyard Lysol Wipes Plus Lysol
80ct 6/cs 75ct 6/cs 80ct 6/cs 6-75ct 80ct 6/cs
$29.87 $20.94 $36.04 $18.00 $26.50

6 GOJO Purell Wipes 270/6¢s Hillyard 270ct 6/cs 270ct/6¢cs 270ct/6¢cs
$60.30 85ct 6/cs $57.88 $46.25 $43.95

$48.90

7 Bleach Austin Austin A-1 NO BID Austin
6G/cs 6G/cs 6G/cs 6G/cs
$10.86 $11.47 $7.77 $7.98

8 Mr. Clean Magic Eraser - 24/cs Hillyard 4/pk 6pk/cs IMPACT 4/bx 6bx/cs

ORIGINAL $23.71 24/cs $23.50 24/cs $22.98
$20.94 $18.95

9 Cone Bowl Mop $1.58 ea $1.70 ea $1.38 ea NO BID $1.19 ea

10 Toilet Bowl! Cleaner Franklin Hillyard Spartan Spartan 12qt/cs
12 gt/cs 12qt/cs 12agt/cs 12-320z/cs $16.25
$16.40 $27.36 $17.72 $16.48




ltem Item Name ALL PRO HILLYARD HP PRODUCTS MAILENDER MURPHY
#
N Chewing Gum Remover Franklin Hillyard HP NO BID MSC
12/cs 12/cs 12/cs 12/cs
$30.44 $28.32 $21.86 $22.00
12 TIDE Laundry Detergent 200z/15cs 200z 15/cs 200z/15/cs NO BID 200z 15/cs
$76.98 $99.60 $76.57 $77.00
13 Furniture Polish Franklin Hillyard Spartan Spartan Chase
12-180z/cs 12/cs 12/20/cs 12-200z/cs 12/cs
$24.36 $31.32 $29.16 $29.50 $25/00
14 Stainless Steel Cleaner Franklin Hillyard Spartan NO BID Chase
12-180z/cs 12/cs 12/20/cs 12/case
$24.84 $41.16 $40.56 $24.90
15 Absorbent Powder Sweep Fresh HP Fresh Fresh
24-160z/cs 6-120z/cs 24-160z/cs 6-120z/cs 6-140z
$40.62 $28.38 $40.71 $34.75 $39.00
16 DRANO MaxGel 12-320z/cs Hillyard 12-320z/cs NO BID 12qt/cs
$56.40 12qgt/cs $58.80 $59.25
$52.68
17 Graffiti Remover Chase Hillyard HP Spartan Chase
12-17.50z/cs 12/cs 12-200z/cs 12-320z/cs 12-200z/cs
$48.86 $36.30 $33.18 $59.98 $32.25
18 Floor Stripper Franklin/Fuller Hillyard Spartan Spartan Super Stripper
5G 5G 5G 5G 5G
$27.75 $102.10 $28.64 $28.93 $29.98
19 Floor Finish Franklin Hillyard Spartan 5 Star Super Diamond
5G 5G 5G 5G 5G
$47.65 $79.25 $57.81 $46.25 $49.95
20 Terrazzo Floor Finish Franklin Hillyard Spartan Spartan Iron Man
5G 5G 5G 5G 5G
$49.60 $91.63 $56.39 $56.95 $54.00
21 Restorer Franklin Hillyard Spartan Mid Lab Blue Diamond
4-1G/cs 4G/cs 5G 4-1G/cs 5G
$67.00 $48.74 $39.75 $49.00
22 Vacuum Bags - Windsor NO BID 10/pk Windsor NO BID Windsor
$14.70 10/pk 10/pk
$12.59 $9.95




Item Item Name ALL PRO HILLYARD HP PRODUCTS MAILENDER MURPHY

#

23 Vacuum Bags - Panasonic NO BID NO BID Panasonic NO BID Panasonic
3/pk 9/pk
$2.34 $12.95

24 Stripper Pads 20” BLACK Americo Americo 3M Niagara NO BID Americo

5/cs 5/cs 5/cs 5/cs
$13.75 $14.29 $16.12 $13.94

25 Stripper Pads 187 BLACK Americo Americo 3M Niagara NO BID Americo

5/cs 5/cs 5/cs 5/cs
$12.10 $12.33 $13.41 $12.19

26 Scrubbing Pads 20” green Americo Americo 3M Niagara NO BID Americo

5/cs 5/cs 5/cs 5/cs
$13.75 $14.29 $15.67 $13.94

27 Scrubbing Pads 18” green Americo Americo 3M Niagara NO BID Americo

5/cs 5/cs 5/cs 5/cs
$12.10 $12.33 $12.64 $12.19

28 Scrubbing Pads 20” blue Americo Americo 3M Niagara NO BID Americo

5/cs 5/cs 5/cs 5/cs
$13.75 $14.29 $15.67 $13.94

29 Scrubbing Pads 18 ” blue Americo Americo 3M Niagara NO BID Americo

5/cs 5/cs 5/cs 5/cs
$12.10 $12.33 $19.41 $12.19

30 Polishing Pads 20” tan or Americo Americo 3M Niagara NO BID Americo

white 5/cs 5/cs 5/cs 5/cs
$13.75 $14.29 $15.67 $13.94

31 Polishing Pads 18” tan or Americo Americo 3M Niagara NO BID Americo

white 5/cs 5/cs 5/cs 5/cs
$12.10 $12.33 $19.41 $12.19

32 Buffing Pads 20” red Americo Americo 3M Niagara NO BID Americo

5/cs 5/cs 5/cs 5/cs
$13.75 $14.29 $15.67 $13.94

33 Buffing Pads 18” red Americo Americo 3M Niagara NO BID Americo

5/cs 5/cs 5/cs 5/cs
$12.10 $12.33 $19.41 $12.19

34 Burnishing Pads 20” natural Americo Americo 3M Niagara NO BID Americo

5/cs 5/cs 5/cs 5/cs
$13.95 $14.57 $21/30 $14.00

35 Burnishing Pads 18” natural Americo NO BID 3M Niagara NO BID Americo

5/cs 5/cs 5/cs
$12.75 $19.60 $13.95




ltem Item Name ALL PRO HILLYARD HP PRODUCTS MAILENDER MURPHY
#
36 Latex gloves 100/bx 100/bx 100/bx NO BID 100/bx
$3.27 $5.03 $2.89 $3.29
37 Chemical resistant gloves NO BID Tradex Liberty NO BID NO BID
12pr/pk 12pr/pk
$14.04 $11.36
38 Neoprene gloves NO BID NO BID Liberty NO BID NO BID
12pr/pk
$17.18
39 Toilet Paper Nova Nova CAS NO BID Nova
96/cs 96/cs 80/cs 96/cs
$27.05 $27.71 $31.54 $27.50
40 Toilet Paper BAYWEST large | NO BID SCA NO BID Baywest Baywest
rolls (HHS) 12/cs 36/cs 36/cs
$28.50 $37.25 $36.90
41 Roll Towels Nova SCA SCA SCA MSC
800’/6/cs 6/800’ 6/800’ 6/800’ 6/800’
$17.25 $22.74 $17.67 $16.85 $14.94
42 Roll Towels - BAYWEST NO BID SCA NO BID Baywest NO BID
$32.35cs 6/cs
$31.45
43 GOJO luxury hand wash CoOJo Hillyard NO BID GOJO GOJO
2/cs 1250ml 4/cs 2/cs 2/cs
$46.17 $42.09 $34.50 $42.00
44 GOJO dispenser 6/cs Hillyard NO BID Free with soap $16.00 ea
$59.50 Free with soap purchase purchase
45 Scotch-Brite pad Americo NO BID 3M NO BID MCO
60/cs 2/40/cs 80/cs
$16.50 $26.60 $29.00
46 WAVE urinal screen Fresh Fresh Fresh Fresh Fresh
10/box 10/box 12/box 10/box 10/bx
$14.69 $16.14 $19.37 $14/65 $14.74
47 Garbage Can Liners 30x36 Performance + Berry HP Heritage MSC
250/cs 250/cs 250/cs 500/cs 200/case
$26.71 $34.89 $28.24 $23.65 $12.98
No sample No sample
48 Garbage Can Liners 38x58 Performance + Berry Revolution Heritage MSC
150/cs 150/cs 100/cs no 150/cs no 100/cs
$26.57 $34.29 $28.07 sample $26.80 sample $15.00




ltem Item Name ALL PRO HILLYARD HP PRODUCTS MAILENDER MURPHY
#
49 Garbage Can Liners 38x58 Performance + Berry Revolution SAME AS ABOVE MSC
CLEAR 200/cs 200/cs 100/cs no Not clear???? 150/cs
$24.95 $32.15 $19.25 sample $17.24
50 Red Wipers Kimberly Clark NO BID Wypall NO BID Kimberly Clark
200/cs 200/cs 200/cs
$25.53 $18.92 $22.95
51 Blue Wipers Kimberly Clark NO BID Wypall NO BID Kimberly Clark
160/cs 160/cs 160/cs
$23.82 $19.42 $20.98
52 Foodservice Towels Kimberly Clark NO BID Wypall SCA Kimberly Clark
150/cs 150/cs 150/cs 150/cs
$37.47 $25.16 $28.90 $44.00
53 Steel Janitor Dust Pans Fuller Carlisle HP NO BID Impact
$3.00 ea $7.30 ea $3.88 ea $3.00 ea
54 Lobby Broom Fuller Rubbermaid Rubbermaid NO BID MSC
$3.95 ea $8.90 ea $2.11 ea $3.00 ea
55 Lobby Dustpan Fuller Carlisle Rubbermaid NO BID MSC
$8.67 ea $8.67 ea $5.16 ea $8.99 ea
56 Warehouse Broom (Corn) Fuller Crystal Lake Rubbermaid NO BID MSC
$9.65 ea $6.16 ea $3.07 $5.00 ea
57 Stiff Polypropylene Floor Fuller Carlisle Rubbermaid NO BID MSC
Sweep $8.88 ea $16.19 ea $7.28 ea $12.99 ea
58 Aluminum handle Rubbermaid NO BID Rubbermaid NO BID MSC
$14.10 ea $6.12 ea $9.00 ea
59 Mop Bucket NO BID Rubbermaid Rubbermaid IMPACT Rubbermaid
*7580* (wrong) “7570* (wrong) $69.00 7680
$70.30 $26.61 $129.00
60 Wet Mop Head(Web Foot) Rubbermaid Hillyard Rubbermaid NO BID Rubbermaid
$11.35 ea $4.54 ea 6/cs 6/cs
$31.74 $69.00
61 Wet Floor Sign Rubbermaid Rubbermaid Rubbermaid NO BID MSC
$10.62 $10.43 ea $3.94 ea $6.99 ea




Item Item Name ALL PRO HILLYARD HP PRODUCTS MAILENDER MURPHY
#
62 Side gate mop handle NO BID Rubbermaid Rubbermaid NO BID Rubbermaid
$18.04 ea 6.49 ea H146
$16.95 ea
63 Floor finish mop head Fuller Rubbermaid Rubbermaid NO BID ABCO
$8.06 ea $11.93 ea $4.91 ea $4.75 ea
64 Scrub brush Rubbermaid NO BID Rubbermaid NO BID Rubbermaid
12/box $.78 ea $2.99 ea
$31.04
65 SS squeegees NO BID Unger Unger NO BID Unger
$14.66 ea $12.69 ea $13.00 ea
66 Feminine Napkin Container NO BID Rubbermaid Hospeco NO BID AIM
$52.37 ea $18.64 ea $18.00 ea
67 Feminine Napkin Liner bags Rochester Hospeco Hospeco NO BID 250ct
250/cs 250ct 250/cs $12.25
$17.50 $13.50 $12.36
68 Health care bags Heritage NO BID HP NO BID Hospeco
500/cs 250/cs 500/cs
$51.16 $20.31 $35.00
69 Brute Garbage Cans 44G Rubbermaid Rubbermaid Rubbermaid NO BID Rubbermaid
$44.00 ea $43.26 ea $20.67 ea $29.00 ea
70 Brute Garbage Cans 55G Rubbermaid Rubbermaid Rubbermaid NO BID Rubbermaid
$68.00 ea $66.16 ea $21.09 $54.00 ea
71 Brute Container Lid 44G Rubbermaid Rubbermaid Rubbermaid NO BID Rubbermaid
19.83 ea $18.09 ea $7.13 ea $13.00 ea
72 Brute Container Lid 55G Rubbermaid Rubbermaid Rubbermaid NO BID Rubbermaid
$26.04 ea $26.90 ea $7.04 $19.75 ea
73 28 Quart Garbage Cans Rubbermaid Rubbermaid Rubbermaid NO BID Rubbermaid
$5.75 ea $4.96 ea $2.93 ea $4.29 ea
74 41 Quart Garbage Cans Rubbermaid Rubbermaid Rubbermaid NO BID Rubbermaid
$10.35 ea $9.31 ea $5.38 $7.00 ea




ltem Item Name ALL PRO HILLYARD HP PRODUCTS MAILENDER MURPHY

#

75 Doodlebug Cleaning System NO BID NO BID 3M NO BID 3M
4/cs 4/cs
$109.56/cs $98.00

76 Doodlebug Orange Pad NO BID NO BID 3M NO BID 3M

Holder Kit 4/cs 4/cs
$130.60 $134.00

77 Doodlebug White Pad NO BID Hillyard 3M NO BID 3M

10/pk 20/cs 20/cs
$2.58 $26.54 $26.00

78 Doodlebug Blue Pad NO BID NO BID #M NO BID 3M
20/cs 20/cs
$26.54 $26.00

79 Doodlebug Brown Pad NO BID 3M 3M NO BID 3M

5/pk 4pk/cs 20/cs 20/cs
$40.45 $26.20 $26.00

80 Doodlebug High Strip Pad NO BID 3M 3M NO BID 3M

5/cs 40/cs 40/cs
$57.31 $108.55 $98.00

81 Swiffer 360 Duster Kit $35.82/cs NO BID NO BID NO BID 12/cs

$38.00

82 Swiffer 360 $53.46/cs NO BID 6/cs NO BID 6/cs

Duster/Extendable Handle $47.52 $46.00

83 Swiffer 360 Duster Refills NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 36/cs

$54.00

84 Dust Mopping Pad 24~ NO BID NO BID 6/cs NO BID 6/cs

Microfiber $31.08 $37.66

85 Pad Holder / RCP Q426 NO BID NO BID 10/cs NO BID 10/cs
$69.44 $79.00

86 Dust Mopping Pad 36” NO BID NO BID 6/cs NO BID 6/cs

Microfiber $44.25 $44.00

87 Pad Holder / RCP Q438 NO BID NO BID 10/cs NO BID 10/cs

$122.58 $129.00




Item Item Name ALL PRO HILLYARD HP PRODUCTS MAILENDER MURPHY
#
88 Dust Mopping Pad 48” NO BID NO BID 6/cs NO BID 6/cs
Microfiber $56.35 $56.00
89 Pad Holder / RCP Q449 NO BID NO BID 10/cs NO BID 10/cs
$130.45 $129.00
90 Microfiber Cleaning Cloth Fuller NO BID HP NO BID Tu-way
12/box 12/pk 6/pk
$8.25/bx $4.68 $6.99
91 Microfiber Wet Mop NO BID NO BID Rubbermaid NO BID Tu-way
6/cs 12/cs
$30.96 $99.00
92 Microfiber Flexible Dusting NO BID NO BID 10/cs NO BID 10/cs
Wand $46.13 $52.00
93 Microfiber Dusting Sleeve NO BID NO BID 10/cs NO BID 10/cs
$34.69 $38.00
94 Procell AAA Batteries Duracell Energizer Duracell NO BID Duracell
24/bx 24/bx 24/bx 24/bx
$6.84 $16.57 6.46 $6.74
95 Procell AA Batteries Duracell Energizer Duracell NO BID Duracell
24/bx 6bx/cs 24/bx 24/bx 6bx/cs 24/bx 6bx/cs
$39.12 $16.14 $38.76/cs $38.98
96 Procell C Batteries Duracell Energizer Duracell NO BID Duracell
12/bx 6bx/cs 12/bx 12/bx 6bx/cs 12/bx 6bx/cs
$45.02 $12.19 $43.98 $44.50
97 Procell D Batteries Duracell Energizer Duracell NO BID Duracell
12/bx 6bx/cs 12/bx 12/bx 6bx/cs 12/bx 6bx/cs
$56.52 $15.14 $52.80 $55.00
98 Procell 9V batteries Duracell Energizer Duracell NO BID Duracell
12/bx 6bx/cs 12/bx 12/bx 6bx/cs 12/bx 6bx/cs
$77.12 $26.04 $83.58/cs $83.70/cs
99 Tissue Dispenser - 1roll San Jamar NO BID IMP NO BID San Jamar
$9.50 ea $6.84 ea $7.00 ea
100 Tissue Dispenser - 2 rolls San Jamar NO BID IMP NO BID San Jamar
$17.36 ea $12.00 ea $15.00 ea




ltem Item Name ALL PRO HILLYARD HP PRODUCTS MAILENDER MURPHY
#
101 Bobrinck Dispenser - NO BID Bobrinck $79.99 ea NO BID $65.00 ea
stainless steel Each
$89.95
102 Tissue Dispenser - Baywest 3 | NO BID NO BID NO BID SCA FREE
rolls Free with TP
purchase
103 Dust Mop Treatment Reliable Hillyard 12-200z/cs NO BID Distract
12-170z/cs 4G/cs $30.61 4G/cs
$39.24 $99.16 $48.00
104 | Steri-fab 4-1G/cs NO BID Spartan NO BID 4-1G/cs
$184.80 12-17.50z/cs $139.00
$37.04/cs
105 Neutral Floor Cleaner Franklin Hillyard Spartan 5 Star MSC
4-1G/cs 4G/cs 4G/cs 4G/cs 4G/cs
$18.96 $25.52 $10.48 $19.90 $19.94
106 Baseboard Stripper Franklin Hillyard Claire NO BID Chase
12-180z/cs 12/cs 12-200z/cs 12/200z/cs
$33.76 $34.96 $30.43 $30.00
107 Maxithins napkins Hospeco Hospeco Hospecao NO BID Hospeco
250/cs 250/cs 250/cs 250/cs
$33.72 $34.96 $27.78 $28.00
108 Tampax tampons P&G Hospeco Hospeco NO BID Hospeco
500/cs 500/cs 500/cs 500/cs
$48.00 $60.41 $54.28 $52.00
109 Microfiber cloths (HHS FC) 144/cs NO BID 288/cs NO BID 24/pk
$82.08 $132.67 $16.95
10 Multi-fold towels Nova SCA/Wausau CAS SCA 4000/cs
4000ct 4000ct 4000ct 4000ct $14.75
$14.70 $17.41 $14.59 $14.60
m Kitchen roll towels NO BID SCA/Wausau CAS SCA Tork
90ct/roll/30cs 85ct/roll/30cs 85ct/roll/30cs 30/cs
$23.59 $18.52 $18.50 $18.50
n2 12 oz Foam Cup Dart Dart Dart NO BID Dart
1000ct 1000ct 1000ct 1000/ ct
$30.53 $31.85 $28.89 $25.74
n3 Doodlebug cleaning brushes NO BID NO BID 3M NO BID NO BID
$36.61 ea
14 Vacuum Bags - Hoover NO BID NO BID 10/pk NO BID 10/pk
$10.50/pk $23.95




