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1 3M - POLISH PADS WHITE 14" X 20" CASE 64.91 25.50 NO BID 83.75 20.11 NO BID NO BID NO BID 48.92 NO BID

2 3M - PREP PADS NIAGARA SURGAGE PREP 14" X 20" DEEP SCRUB CASE 43.94 98.15 NO BID 179.24 31.31 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

3 3M - FLOOR SCRUBBER T-300 PAD MAROON 20"MAROON 20" ROUND PADS EACH 97.64 62.20 NO BID 74.11 41.33 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

4 3M - FLOOR SCRUBBER T-300 PAD RECTANGLE SHAPE EACH 67.56 25.50 NO BID NO BID 23.93 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

5 3M - RED CLEANING RECTANGULAR SHAPE PADS SCRUBBERSCRUBBER PADS EACH 64.91 25.50 NO BID 89.21 23.93 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

6 3M - ERASER SPONGE 3M CASE 35.53 41.75 NO BID 5.20 25.33 NO BID 51.63 NO BID NO BID NO BID

7 3M - FLOOR SCRUBBER T-300 PAD WHITE POLISHING 20"WHITE POLISHING RECTANGLE PAD - EACH 64.91 25.50 NO BID 51.45 19.03 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

8 3M - FLOOR SCRUBBER T-300 PAD WHITE POLISHING 17"RECTANGLE SHAPE EACH 26.26 14.30 NO BID NO BID 13.01 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

9 3M - SPP MAROON 20" MAROON BOX 97.64 62.20 NO BID 125.99 50.11 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

10 3M - SPP PADS MAROON 17" 17" BOX 82.62 51.40 NO BID 106.59 36.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

11 5330 20" CLNR FLOOR PAD BLUE CASE 19.02 18.45 NO BID 15.68 18.12 NO BID 36.73 NO BID NO BID NO BID

12 ADULT PERSONAL WIPES RIGID LENS 8.7X12.6 48 PACK CASE 26.85 47.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID 55.98 NO BID NO BID 17.99 NO BID

13 AIR FRESHNER - EASY FRESH EASY FRESH - FRESH MANGO CASE 3.75 44.50 NO BID 67.49 47.87 44.99 15.34 118.10 NO BID NO BID

14 AIR FRESHNER - HOSPECO HOSPECO - CINAMMON CASE 45.47 42.76 NO BID 48.36 47.87 44.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

15 AIR FRESHNER - HOSPECO HOSPECO - FRESH LINEN CASE 45.47 42.76 NO BID 48.36 47.87 44.99 15.34 193.47 NO BID NO BID

16 AIR FRESHNER - HOSPECO HOSPECO - SUNBURST CASE 45.47 42.76 NO BID 48.36 47.87 44.99 NO BID 193.47 NO BID NO BID

17 AIR FRESHNER - KIM CARE KIM CARE - SUMMER SORBET CASE 71.91 42.76 NO BID 83.81 NO BID NO BID NO BID 193.47 NO BID NO BID

18 AIR FRESHNER - TC MICROBURST TC MICROBURST 3000 PREFERENCE PACK CASE 78.82 NO BID NO BID 104.04 NO BID NO BID NO BID 193.47 NO BID NO BID

19 AIR FRESHNER DISPENSER - HOSPECO HOSPECO EACH 29.28 19.65 NO BID 24.20 22.80 27.99 18.88 36.52 NO BID NO BID

20 AIR FRESHNER DISPENSER & DEODORIZER - CLAIRECLAIRE AIR EFFECTS TROPIC BREEZE EACH 20.53 19.65 NO BID 48.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID 193.47 NO BID NO BID

21 AIR FRESHNER DISPENSERS - KIM CARE KIM CARE EACH 3.71 19.65 NO BID 1.47 NO BID NO BID 28.89 36.52 NO BID NO BID

22 AIR PRESHNER - KIM CARE KIM CARE - CITRUS CASE 79.02 42.76 NO BID 187.92 NO BID NO BID NO BID 193.47 NO BID NO BID

23 AUTO SCRUBBER - BACKER PADS TEN1217830 - 20 X 14 X 1" EACH 69.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

24 AUTO SCRUBBER - HOSE ASSEMBLY W / 2 CUFF 19.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

25 AUTO SCRUBBER - SQUEEGEE BLADE T300/T500FRONT EACH 13.59 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

26 AUTO SCRUBBER - SQUEEEGIE REPLACEMENT HEAD18" WINDOW 18.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

27 AUTO SCRUBBER - SQUEEEGIE WITH REPLACEMENT HEAD18" HANDLE EACH 6.18 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

28 AUTO SCRUBBER - SQUEEGEE BLADE T300/T500REAR EACH 15.38 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

29 BASEBOARD STRIPPER AEROSOL EACH 42.99 2.68 NO BID 47.53 62.96 36.96  (3.08) 5.87 28.75 NO BID NO BID

30 BATTERIES - AA ALKALINE AA ALKALINE ENERGIZER OR DURACELL -24 Per Box BOX 9.82 12.06 NO BID 18.34 NO BID 9.36 14.74 NO BID NO BID NO BID

31 BATTERIES - AAA ALKALINE AAA ALKALINE ENERGIZER OR DURACELL - 24 Per Box BOX 9.82 11.75 NO BID 16.22 NO BID 9.36 14.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID

32 BATTERIES - D ALKALINE D ALKALINE ENERGIZER OR DURACELL - 24 Per Box BOX 16.26 17.80 NO BID 11.46 NO BID 14.28 11.71 NO BID NO BID NO BID

33 BATTERIES - C ALKALINE C ALKALINE ENERGIZER OR DURACELL - 12 Per Box BOX 11.87 13.20 NO BID 10.60 NO BID 10.20 11.16 NO BID NO BID NO BID

34 BATTERIES - 9 VOLT ALKALINE 9 VOLT ALKALINE ENERGIZER OR DURACELL -12 Per Box BOX 19.35 29.86 NO BID 19.97 NO BID 19.08 21.11 NO BID NO BID NO BID



35 BED BUD SPRAY STERI-FAB - 4 Gal/Case EACH 105.42 71.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 8.68 NO BID NO BID NO BID

36 BED BUG SPRAY STERI-FAB - 64 oz CASE 105.42 286.00 NO BID 367.55 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

37 BED BUG SPRAYER STERI-FAB EACH 105.42 32.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 60.89 NO BID NO BID NO BID

38 BETCO - CARPET SHAMPOO BETCO- Gallon CASE 38.85 47.86 NO BID 40.60 14.26 NO BID 56.86 163.17 NO BID NO BID

39 BETCO - CARPET SPOT REMOVER BETCO-Qt CASE 42.58 33.48 NO BID 64.65 2.81 NO BID 44.68 196.58 NO BID NO BID

40 BETCO - CLEANER - GERMICIDAL CONCENTRATEBBETCO CASE 27.04 35.80 NO BID 75.17 64.48+ NO BID NO BID 238.54 NO BID NO BID

41 BETCO - CONCENTRATE GERMIDIDAL CLEANERBETCO 27.04 35.40 NO BID 75.17 17.35 NO BID 92.49 238.54 NO BID NO BID

42 BETCO - DEFOAMER BETCO 62.67 39.26 NO BID 100.03 13.24 NO BID 64.41 260.30 NO BID NO BID

43 BLEACH CLOROX - Gallons/ Case CASE 21.57 NO BID 33.84 NO BID NO BID 26.84 84.69 NO BID NO BID

44 BLEACH PUREBRIGHT H6 CASE 21.83 24.62 NO BID 21.06 NO BID NO BID 31.67 NO BID NO BID NO BID

45 BLUE MICRO FIBER 12 X 12 CLEANING CLOTH CASE 6.35 0.85 NO BID 11.71 6.00 6.12 12.52 NO BID NO BID NO BID

46 BOWL, CLR SHORT F/1005302 FILTER CAPS FOR FLOOR SCRUBBER EACH 11.86 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

47 BROOM NYLON WOOD HANDLE LARGE ANGLE EACH 5.61 7.73 NO BID 5.00 NO BID 67.08 (5.59) 23.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID

48 BROOM YELLOW NYLON 51" WOOD HANDLE LARGE ANGLE CARTON 5.61 7.73 NO BID NO BID NO BID 67.08 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

49 BROOM NYLON INDOOR USE 51" STEEL HANDLE CASE 6.49 7.62 NO BID 90.36 NO BID 59.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

50 BROOM SOFT BRISTLE PUSH EACH 11.47 9.45 NO BID 29.41 14.32 119.76 (9.98) 23.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID

51 BUCKET 10 QT RUBBERMAID OR EQUIVALENT CASE 13.04 6.96 NO BID 115.68 NO BID 83.76 15.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID

52 CLEANER -HOT SPRINGS #20 GP- Diversey DIV93318102COMMAND CENTER - 2 Gal/Case CASE 93.11 NO BID NO BID 113.22 16.83 NO BID NO BID 153.07 NO BID NO BID

53 CLEANER RAINDANCE NEUTRAL Disversey DIV93323981COMMAND CENTER - 2 Gal/Case CASE 150.76 NO BID NO BID 173.87 25.86 NO BID NO BID 146.85 NO BID NO BID

54 CREW QUART BOTTLES - Diversey DIV100925283CASE - 2 Gal/Case 12/32oz Bottle 27.20 NO BID NO BID 42.13 2.24 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

55 CVR WALL WASHR KIT EACH 71.29 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

56 DEFOAMER - LIQUID BETCO CASE 62.67 39.26 NO BID 100.03 13.24 NO BID 64.41 260.30 NO BID NO BID

57 DEODORIZER WATER SOLUBLE LEMON SCENT CASE 64.84 48.60 NO BID 29.22 NO BID NO BID NO BID 193.47 NO BID NO BID

58 DISHWASHING LIQUID (DAWN) DAWN 8/32oz/Case CASE 47.88 54.58 NO BID 75.52 5.30 62.98 66.99 188.81 NO BID NO BID

59 DISINFECTANT DEODORIZER WINTERGREEN 4/CASE 4 Gal Case CASE 43.71 53.76 NO BID NO BID 9.29 NO BID NO BID 207.46 NO BID NO BID

60 DISINFECTANT SPRAY CLOROX FRESH SCENT12/19 z/ Cs CASE 71.83 31.60 NO BID 93.14 NO BID 85.99 67.49 207.46 NO BID NO BID

61 DISINFECTANT SPRAY LYSOL CASE 110.01 31.60 NO BID 55.90 92.00 122.98 71.99 207.46 NO BID NO BID

62 DISINFECTANT WIPES CLOROX FRESH SCENT 35 per Box / 6 Box/ Case CASE 37.39 36.98 NO BID 42.38 40.61 15.98 38.52 207.46 NO BID NO BID

63 DISINFECTANT WIPES CLOROX LEMON SCENT 35 per Box / 6 Box/ Case CASE 37.39 36.98 NO BID 42.57 40.61 45.99 27.49 207.46 NO BID NO BID

64 DISINFECTANT WIPES CLOROX LEMON SCENT 35 per Box / 6 Box/ Case CASE 37.39 36.98 NO BID 42.57 40.61 NO BID 27.49 207.46 NO BID NO BID

65 DISINFECTANT WIPES LYSOL 35 per Box / 6 Box/ Case CASE 37.39 39.40 NO BID 36.06 NO BID 49.98 31.62 NO BID NO BID NO BID

66 DISINFECTING RESTROOM CLEANER - DNA DNA #16 DNA Non-Acid - 4/64 OZ/CS CASE 27.04 19.64 NO BID NO BID 3.60 NO BID 23.29 180.26 NO BID NO BID

67 DISTILLED WATER 15.16 NO BID NO BID 9.32 NO BID NO BID 11.87 NO BID NO BID NO BID

68 DOLLIES 32 - 44 GALLON TRASH CONTAINERS EACH 49.39 29.90 NO BID 39.19 37.85 31.98 57.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID

69 DRAIN OPENER NON-ACID FOR DRAINS/GREASE TRAPS - 12 qts to a case CASE  33.48 NO BID 42.08 4.37 NO BID 45.57 201.24 NO BID NO BID

70 DUST CLOTH TREATED 17X24 CASE 74.56 86.45 NO BID 86.32 NO BID 80.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID



71 DUST MOP 24' X 5" EACH 4.48 4.67 NO BID 8.23 8.00 5.98 38.54 NO BID NO BID NO BID

72 DUST MOP - INFINITY TWIST WHITE 5" X 60" EACH 21.14 8.89 NO BID NO BID NO BID 20.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

73 DUST MOP FRAME 48 X 5 CASE 4.91 5.38 NO BID 89.88 8.38 71.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

74 DUST MOP FRAME 24 X 5 2.81 3.35 NO BID 34.32 4.97 47.88 5.07 NO BID NO BID NO BID

75 DUST MOP HANDLE 48" FIBERGLASS EACH 13.53 15.21 NO BID NO BID 8.07 10.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

76 DUST MOP HEAD 24 x 5 EACH 4.48 4.64 NO BID 8.23 7.68 5.98 4.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID

77 DUST MOP HEAD FITS 48" X 5" FRAME CASE 8.13 7.97 NO BID 93.60 18.36 95.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

78 DUST MOP SPRAY CASE 53.24 33.78 NO BID 55.84 6.14 39.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

79 DUST PAN LOBBY EACH 11.62 9.20 NO BID 16.33 9.14 9.59 13.49 NO BID NO BID NO BID

80 DUST PAN RUBBERMAID EACH 6.60 2.67 NO BID 4.06 9.14 2.94 17.24 NO BID NO BID NO BID

81 DUSTER MICROFIBER TELESCOPING CASE 6.07 5.80 NO BID 69.42 9.18 71.88 (5.99) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

82 EASY TRAP DUSTER 8" X 6" CASE 99.92 54.97 NO BID 49.36 45.65 71.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

83 EKCO SCREEN EKCOS INNOVATIONS CASE 45.47 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 40.74 NO BID NO BID NO BID

84 EXHAUST FILTER 2846 EACH 27.74 NO BID NO BID 7.76 NO BID NO BID 3.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID

85 FACIAL TISSUE SOFIASOFT 30 BOXES/CASE 9X7X14" 100 Boxes/2 ply SAMPLE 
REQUIRED CASE 17.34 22.85 30.00 36.23 16.61 32.98 NO BID NO BID 29.00 NO BID

86 FINISHED FLOOR CLEANER MR CLEAN (ONLY) 4/Case CASE 53.49 53.48 NO BID 66.31 NO BID NO BID 59.05 NO BID NO BID NO BID

87 FLOOR BUFFING PADS 17" PAD Pack of 5 EACH 14.82 14.75 NO BID 12.22 14.77 2.21 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

88 FLOOR BUFFING PADS - 20" ROUND RED Pack of 5 CASE 19.02 18.45 NO BID 15.68 21.15 13.98 21.42 NO BID NO BID NO BID

89 FLOOR BUFFING PADS (RED) 20" PAD Pack of 5 EACH 19.02 3.69 NO BID 15.69 21.15 2.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

90 FLOOR BUFFING PADS 20" RED Pack of 5 CASE 19.02 18.45 NO BID 15.68 21.15 13.98 58.62 NO BID NO BID NO BID

91 Floor Cleaner Mitchell CASE             *** 24.66 NO BID 35.60 NO BID NO BID 42.81 146.85 NO BID NO BID

92 FLOOR CLEANING PAD 17" (BLUE) PKG OF 5 3M7000000674 26.26 14.25 NO BID 24.95 14.77 11.05 9.18 NO BID NO BID NO BID

93 FLOOR CLEANING PAD 20" (BLUE) PKG OF 5 3M7100003274 33.97 18.45 NO BID 33.07 18.12 13.98 18.72 NO BID NO BID NO BID

94 FLOOR FINISH WAX - Time Saver DIVERSEY - 5 Gallon Box CASE 117.19 75.85 NO BID 143.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 124.32 NO BID NO BID

95 FLOOR FINISH WAX - DIVERSEY 4-1 GAL/CASE 117.19 75.85 NO BID 111.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID 124.32 NO BID NO BID

96 FLOOR PAD BLNR BLUE 5300 20" Pk of 5 CASE 33.97 18.45 NO BID 33.07 18.12 13.98 36.73 NO BID NO BID NO BID

97 FLOOR POLISH PAD - 20" ROUND WHITE Pk of 5 CASE 19.02 18.45 NO BID 15.68 19.03 13.98 26.89 NO BID NO BID NO BID

98 FLOOR POLISHING PAD 20" WHITE PK of 5 CASE 19.02 18.45 NO BID 15.68 19.03 13.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

99 FLOOR POLISHING PAD 20' WHITE PK of 5 CASE 19.02 18.45 NO BID 15.68 19.03 13.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

100 FLOOR STRIPPING PAD 20" BLACK -Pkg of 5 CASE 19.02 18.45 NO BID 15.68 19.03 13.98 31.34 NO BID NO BID NO BID

101 FLOOR STRIPPING PAD - 20" BLACK ROUND Pkg of 5 CASE 19.02 18.45 NO BID 15.68 19.03 13.98 31.34 NO BID NO BID NO BID

102 FLOOR WAX - Diversey HIGH MILEAGE - Gallon Box Div 95104811 CASE 117.19 75.85 NO BID 143.00 175.37 NO BID NO BID 148.41 NO BID NO BID

103 FLOOR WAX STRIPPER PRO 5 - 5 Gall/Box DIV95032360 CASE 103.93 76.65 NO BID 126.75 149.33 NO BID 49.29 132.09 NO BID NO BID

104 FLOOR WAX STRIPPER PRO BUCKET 103.93 76.65 NO BID 126.75 NO BID NO BID 84.89 237.76 NO BID NO BID

105 GARBAGE BAGS MED 34x40 100/Case EACH 19.28 14.70 NO BID NO BID 32.00 NO BID 21.82 NO BID NO BID NO BID

106 GARBAGE CAN BRUTE - LARGE 51.85 53.10 NO BID 71.62 64.00 299.88 (49.98) 57.47 NO BID NO BID NO BID



107 GARBAGE CAN CLASSROOM SIZE - SMALL 8.22 9.95 NO BID 7.59 8.21 83.88 (6.99) 112.66 NO BID NO BID NO BID

108 GLOVES - LATEX DISPOSAL - LATEX - SMALL 100Box/10 Case SAMPLE 
REQUIRED BOX 5.00 3.45 NO BID 6.72 14.13 39.90 (3.99) NO BID NO BID 3.99 3.60

109 GLOVES - LATEX DISPOSAL - LATEX - MEDIUM 100Box/10 Case SAMPLE 
REQUIRED BOX 5.00 3.45 NO BID 6.72 10.91 39.90 (3.99) NO BID NO BID 3.99 3.60

110 GLOVES - LATEX DISPOSAL - LATEX - LARGE SAMPLE 
REQUIRED BOX 5.00 3.45 NO BID 6.72 10.91 39.90 (3.99) NO BID NO BID 3.99 3.60

111 GLOVES - LATEX DISPOSAL - LATEX - X-LARGE 100Box/10 Case SAMPLE 
REQUIRED BOX 5.00 3.45 NO BID 6.72 14.45 39.90 (3.99) NO BID NO BID 3.99 3.60

112 GLOVES - VINYL POWDER FREE VINYL - SMALL SAMPLE 
REQUIRED BOX 2.21 2.30 NO BID 2.86 2.77 29.99 (2.99) NO BID NO BID 2.50 1.90

113 GLOVES - VINYL POWDER FREE VINYL - MEDIUM 100Box/10 Case SAMPLE 
REQUIRED BOX 2.21 2.30 NO BID 2.86 2.77 29.99 (2.99) NO BID NO BID 2.50 1.90

114 GLOVES - VINYL POWDER FREE VINYL - LARGE 100Box/10 Case SAMPLE 
REQUIRED BOX 2.21 2.30 NO BID 2.86 2.77 29.99 (2.99) NO BID NO BID 2.50 1.90

115 GLOVES - VINYL POWDER FREE VINYL - X-LARGE 100Box/10 Case SAMPLE 
REQUIRED BOX 2.21 2.30 NO BID 2.86 2.77 29.99 (2.99) NO BID NO BID 2.50 1.90

116 GLOVES - VINYL DISPOSAL - VINYL - SMALL 100Box/10 Case SAMPLE 
REQUIRED BOX 2.21 2.43 NO BID NO BID 2.77 29.99 (2.99) NO BID NO BID 2.50 1.90

117 GLOVES - VINYL DISPOSAL - VINYL - MEDIUM 100Box/10 Case SAMPLE 
REQUIRED BOX 2.21 2.43 NO BID NO BID 2.77 29.99 (2.99) NO BID NO BID 2.50 1.90

118 GLOVES - VINYL DISPOSAL - VINYL - LARGE100Box/10 Case SAMPLE 
REQUIRED BOX 2.21 2.43 NO BID NO BID 2.77 29.99 (2.99) NO BID NO BID 2.50 1.90

119 GLOVES - VINYL DISPOSAL - VINYL - X-LARGE100Box/10 Case SAMPLE 
REQUIRED BOX 2.21 2.43 NO BID NO BID 2.77 29.99 (2.99) NO BID NO BID 2.50 1.90

120 GLOVES - VINYL DISPOSAL - VINYL 5 MIL - SMALL 100Box/10 Case SAMPLE 
REQUIRED BOX 39.81 2.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID 29.99 (2.99) NO BID NO BID NO BID 4.80

121 GLOVES - VINYL DISPOSAL - VINYL 5 MIL - MEDIUM 100Box/10 Case SAMPLE 
REQUIRED BOX 39.81 2.95 NO BID 3.90 NO BID 29.99 (2.99) NO BID NO BID NO BID 4.80

122 GLOVES - VINYL DISPOSAL - VINYL 5 MIL - LARGE 100Box/10 Case SAMPLE 
REQUIRED BOX 39.81 2.95 NO BID 3.90 NO BID 29.99 (2.99) NO BID NO BID NO BID 4.80

123 GLOVES - VINYL DISPOSAL - VINYL 5 MIL - X-LARGE 100Box/10 Case SAMPLE 
REQUIRED BOX 39.81 2.95 NO BID 3.90 NO BID 29.99 (2.99) NO BID NO BID NO BID 4.80

124 GREY FLG BRISTLE PUSH BROOM EACH 11.47 9.45 NO BID 29.41 9.67 10.99 140.97 NO BID NO BID NO BID

125 GRIP & GRAB REACHING TOOL 36" EACH 22.69 12.46 NO BID 41.53 NO BID 12.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

126 HANDLE THREADED / WOOD 15"/16" X 60 EACH 3.24 3.15 NO BID 3.56 3.99 3.39 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

127 HOT SPRINGS 2 GALLON 93.11 NO BID NO BID 113.22 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

128 LAUNDRY DETERGENT 25# Box BOX 38.10 38.70 NO BID 41.21 82.99 NO BID 29.36 183.37 NO BID NO BID

129 LIQUID NILODOR-DEOD CASE 64.85 48.60 NO BID 29.22 NO BID 45.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

130 MICROFIER FINISH SYSTEM INCLUDES BUCKET W/LID, SLEEVE 8 PADS & FRAME EACH 257.66 59.80 NO BID 174.50 NO BID 185.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

131 MICROPHYGEINE FILTER 531ER EACH 12.13 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

132 MOP WET, FIBERGLASS GRIPPER CLAMP STYLE 54" HANDLE EACH 21.38 6.40 NO BID 25.32 NO BID 14.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

133 MOP 24 OZ RAYON (USED FOR WAX APPLICATION) EACH 8.73 5.30 NO BID 9.14 8.01 6.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

134 MOP BUCKET WITH WRINGER WRINGER W/SPLASH GUARD EACH 90.83 69.70 NO BID 104.73 88.00 76.99 27.08 NO BID NO BID NO BID

135 MOP HANDLE WET, FIBERGLASS GRIPPER CLAMP STYLE 60" HANDLE EACH 21.38 10.36 NO BID 25.32 13.68 14.98 16.16 NO BID NO BID NO BID

136 MOP SUPERSTITCH BRAND MOP BLUE LG5 RED BANK CASES 8.58 6.32 NO BID 9.50 NO BID 53.88 45.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID

137 MORNING MIST 2 GALLON 59.14 NO BID NO BID 72.72 NO BID NO BID NO BID 254.08 NO BID NO BID

138 MR CLEAN MAGIC ERASER SPONGES CASE 35.53 36.76 NO BID 47.43 64.53 17.28 51.63 NO BID 33.99 NO BID

139 NEUTRAL DISINFECTANT FLOOR CLEANER MORNING MIST 1.5 CASE 59.14 NO BID NO BID 72.72 17.65 NO BID 61.28 146.85 NO BID NO BID

140 NIAGARA RED PADS 5100N 14 X 20 CASE 64.91 25.50 NO BID 89.21 NO BID 20.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

141 NIAGARA SURFACE PREP PADS 14 X 20 DEEP SCRUB CASE 43.94 25.50 NO BID 95.50 NO BID 29.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

142 NIAGARA WHITE POLISH PADS 14 X 20 CASE 64.91 25.50 NO BID 42.87 NO BID 20.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID



143 ODOR DEFENSE AEROSOL CLOROX PRO ODER CASE DISCONTINUED 32.36 NO BID 93.14 NO BID 62.98 58.14 180.26 NO BID NO BID

144 PACER 12 VAC EACH 458.12 235.50 NO BID 615.94 635.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

145 PAD HOLDER DOODLEBUG W/O HANDLE EACH 6.95 5.25 NO BID 6.24 7.32 5.79 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

146 PADS #8550 DOODLEBUG HI-PRO CASE 128.67 147.65 NO BID 41.50 NO BID 19.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

147 PAPER TOWEL DISPENSER 8" X 800' (LEVEL MAIC ONLY) EACH 61.78 65.35 NO BID 71.51 64.44 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

148 PAPER TOWELS - WHITE TRI FOLD-WHITE 250 Sheets/Pack - 16 Pks/Case (Multifold) SAMPLE 
REQUIRED EACH 19.10 22.50 29.00 25.46 25.68 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

149 PAPER TOWELS - BROWN 8" X 800" - Brown - 6 Rolls per Case SAMPLE 
REQUIRED CASE 23.35 22.85 32.00 31.81 26.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID 29.82 NO BID

150 PERSONAL WIPES - ADULT RIGID LENS CASE 26.85 47.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 56.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID

151 PLASTIC LINERS - BLACK
16 MICRON FITS 33 GAL CAN HEAVY WEIGHT 1/25/CASE - 
33X40 SAMPLE 

REQUIRED CASE 22.56 19.06 29.00 22.83 26.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID 24.92 19.40

152 PLASTIC LINERS - BLACK CORELESS 1.5 MIL 100/CASE (BLACK) 38X58 SAMPLE 
REQUIRED CASE 29.53 21.65 29.00 29.75 24.92 NO BID NO BID NO BID 27.99 27.90

153 PLASTIC LINERS - BLACK HDE TRASH BAGS 37X30X36 SAMPLE 
REQUIRED CASE             *** 20.40 22.00 NO BID 19.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 18.40

154 PLASTIC LINERS - BLACK CORELESS 22 MICRON FOR 33 GAL CANS 34X40 SAMPLE 
REQUIRED CASE 34.16 25.88 29.00 35.62 36.59 NO BID NO BID NO BID 23.18 27.40

155 PLASTIC LINERS - BLACK
CORELESS 22 MICRON FOR 40-45 GAL CANS HEAVY WT 
40X48 SAMPLE 

REQUIRED CASE 28.89 21.65 34.00 31.08 31.92 NO BID NO BID NO BID 21.50 21.90

156 PLASTIC LINERS - BLACK CORELESS 22 MICRON FOR 33 GAL CANS 40X48 SAMPLE 
REQUIRED CASE 34.16 25.88 33.00 35.62 31.92 NO BID NO BID NO BID 23.18 27.40

157 PLASTIC LINERS - BLACK CORELESS 2 MIL 100/CASE - ROLLS (HEAVIEST MILL) 38X58 SAMPLE 
REQUIRED CASE 40.95 30.54 31.90 48.43 43.11 NO BID NO BID NO BID 39.15 23.00

158 PLASTIC LINERS - BLACK CORELESS 2 MIL 100/CASE - ROLLS (HEAVIEST MILL) 40X60 SAMPLE 
REQUIRED CASE 21.89 30.54 77.00 30.92 43.11 NO BID NO BID NO BID 39.15 23.00

159 PLASTIC LINERS - BLACK GT HD TRASH 37X30X36 SAMPLE 
REQUIRED CASE             *** 17.35 NO BID 15.66 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

160 PLASTIC LINERS - HEAVY DUTY HEAVY DUTY OUT DOOR SAMPLE 
REQUIRED CASE 21.89 17.35 NO BID 31.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

161 PLUNGERS - TOILET EACH 5.14 5.40 NO BID 6.97 4.42 5.13 4.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID

162 PLUNGERS - WATER FOUNTAIN SMALL NO BID 4.33 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

163 POLY SNOW PUSHER EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 32.93 NO BID NO BID 34.09 NO BID NO BID NO BID

164 POLYWOOL DUSTER 52-84 EACH 8.54 6.23 NO BID 9.80 NO BID 6.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

165 POUCH EASY SHINE REUSABLE 5/CS CASE 67.73 NO BID NO BID 59.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

166 POWER CORD PACER 12 66.80 NO BID NO BID 69.55 100.63 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

167 QUICK CONNECT HANDLE EACH 13.07 7.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID 6.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

168 RAGS 25# BOX TERRY CLOTH 18" X 18" SAMPLE 
REQUIRED CASE 48.80 30.25 NO BID NO BID 70.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

169 RAGS 25# BOX TERRY CLOTH 12"X12" SAMPLE 
REQUIRED CASE 51.89 27.30 NO BID 13.97 70.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

170 RAINDANCE -Diversey 2 GALLON - DIV93323981 150.76 NO BID NO BID 173.87 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

171 REACH TOOL 36" E-Z GRABBER W/PISTOL GRIB EACH 22.69 12.48 NO BID 41.53 NO BID 12.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

172 SANITARY NAPKINS WAX BAGS RUBERMAID 8.75L X 8.5H CASE 35.32 42.70 NO BID 29.59 NO BID 19.98 31.89 NO BID NO BID NO BID

173 SCOTCH BRITE HD SCOURING PAD PACK 6.24 46.20 NO BID 24.89 NO BID NO BID 24.17 NO BID NO BID NO BID

174 SCRAPER - SHORT HANDLE UNGER EACH 3.61 5.68 NO BID 3.65 13.65 21.99 15.07 NO BID NO BID NO BID

175 SCRAPER FLOOR & WINDOW 48" UNGER EACH 19.63 13.83 NO BID 26.66 17.10 25.99 26.46 NO BID NO BID NO BID

176 SCRAPER HANDLE - 4" UNGER EACH 3.61 5.68 NO BID 9.92 NO BID 3.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

177 SCRUBBER PADS DOODLE BUG CASE 20.20 18.45 NO BID 10.14 18.63 16.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

178 SIMPLE HYGIENE FOAM HAND SOAP CASE 40.28 48.40 NO BID NO BID 35.36 NO BID NO BID 169.39 NO BID NO BID



179 SNAPBACK-DIVERSEY SPRAY BOTTLE 4-1 GAL/CASE 97.91 46.86 NO BID 114.81 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

180 SOAP DISPENSER - BOBRICK -CONTURA LIQUID SOAPDISPENSERS (PUMP STYLE) EACH 88.41 NO BID NO BID 87.22 11.49 NO BID NO BID 10.78 NO BID NO BID

181 SOAP DISPENSER 30 OZ TANK LOCKING TOP CLEAN VU EACH 11.44 14.70 NO BID 25.47 NO BID 20.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

182 SOAP HAND LIQUID ANTI-BACTERIAL KUTOL CASE 54.73 47.88 NO BID 96.78 14.75 NO BID NO BID 169.39 NO BID NO BID

183 SOAP HAND LIQUID GOJO - 4 Gallon Box CASE 59.01 47.88 NO BID 29.41 93..28 NO BID 81.55 169.39 NO BID NO BID

184 SPILL ABSORBER (VOMIT CLEANUP) SOAKIT NDR8NLC CASE 89.19 64.25 NO BID 66.35 74.65 88.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

185 SPILL ABSORBER (VOMIT CLEANUP) NILODOR NILOGEL DEODORIZING 42.48 64.25 NO BID 70.32 74.65 49.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

186 SPONGE MOP HANDLE - HEAVY DUTY SPEEDY STEEL HANDLE WITH 12" W/HEAD EACH 38.06 22.40 NO BID 23.44 NO BID 20.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

187 SPONGE MOP REFILL HEAD EACH 16.98 12.61 NO BID 10.72 NO BID 10.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

188 SPRAY BOTTLE - SNAPBACK DIVERSEY CASE 97.91 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

189 SPRAY BOTTLE - WITH TRIGGER DIVERSEY CASESee Lines #190 &191 48.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

190 SPRAY BOTTLE - WITH TRIGGER PLASTIC , HEAVY DUTY - EACH 0.68 2.00 NO BID 3.34 1.71 1.79 3.51 NO BID NO BID NO BID

191 SPRAY TRIGGER FOR 32 OZ BOTTLE - HEAVY DUTY EACH 0.59 0.93 NO BID 2.49 0.66 0.69 4.34 NO BID NO BID NO BID

192 STERI-FAB BED BUG SPRAY 4 Gal/Case CASE 105.42 286.00 NO BID 367.55 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

193 STRIPPER (AEOSOL) BRAVO POWER OF AM HD - 12-32oz/case CASE 92.37 32.10 NO BID 112.28 62.96 36.99 NO BID 210.57 NO BID NO BID

194 SWIFFER DUSTER KITS Case of 6 CASE 30.79 10.95 NO BID 36.61 NO BID 33.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

195 SWIFFER DUSTER REFILLS HAND HELD Case of 36 CASE 36.79 42.10 NO BID 44.76 NO BID 48.99 62.64 NO BID NO BID NO BID

196 SQUEEGEE BLADE REAR 32.68L - LIN QTEX (500)M EACH 15.01 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

197 TILT TRUCK STANDARD DUTY BLACK 3/4 CU YD 1000# CAPFG101300BLA 709.50 789.85 NO BID 786.32 NO BID 789.95 334.04 NO BID NO BID NO BID

198 TILT TRUCK STANDARD DUTY BLACK 1 CU YD FG9T1500BLA 869.34 852.25 NO BID 963.46 NO BID NO BID 415.93 NO BID NO BID NO BID

199 TIME SAVER WAX 5 GALLON BOX DIVERSEY - DIV5104984 EACH 185.01 75.85 NO BID 218.93 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

200 TOILET BOWL CLEANER ACID - 12 Qts/Case CASE 25.73 21.86 NO BID 26.77 3.81 NO BID 23.53 233.10 NO BID NO BID

201 TOILET BOWL SWAB NYLENE YARN , PLASTIC HANDLE EACH 0.91 0.89 NO BID 106.00 NO BID 0.92 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

202 TOILET PAPER (LILY SOFT) WHITE 2 PLY 4.5 X 4.5 500 SHEETS/ROLL - 96 ROLLS /CASE SAMPLE 
REQUIRED EACH 47.83 39.45 60.00 59.17 48.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 39.15 NO BID

203 TOILET PAPER JUMBO ROLL DELUXE JUMBO 2-PL WHITE 3.3" CORE 12 Rolls/Case SAMPLE 
REQUIRED EACH 31.50 26.70 31.00 36.59 36.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 29.00 NO BID

204 TOILET PAPER DISPENSER
MICRO TWIN DOUBLE ROLL COVERED 7 1/8H x 10 1/8W x 6 
3/8D EACH 24.16 29.95 NO BID 20.74 21.36 NO BID 21.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID

205 TOILET PAPER DISPENSER
2 Roll Side by Side Covered - holds 2 1000 sheet 2 ply JUMBO 
ROLL EACH 32.50 26.80 NO BID 20.74 35.92 NO BID 20.26 NO BID NO BID NO BID

206 TOWEL ROLLS - PAPER Brown 8" x 800' Roll - 6 Rolls/Case SAMPLE 
REQUIRED CASE 23.35 26.65 39.00 31.81 26.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID 32.70 NO BID

207 TOWELS 25# Box WHITE TERRY 22X44 SAMPLE 
REQUIRED CASE 45.72 NO BID 18.42 70.00 19.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

208 TRAILBLAZER DISP FINISH KIT MANIFORD, 2 HOSES, 1 SHOWER CAP - 5 KITS PKG 106.37 NO BID NO BID 121.41 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

209 TRAILBLAZER FINISH PADS -RINSE 3/PADS PER CASE CASE 109.33 NO BID NO BID 79.27 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

210 TRASH CAN SMALL BLACK - 40 -41 QT RUBBERMAID EACH 15.48 9.95 NO BID 14.30 NO BID 11.99 10.12 NO BID NO BID NO BID

211 TRASH CAN ROUND GREY 44 -45 GAL RUBBERMAID EACH 68.92 53.10 NO BID 47.53 40.24 59.99 57.47 NO BID NO BID NO BID

212 TRASH CAN DOLLIE WITH WHEELS 44-45 GAL - BRUTE EACH 63.64 29.90 NO BID 39.19 29.31 31.98 38.67 NO BID NO BID NO BID

213 URINAL CAKES FRESH SCENT 12/Case CASE 6.79 11.64 NO BID NO BID 7.88 10.89 12.41 191.92 NO BID NO BID

214 URINAL SCREENS EKCOSCREEN BY EKCOS - ANTI SPLASH 45.47 22.30 NO BID NO BID 62.75 22.99 21.21 86.25 NO BID NO BID



215 URINAL SCREENS APPLE SCENT - Box 10 BOX 20.09 22.30 NO BID 30.35 18.53 22.99 20.30 86.25 NO BID NO BID

216 URINAL SCREENS MANGO - Box 12 BOX 20.09 22.30 NO BID 30.08 18.53 22.99 20.39 86.25 16.99 NO BID

217 URINAL SCREENS BLACK CHERRY - Box 12 BOX 13.22 22.30 NO BID 23.50 NO BID 22.99 NO BID 86.25 NO BID NO BID

218 URINAL SCREENS COTTON BLOSSOM Box 12 BOX 20.09 22.30 NO BID 30.35 18.53 22.99 21.22 86.25 NO BID NO BID

219 URINAL SCREENS CUCUMBER MELON 3-D LARGE Box 12 BOX 20.09 22.30 NO BID NO BID 18.53 22.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

220 URINE REMOVER CLOROX ONLY - 9 Bottles/Case EACH 29.90 6.08 NO BID 6.27 62.75 NO BID 20.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID

221 VACUUM CLEANER VERSAMATIC 14 VERSAMATIC 14 VACUUM CLEANER EACH 458.12 396.40 NO BID 765.73 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

222 VACCUM BAGS VERSAMATIC PAPER BAGS (WIN 2003) 8.600-460.0 PACK 9.20 8.98 NO BID 11.37 NO BID NO BID 12.18 NO BID NO BID NO BID

223 VACCUM BELT VERSAMATIC PLUS WIN86138220 EACH 22.69 5.85 NO BID 22.78 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

224 VACCUM BRISTLE STRIP VERSAMATIC 14" 2046 EACH 8.31 25.62 NO BID 20.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

225 VACUUM MICRO FILTER, SEN 86005220 WINDSOR WIN5301ER EACH 12.13 10.46 NO BID 21.39 NO BID NO BID 8.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID

226 VACUUM PACER 12 BELT REPLACEMENT KIT PACER 12 BELTS NSS96-717-9 PKG/2 60.27 NO BID NO BID 67.63 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

227 VACCUM FILTER VERSAMATIC MOTOR FILTER VAC WIN1044 EACH 1.39 27.98 NO BID 9.95 NO BID NO BID 4.84 NO BID NO BID NO BID

228 VACCUM FILTER VERSAMATIC EXHAUST FILTR (HEPA) WIN86431030 EACH 27.81 NO BID NO BID 15.22 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

229 VACCUM HEPA FILTER PACER 12 NSS96-005-1 EACH 41.18 NO BID NO BID 49.75 35.83 NO BID                                                    NO BID NO BID NO BID

230 VACCUM MOTOR FILTER PACER 12 NSS96-074-1 EACH 14.99 NO BID NO BID 18.11 15.26 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

231 VACCUM POWER CORD PACER 12 EACH 56.94 NO BID NO BID 75.35 95.57 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

232 VACUMM BAGS WINDSOR VS 14 SERIAL #E264040421 PKG 9.20 8.98 NO BID NO BID 15.52 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

233 VACUUM BAGS WINDSOR VERSAMATIC SENSORS EACH 13.71 12.75 NO BID 11.37 15.52 NO BID 17.37 NO BID NO BID NO BID

234 VACUUM BAGS NSS PACER 12/15 FILTER BAGS NSS96-191-1 PACK 29.40 14.30 NO BID 45.17 17.32 NO BID 9.71 NO BID NO BID NO BID

235 VACUUM HEPA FILTER KIT WINDSOR EACH             *** NO BID NO BID 28.26 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

236 VINEGAR 4 Gallon/Cs GALLON 13.42 3.55 NO BID 10.44 5.58 NO BID 12.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID

237 WALL WASH KIT=1/HDLE 1/HEAD 2/COTTON PADS KIT 71.29 NO BID NO BID 83.38 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

238 WALL WASH REPLACE PADS COTTON 9" X 5" X 12 Pk CASE 188.00 NO BID NO BID 127.44 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

239 WASHCLOTHS - WHITE 25# BOX LARGE 10" X 13" - 500 Case SAMPLE 
REQUIRED CASE 51.89 27.30 NO BID 13.59 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

240 WINDOW CLEANER PRIME SOURCE AEROSOL 12/CASE - 18-20 oz PACK 34.41 29.80 NO BID 41.64 36.44 34.35 41.71 195.00 33.88 NO BID

241 WINDOW CLEANER NO FRANKLIN CASE 34.41 29.80 NO BID 41.64 2.49 NO BID 15.57 195.00 NO BID NO BID

242 WINDOW CLEANER WARSAW 30 Gal - 6 Per Case CASE 55.72 29.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 195.00 NO BID NO BID

ITEMS BELOW WILL BE AWARDED TO A SINGLE VENDOR

243 BATHMATE CC16 12 Qts/Case CASE 27.20 NO BID NO BID 200.56 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

244 BATHMATE CC16 CASE 27.20 NO BID NO BID 200.56 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

245 DIVERSEY FLOOR FINISHER WAX TIME SAVER - 5 gal/box DIV5104984 CASE 185.01 NO BID NO BID 218.93 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

246 DIVERSEY NEUTERLIZER/CONDITIONER CASE             *** NO BID NO BID 71.08 NO BID NO BID 26.38 NO BID NO BID NO BID

247 DIVERSEY NEUTRAL DIS. FLOOR CLEANER MORNING MIST- 1.5 qt/case CASE 59.14 NO BID NO BID 72.72 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID



248 DIVERSEY SPRAY BOTTLE W/TRIGGER 32 OZ BOTTLE CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID 3.72 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

249 HOT SPRINGS # GP CLEANER-DIV93318102 COMMAND CENTER 2 GAL/CASE CASE 93.11 NO BID NO BID 113.22 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

250 LOOK GLASS CLEANER CC2 18-20 oz/12/case CASE DISCONTINUED NO BID NO BID 68.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

251 RAINDANCE NEUTRAL CLEANER-DIV93323981 COMMAND CENTER- 2 Gallon/Case CASE 150.76 NO BID NO BID 173.87 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

252 SPEEDBALL 2000, WALL CLEANER-DIV95891164COMMAND CENTER- Quart CASE 56.80 NO BID NO BID 79.54 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

253 SPEEDBALL CC1 WALL CLEANER 2 Gallon CASE 152.71 NO BID NO BID 221.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

254 TOILET BOWL CLEANER BUTCHERS -12/qt Case CASE 27.04 NO BID NO BID 200.56 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

255 SPITFIRE - DIV95891789 12/ 32 OZ/ CASE CASE 52.65 NO BID NO BID 180.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

256 SPITFIRE - DIV100469925 2 / 1.5 GAL/CASE CASE 52.65 NO BID NO BID 180.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

257 DIVERSEY CREW DIV100925283 DISINFECTANT CLEANER - 12 / 32OZ BOTTLE/CASE CASE 27.20 NO BID NO BID 42.13 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

258 FLOOR FINISH WAX- DIVERSEY DIV95104811 HIGH MILEAGE4-1 GAL/CASE BOX 117.19 NO BID NO BID 143.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

259 FLOOR WAX STIPPER PRO 5 - DIV95032360 GALLON BOX BOX 103.93 NO BID NO BID 126.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




