
Jefferson County Public Schools
Bid Tabulation 

Event Name: LOCKS & MISCELLANEOUS HARDWARE

Event ID: JCPS-8313

Approval Date: March 26, 2024

Date Bids Received: February 15, 2024

Contract Period: March 30, 2024 through March 29, 2025

Renewals: No renewal options

Comments: AWARD STATUS indicates an award

Item 
Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer 
Part Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes

001 Cam lock, disc tumbler, multi-function, 
KA or KD, 1 3/8".

Must have a 1 - 1 1/4" straight cam and a 1 - 1 1/4" offset cam, 
drawer or cabinet lock. Fort #MFW23138. NO SUBSTITUTE.

5100520-1669252 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 FORT MFW23138 $5.27 $52.70 SPECIFY KA OR KD AT TIME OF 
ORDER

Awarded

002 Cam lock, disc tumbler, multi-function, 
KA or KD, 1 1/8".

Must have a 1 - 1 1/4" straight cam and a 1 - 1 1/4" offset cam, 
drawer or cabinet lock. Fort #MFW23118. NO SUBSTITUTE.

5100520-1669253 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

20 FORT MFW23118 $5.27 $105.40 SPECIFY KA OR KD AT TIME OF 
ORDER

Awarded

003 Cam lock, disc tumbler, multi-function, 
KA or KD, 5/8".

Must have a 1 - 1 1/4" straight cam and a 1 - 1 1/4" offset cam, 
drawer or cabinet lock. Fort #MFW23058-217. NO SUBSTITUTE.

5100520-2012229 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 FORT MFW23058-217 $5.27 $52.70

Awarded

004 Cam lock, 1 7/16", KA. National #C8055-US14A. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100520-1668440 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 NATIONAL C8055-14A $5.32 $53.20 SPECIFY KA OR KD AT TIME OF 
ORDER

Awarded

005 Cap, Best #21C. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1660748 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 500 
Count Pack

10 BEST 21C $11.45 $114.50

Awarded

006 Core, uncombinated, 6-pin, A keyway. Best #1C6A1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100320-1135739 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

5 BEST 1C6A1 $18.19 $90.95

Awarded

007 Core, uncombinated, 6-pin, G keyway. Best #1C6G1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100320-1135720 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

5 BEST 1C6G1 $18.19 $90.95

Awarded

008 Core, uncombinated, 7-pin, US26D, A 
keyway.

Best #1C7A1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1691451 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

100 BEST 1C7A1 $18.19 $1,819.00

Awarded

008 Core, uncombinated, 7-pin, US26D, A 
keyway.

Best #1C7A1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1691451 Lockmasters Inc No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

100 Dorma Kaba/Best 
Access Solutions 
Lockmasters Inc

Best Access 
Solutions/1C-7-A1-

626

$26.55 $2,655.00

009 Core, uncombinated, 7-pin, US26D, D 
keyway.

Best #1C7D1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1688407 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

60 BEST 1C7D1 $18.19 $1,091.40

Awarded

010 Core, uncombinated, 7-pin, US26D, E 
keyway.

Best #1C7E1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1684346 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

100 BEST 1CE1 $18.19 $1,819.00

Awarded

011 Core, uncombinated, 7-pin, US26D, F 
keyway.

Best #1C7F1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1691452 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

100 BEST 1C7F1 $18.19 $1,819.00

Awarded

012 Core, uncombinated, 7-pin, US26D, G 
keyway.

Best #1C7G1.  NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1691453 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

100 BEST 1C7G1 $18.19 $1,819.00

Awarded

013 Cylinder, dummy, 1 7/16". Ilco #7010DC-26D or equal. 5100320-1692300 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

1 ILCO 7010DC-26D $7.92 $7.92

Awarded

014 Cylinder, mortise, without core, with 
C208 cam.

Best #1E74-626. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100320-1135999 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 BEST 1E74-C208RP3626 $30.61 $306.10

Awarded



015 Cylinder, mortise, thumb turn, with C208 
cam.

Best #1E6A4-US26D. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100320-1657790 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 BEST 1EA6A4C417RP362
6

$31.17 $311.70

Awarded

016 Cylinder, mortise, key switch, 7 pin, less 
core.

Best #1W7B2-626. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100320-2002638 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 BEST 1W7B2626 $97.95 $979.50

Awarded

017 Cylinder, rim lock, 7 pin, less core. Best #1E72-626. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100320-1235792 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

20 BEST 12E72RP626 $27.29 $545.80

Awarded

018 Cylinder, turn, knob, classroom function, 
with C208 cam, LH.

Best #1ESPL-7-B35405. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100320-1718951 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

1 BEST 1ESPL7B35405C208
RP3626

$42.53 $42.53

Awarded

019 Cylinder, turn, knob, classroom function, 
with C208 cam, RH.

Best #1ESPL-7-B35405. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100320-1718950 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

1 BEST 1ESPL7B35401C208
RP3626

$42.53 $42.53

Awarded

020 Deadbolt, tubular, less core with 2 3/4" 
backset, thumb turn, standard strike and 

concealed screws.

Best #8T37SSTK-626-CS. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100400-1709610 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 BEST 8T37SSTK626CS $136.60 $1,366.00

Awarded

021 Lock, cabinet/door, 4-pin tumbler, KA or 
KD, for 1 3/8" door, with reversible 

deadbolt and brass cylinder.

CompX/National #C8175-US26D. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100520-1664003 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 COMPX C8175-26D $22.31 $223.10 SPECIFY KA OR KD AT TIME OF 
ORDER

Awarded

022 Lock, antique brass, cabinet/drawer, disc 
tumbler, 1 1/8" cylinder length. KA.

National #C8705-4G. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100520-1715156 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

1 COMPX C8705-4G $8.06 $8.06

Awarded

023 Lock, antique brass, cabinet/drawer, disc 
tumbler, 1 1/8" cylinder length. KD.

National #C8705-4G. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100520-1715155 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

1 COMPX C8705-4G $8.06 $8.06

Awarded

024 Lock, disc tumbler handle. National #C8758-US26D. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100520-1669249 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

1 COMPX C8758-26D $21.05 $21.05 SPECIFY KA OR KD AT TIME OF 
ORDER

Awarded

025 Lock, drawer/cabinet, disc tumbler. KA. National #C8703-US3. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100520-1716725 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 COMPX C8703-US3-KA $7.55 $75.50

Awarded

026 Lock, drawer/cabinet, disc tumbler. KD. National #C8703-US3. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100520-1509728 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

1 COMPX C8703-US3-KD $7.55 $7.55

Awarded

027 Lock kit, file cabinet, KD, plunger type, 
paracentric. Must have square adapter 

plate.

Hon #F28. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100520-1686553 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

20 HON F24/F28 $27.74 $554.80 SPECIFY KA OR KD AT TIME OF 
ORDER

Awarded

028 Lock, showcase/glass sliding door, KA 
and KD.

ESP #8RL or equal. 5100520-1669248 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 HUDSON 8RL $13.10 $131.00 SPECIFY KA OR KD AT TIME OF 
ORDER

Awarded

029 Lock, sliding door, disc tumbler/keyturn. National #C8042-US26D. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100520-1669255 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

1 COMPX C8042-26D $27.03 $27.03 SPECIFY KA OR KD AT TIME OF 
ORDER

Awarded

030 Lock, sliding door, pin tumbler/push-in 
type.

National #C8142-US26D. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100520-1669247 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

1 COMPX C8142-26D $32.46 $32.46 SPECIFY KA OR KD AT TIME OF 
ORDER

Awarded

031 Lockset, cylindrical, classroom lock, 
heavy duty, with cast zinc lever hand and 

2 3/4" backset, less core.

Best #9K3 (Varsity Series) 7R 15D S3 626. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100400-1712186 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

100 BEST 9K37R15DS3626 $253.61 $25,361.00

Awarded

032 Lockset, cylindrical, classroom lock, 
heavy duty, with round knob and 2 3/4" 

backset, less core.

Best #8K3 7R 4D S3 626. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100400-1726120 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

20 BEST 8K37R4DS3626RH $271.49 $5,429.80

Awarded

033 Lockset, cylindrical, communicating lock, 
heavy duty, with cast zinc lever handle 

and 2 3/4" backset, less core.

Best #9K3 (Varsity Series) 7S 15D S3 626. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100400-1714252 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

5 BEST 9K37S15DS3626 $289.50 $1,447.50

Awarded

034 Lockset, cylindrical, entrance lock, heavy 
duty, with cast zinc lever handle and 2 

3/4" backset, less core.

Best #9K3 (Varsity Series) 7AB 15D S3 626. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100400-1714250 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 BEST 9K37AB15DS3626 $253.61 $2,536.10

Awarded



035 Lockset, cylindrical, entrance lock, heavy 
duty, with round knob and 2 3/4" 

backset, less core.

Best #8K3 7AB 4D S3 626. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100400-1675028 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 BEST 8K37AB4DS3626RH $271.49 $2,714.90

Awarded

036 Lockset, cylindrical, dormitory function, 
heavy duty, with cast zinc lever handle 

and 2 3/4" backset, less core.

Best #9K3 (Varsity Series) 7T 15D S3 626. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100400-1730511 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 BEST 9K37T15DS3626 $256.07 $2,560.70

Awarded

037 Lockset, cylindrical, storeroom lock with 
tactile lever handle and 2 3/4" backset, 

less core.

Best #9K3 7D 15D-S3-626-TLB. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100400-1714255 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 BEST 7K37D15DS3626TL/
B

$290.14 $2,901.40

Awarded

038 Lockset, cylindrical, "Exit Only" lock, 
heavy duty, with cast zinc lever handle 

and 2 3/4" backset, less core.

Best #9K3 (Varsity Series) OY 15D STK 626. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100400-1714254 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

5 BEST 9K30Y15DSTK626 $179.28 $896.40

Awarded

039 Lockset, cylindrical, storeroom function, 
2 3/4" backset, less core, round knob, 

satin finish.

Best #8K3 7D4DS3 626. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100400-2009748 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

5 BEST 9K37DSDS3626RH $271.49 $1,357.45

Awarded

040 Lockset, cylindrical, passage lock, heavy 
duty, with cast zinc lever handle and 2 

3/4" backset, less core.

Best #9K3 (Varsity Series) ON 15D S3 626. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100400-1714256 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 BEST 9K30N15DS3626 $177.56 $1,775.60

Awarded

041 Lockset, cylindrical, privacy lock, heavy 
duty, with cast zinc lever handle and 2 

3/4" backset, less core.

Best #9K3 (Varsity Series) OL 15D S3 626. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100400-1714253 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

5 BEST 9K30L15DS3626 $204.07 $1,020.35

Awarded

042 Padlock. Special reserved keyway for 
General Maintenance Dept. ONLY.

#10027. Master #KAMKRSVW1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100680-1052542 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

60 MASTER 1KAMKW1RSV 
10027

$13.61 $816.60

Awarded

043 Padlock. Special reserved keyway for 
General Maintenance Dept. ONLY.

#10028. Master #KAMKRSVW1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100680-1052462 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

60 MASTER 1KAMKW1RSV 
10028

$13.61 $816.60

Awarded

044 Padlock. Special reserved keyway for 
General Maintenance Dept. ONLY.

#10079. Master #KAMKRSVW1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100680-1052506 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

60 MASTER 1KAMKW1RSV 
10095

$13.61 $816.60

Awarded

045 Padlock. Special reserved keyway for 
General Maintenance Dept. ONLY.

#10095. Master #KAMKRSVW1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100680-1052524 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

60 MASTER 1KAMKW1RSV 
10095

$13.61 $816.60

Awarded

046 Padlock. Special reserved keyway for 
General Maintenance Dept. ONLY.

#10152. Master #KAMKRSVW1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100680-1052515 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

60 MASTER 1KAMKW1RSV 
10152

$13.61 $816.60

Awarded

047 Padlock. Special reserved keyway for 
General Maintenance Dept. ONLY.

#10209. Master #1RMK. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100680-1052471 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

60 MASTER 1KAMKW1RSV 
10209

$13.61 $816.60

Awarded

048 Padlock. Special reserved keyway for 
General Maintenance Dept. ONLY.

#10228 Master #1RMK. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100680-1052533 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

60 MASTER 1KAMKW1RSV 
10228

$13.61 $816.60

Awarded

049 Padlock. Special reserved keyway for 
General Maintenance Dept. ONLY.

#10285. Master #1RMK. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100680-1052453 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

60 MASTER 1KAMKW1RSV 
10285

$13.61 $816.60

Awarded

050 Padlock. Special reserved keyway for 
General Maintenance Dept. ONLY.

#10286. Master #1RMK. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100680-1052444 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

60 MASTER 1KAMKW1RSV 
10286

$13.61 $816.60

Awarded

051 Padlock. Special reserved keyway for 
General Maintenance Dept. ONLY.

#10362. Master #1RMK. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100680-1052499 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

24 MASTER 1KAMKW1RSV 
10362

$13.61 $326.64

Awarded

052 Padlock, KD. Master #1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100680-1676197 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 MASTER 1 $6.94 $69.40

Awarded

053 Padlock, 3/8" diameter, with steel 
shackle, less core, 1 1/2".

Best #41B722-L. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100680-2010332 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 BEST 41B722L $25.98 $259.80

Awarded

054 Padlock, 5/16" diameter, with steel 
shackle, less core, 2".

Best #21B772-L. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100680-1234882 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 BEST 21B772L $26.50 $265.00

Awarded



054 Padlock, 5/16" diameter, with steel 
shackle, less core, 2".

Best #21B772-L. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100680-1234882 Lockmasters Inc No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 Dorma Kaba/ Best 
Access Solutions 
/Lockmasters Inc

Best Access 
Solutoins /21B-7-72-

L

$39.43 $394.30

055 Padlock, 5/16" diameter, with steel 
shackle, less core, 4".

Best #21B782-L. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100680-1234891 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 BEST 21B782L $29.75 $297.50

Awarded

056 Padlock, 3/8" diameter, with steel 
shackle, less core, 2".

Best #41B772-L. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100680-1653132 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 BEST 41B772L $104.00 $1,040.00

Awarded

057 Spring. Best #22S. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1413303 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 500 
Count Pack

10 BEST 22S $25.44 $254.40

Awarded

058 Tumbler pin, bottom, for A2 system. Best #2B. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1138469 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

1 BEST 2B $7.89 $7.89

Awarded

059 Tumbler pin, bottom, for A2 system. Best #4B. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1138441 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

1 BEST 4B $7.89 $7.89

Awarded

060 Tumbler pin, bottom, for A2 system. Best #5B. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1138450 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

1 BEST 5B $7.89 $7.89

Awarded

061 Tumbler pin, bottom, for A2 system. Best #6B. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1138432 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

1 BEST 6B $7.89 $7.89

Awarded

062 Tumbler pin, bottom, for A2 system. Best #7B. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1185033 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

1 BEST 7B $7.89 $7.89

Awarded

063 Tumbler pin, bottom, for A2 system. Best #8B. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1653286 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

1 BEST 8B $7.89 $7.89

Awarded

064 Tumbler pin, bottom, for A2 system. Best #11B. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1185051 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

1 BEST 11B $7.89 $7.89

Awarded

065 Tumbler pin, bottom, for A2 system. Best #12B. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1512072 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

1 BEST 12B $7.89 $7.89

Awarded

066 Tumbler pin, bottom, for A2 system. Best #13B. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1413287 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

1 BEST 13B $7.89 $7.89

Awarded

067 Tumbler pin, bottom, for A2 system. Best #14B. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1138423 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

1 BEST 14B $7.89 $7.89

Awarded

068 Tumbler pin, bottom, for A2 system. Best #15B. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-2002619 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

1 BEST 15B $7.89 $7.89

Awarded

069 Tumbler pin, bottom, for A2 system. Best #16B. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-2002620 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

1 BEST 16B $7.89 $7.89

Awarded

070 Tumbler pin, bottom, for A2 system. Best #17B. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-2002621 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

1 BEST 17B $7.89 $7.89

Awarded

071 Tumbler pin, bottom, for A2 system. Best #18B. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-2002622 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

1 BEST 18B $7.89 $7.89

Awarded

072 Tumbler pin, bottom, for A2 system. Best #19B. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-2002623 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

1 BEST 19B $7.89 $7.89

Awarded

073 Tumbler pin, bottom, for A4 system. Best #0E. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1699080 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

10 BEST 0E $7.89 $78.90

Awarded



074 Tumbler pin, bottom, for A4 system. Best #1E. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1695134 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

10 BEST 1E $7.89 $78.90

Awarded

075 Tumbler pin, bottom, for A4 system. Best #2E. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1695135 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

10 BEST 2E $7.89 $78.90

Awarded

076 Tumbler pin, bottom, for A4 system. Best #3E. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1714258 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

10 BEST 3E $7.89 $78.90

Awarded

077 Tumbler pin, bottom, for A4 system. Best #4E. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1714259 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

10 BEST 4E $7.89 $78.90

Awarded

078 Tumbler pin, bottom, for A4 system. Best #5E. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1714260 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

10 BEST 5E $7.89 $78.90

Awarded

079 Tumbler pin, top, for A2 system. Best #0A. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1512081 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

1 BEST 0A $7.89 $7.89

Awarded

080 Tumbler pin, top, for A2 system. Best #1A. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-2002624 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

1 BEST 1A $7.89 $7.89

Awarded

081 Tumbler pin, top, for A2 system. Best #2A. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-2002625 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

1 BEST 2A $7.89 $7.89

Awarded

082 Tumbler pin, top, for A2 system. Best #3A. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1512090 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

1 BEST 3A $7.89 $7.89

Awarded

083 Tumbler pin, top, for A2 system. Best #4A. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-2002626 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

1 BEST 4A $7.89 $7.89

Awarded

084 Tumbler pin, top, for A2 system. Best #5A. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-2002627 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

1 BEST 5A $7.89 $7.89

Awarded

085 Tumbler pin, top, for A2 system. Best #6A. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-2002628 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

1 BEST 6A $7.89 $7.89

Awarded

086 Tumbler pin, top, for A2 system. Best #7A. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-2002629 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

1 BEST 7A $7.89 $7.89

Awarded

087 Tumbler pin, top, for A2 system. Best #8A. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-2002630 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

1 BEST 8A $7.89 $7.89

Awarded

088 Tumbler pin, top, for A2 system. Best #9A. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-2002631 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

1 BEST 9A $7.89 $7.89

Awarded

089 Tumbler pin, top, for A4 system. Best #1F. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1690752 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

20 BEST 1F $7.89 $157.80

Awarded

090 Tumbler pin, top, for A4 system. Best #2F. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1690753 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

20 BEST 2F $7.89 $157.80

Awarded

091 Tumbler pin, top, for A4 system. Best #3F. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1690754 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

20 BEST 3F $7.89 $157.80

Awarded

092 Tumbler pin, top, for A4 system. Best #4F. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1690755 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

20 BEST 4F $7.89 $157.80

Awarded

093 Tumbler pin, top, for A4 system. Best #5F. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1690756 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

20 BEST 5F $7.89 $157.80

Awarded



094 Tumbler pin, top, for A4 system. Best #6F. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1690757 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

20 BEST 6F $7.89 $157.80

Awarded

095 Tumbler pin, top, for A4 system. Best #7F. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1690758 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Pack

20 BEST 7F $7.89 $157.80

Awarded

096 Armature, fire door. 2 5/8. Projection, 
armature and wall magnet, complete 

set.

Rixson #997M-689. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1300025-1729197 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 RIXSON 997M-689 $313.34 $3,133.40

Awarded

097 Armature, fire door. 3 5/8. Projection, 
armature and wall magnet, complete 

set.

Rixson #998M-689. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1300025-1729198 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 RIXSON 998M-689 $313.34 $3,133.40

Awarded

098 Device, exit, electrified. LHR. Precision #ELR-2101-LD-630-3. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1300025-2012497 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

1 PHI ELR-2101-LD-630 $731.33 $731.33

Awarded

099 Device, panic vertical. LHR. Monarch/Falcon #25-V-L-LHR Dane US32D. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100600-1725988 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

1 FALCON 25-V-L-32D-LHR $788.57 $788.57

Awarded

100 Device, panic vertical. RHR. Monarch/Falcon #25-V-L-RHR Dane US32D. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100600-1725986 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

1 FALCON 25-V-L-32D-RHR $788.57 $788.57

Awarded

101 Holder, fire door, magnet. Rixson #996219-3V. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1300025-1729196 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 RIXSON 99219-3V $180.66 $1,806.60

Awarded

102 Keypad, electronic weather proof, self 
contained metal housing. 

IEI #232SE. NO SUBSTITUTE 5100600-2002160 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

There were no 
bids received for 

this item. 

103 Loop, door. Alarm Lock Corp. #271. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100600-1730753 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

15 ALARM LOCK 271 $24.15 $362.25

Awarded

104 Mullion bar fittings, aluminum, for 
Monarch #2923, bottom fitting.

Monarch/Falcon #60105. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100600-1676112 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

5 FALCON 60105 $27.83 $139.15

Awarded

105 Mullion bar fittings for Monarch/Falcon 
#4023, top fitting.

Monarch/Falcon #60104, Falcon #050335. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100600-2001715 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

1 FALCON 50335 $37.43 $37.43

Awarded

106 Power, supply. Precision #ELR-151. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1300025-2012499 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

1 PHI ELR151 $459.68 $459.68

Awarded

107 Power supply. Falcon #PS914X900-2RS. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100600-2011242 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 FALCON PS914X900-2RS $521.93 $5,219.30

Awarded

108 Rim panic device, basic assembly, no 
outside trim, less cylinder. #32, chrome, 

short and stainless.

Monarch/Falcon #ELR-25-R-E0-32D. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100600-1730751 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 FALCON MEL-25-R-EO-32D-
3'

$715.70 $7,157.00

Awarded

109 Rim panic device, basic assembly, no 
outside trim, less cylinder. #32 chrome 

and stainless.

Monarch/Falcon #25-R-E0-32D. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100600-1714266 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 FALCON 25-R-EO-32D-3' $437.44 $4,374.40

Awarded

110 Rim panic device, Monarch/Falcon #25-R-
L-LHR Dane short, with lever handle, less 

cylinder, #32D, LHR.

Monarch/Falcon #25-R-L-LHR. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100600-1714268 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

5 FALCON 25-R-L-32D-3'-LHR $590.89 $2,954.45

Awarded

111 Rim panic device, Monarch/Falcon #25-R-
L-RHR Dane short, with lever handle, 

less cylinder, #32D, RHR.

Monarch/Falcon #25-R-L-RHR. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100600-1714272 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

5 FALCON 25-R-L-32D-3'-RHR $590.89 $2,954.45

Awarded

112 Vertical panic device, LHR. Monarch/Falcon #EL25-V-E0-US32D-LHR. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100600-1734466 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

5 FALCON MEL-25-V-EO-32D-
3'-LHR

$916.98 $4,584.90

Awarded

113 Vertical panic device, RHR. Monarch/Falcon #EL25-V-E0-US32D-RHR. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100600-1734467 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

5 FALCON MEL-25-V-EO-32D-
3'-RHR

$916.98 $4,584.90

Awarded



114 Door closer,  aluminum, with regular 
arm and shoe plate.

LCN #4040XP.  NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100080-1410557 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 LCN 4040XP-RW/PA-AL-
TBSRT

$255.30 $2,553.00

Awarded

114 Door closer,  aluminum, with regular 
arm and shoe plate.

LCN #4040XP.  NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100080-1410557 Lockmasters Inc No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 Allegion/LCN/ 
Lockmasters Inc

Allegion LCN/4040 
XP RW PA ALUM 

TBSRT

$301.66 $3,016.60

115 Door closer, aluminum, with regular 
arm, LH.

LCN #4011. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100080-1654547 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

5 LCN 4011-REG-689-LH $245.62 $1,228.10

Awarded

116 Door closer, aluminum, with regular 
arm, LH.

LCN Smoothie #4111. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100080-1699990 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

24 LCN 4111-EDA-689-LH $244.10 $5,858.40

Awarded

117 Door closer, aluminum, with regular 
arm, RH.

LCN #4011. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100080-1654546 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

5 LCN 4011-REG-689-RH $245.62 $1,228.10

Awarded

118 Door closer, aluminum, with regular 
arm, RH.

LCN Smoothie #4111. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100080-1699989 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

24 LCN 4111-EDA-689-RH $244.10 $5,858.40

Awarded

119 Door closer, 120 volt, aluminum, with 
conversion plate, LH.

LCN Sentronic #4314ME-SF. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100080-1699995 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

5 LCN 4314ME-SF-689-LH-
120V

$650.17 $3,250.85

Awarded

120 Door closer, 120 volt, aluminum, with 
conversion plate, RH.

LCN Sentronic #4314ME-SF. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100080-1699994 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

5 LCN 4314ME-SF-689-RH-
120V

$650.17 $3,250.85

Awarded

121 Door closer, aluminum, LH/RH. LCN #4031. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100080-1723961 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

2 LCN 4031-REG-689 $232.47 $464.94

Awarded

122 Door push/pull, 3 1/2" x 15 3/4", satin 
aluminum finsih. 

Rockwood #91-US28 or equal. 5100080-1234953 There were no 
bids received for 

this item. 

123 Door pull, 7 1/2" center, satin aluminum 
finsih. 

Rockwood #134-US28 or equal. 5100080-1234426 There were no 
bids received for 

this item. 

124 Hinge, butt, heavy duty, 4 1/2" x 4 1/2". Hager #BB1168 or equal. 4680460-1591666 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 2 Count 
Box

1 STANLEY FBB168-4.5X4.5HW-
26D

$19.17 $19.17 PRICED 2 PER BOX

Awarded

125 Hinge, butt, tight pin/pivoted pin 3" x 3" 
zinc plated.

Stanley #2n-808-FSP or equal. 4680460-1665165 There were no 
bids received for 

this item. 

126 Hinge, double action, 4" x 4", for 
swinging door for 1 3/8" doors.

Bommer #3029-US1B, Hagar #1303-4-USP or equal. 4680460-1160694 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

1 HAGER 1303-4-USP $18.57 $18.57 PRICED EACH

Awarded

127 Hinge, full mortise/butt, prime coat, 4" x 
4".

Hager #1279-4x4-USP, Stanley #F179-USP or equal. 4680460-1162405 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 STANLEY F179-4X4-P $2.04 $20.40 PRICED EACH

Awarded

128 Hinge, tee, extra heavy-zinc plate. 4". Stanley #908-2C or equal. 4680460-1653896 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 2 Count 
Box

1 NATIONAL N129-007 $10.53 $10.53 PRICED PER PACK OF 2

Awarded

129 Hinge, template butt, 4 1/2" x 4 1/2". Hager #BB1279, Stanley #FBB179-26D or equal. 4600460-1330303 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 2 Count 
Box

200 STANLEY FBB179-4.5X4.5-
26D

$9.05 $1,810.00 PRICED 2 PER BOX

Awarded

130 Hinge, weld-on, 5" x 5". Hager #1850PS, Stanley #850PS or equal. 4600460-1051427 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 2 Count 
Box

10 STANLEY 850-5X5-PS $19.23 $192.30 PRICED 2 PER BOX

Awarded

131 Threshold, aluminum, 1/2" x 5" x 72". Pemko #154A72, National Guard #425 72" or equal. 5100960-2010202 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

1 NGP 425-72" $67.99 $67.99

Awarded

132 Threshold saddle, aluminum, mill finish, 
handicap accessible, 1/2" x 4" x 6'.

Pemko #170A or equal. 5100960-2010203 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

1 PEMKO 170A-72" $50.40 $50.40

Awarded



133 Bolt, surface, 8", concealed mount with 
both strikes.

Don-Jo #1578 626, Ives #SB1630TB US26 or equal. 5100040-1128872 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

20 DON JO 1578-626 $16.71 $334.20

Awarded

134 Bottom door sweep, 36". National Guard #200NA or equal. 1515630-1593959 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

20 NGP 200NA-3' $14.90 $298.00

Awarded

135 Bottom door sweep, 48". National Guard #200NA or equal. 1515630-1665006 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

20 NGP 200NA-4' $19.85 $397.00

Awarded

136 Bracket, hand rail, aluminum. Ives #HB159 US27 or equal. 4680060-1045881 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

20 IVES HB159-US27 $10.16 $203.20

Awarded

137 Catch/magnetic, for cabinet. Amerock #CM9773PT or equal. 4680260-1319040 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

1 AMEROCK CM9773PT $1.42 $1.42

Awarded

138 Coat and hat hook, aluminum, with 3" 
projection.

Ives #571A92 or equal. 4680470-1052319 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 IVES 571A92 $0.74 $7.40

Awarded

139 Conversion plate/remodeler plate kit, 
stainless steel, satin.

Don-Jo #RPK-109-32D or equal. 5100720-1716510 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 DON JO RPK-109-630 $28.82 $288.20

Awarded

140 Cord, sash, braided cotton with synthetic 
core, 100-ft. hank, 1/4", 800-lb. test.

Aetna #8 or equal. 4680340-1051981 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Foot 

Purchase

1 SAMSON 001-080-05 #8 SASH 
CORD

$32.40 $32.40

Awarded

141 Cord, sash, braided cotton with synthetic 
core, 100-ft. hank, 5/16", 1,350-lb. test.

Aetna #10 or equal. 4680340-1592101 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Foot 

Purchase

1 AETNA P/N 220640, 
AETNA# 10 SASH 

CORD

$31.19 $31.19

Awarded

142 Door holder, kick down. 8". Grand #608 or equal. 4680770-2011436 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 GRAND 608-Z $16.24 $162.40

Awarded

143 Door holder, lever type, aluminum. Ives #FS544-4 SP28 or equal. 4680770-1061818 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 IVES FS544-SP28 $6.14 $61.40

Awarded

144 Door stop and bumper. Glynn Johnson #WSB33-US26D or equal. 4680770-1590569 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 IVES WS33-US26D $27.41 $274.10

Awarded

145 Flushbolt. Don-Jo #1555 12-626 or equal. 5100040-1180627 There were no 
bids received for 

this item. 

146 Flushbolt. Don-Jo #1555 12-626 or equal. 5100040-1180627 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

5 DON JO 1555-626 $12.65 $63.25

Awarded

147 Install-A-Lock blank channel, stainless, 1 
3/4" x 4 1/4" x 4 1/2".

Don-Jo #80S. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1718521 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

5 DON JO 80-S-CW $8.14 $40.70

Awarded

148 Install-A-Lock blank channel, stainless, 1 
3/4" x 4 1/4" x 9".

Don-Jo #40S. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1653728 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

5 DON JO 40-S-CW $11.36 $56.80

Awarded

149 Install-A-Lock/door reinforcer, stainless, 
1 3/4" x 4 3/4" x 9", prepped for Best 

#93K lever lock with 2 3/4" backset and 
threaded insert, .032 thick.

Don-Jo #9K-S-CW. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100720-1724760 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 DON JO 9K-S-CW $11.36 $113.60

Awarded

150 Kickplate, aluminum, 16 gauge, .050", 
10" x 34".

Rockwood #10x34-US28, Don-Jo or equal. 4680560-1676230 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 DON JO 90-628-10X34 $28.80 $288.00

Awarded

151 Latch protector, short, for out-swinging 
doors, 3" x 6", use on hollow metal 
door/frame, with A.S.A. strike plate. 

Silver plated.

Don-Jo #SLP-206-SL. NO SUBSTITUTE. 1515185-1709419 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 DON JO SLP-206-SL $9.48 $94.80

Awarded

152 Locking bar, 51 1/4", for standard 4-
drawer file cabinets.

File-Guard #2504, ABUS-MLK-4 or equal. 5100520-1715744 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 ABUS 7040 $42.37 $423.70

Awarded



153 Plate, cover for Don-Jo #160 and #161 
cylindrical lock cut-out, prime coat for 1 
3/8" and 1 3/4" doors. 2 5/8" diameter 

with welded steel, 18-gauge steel.

Don-Jo #BF161 PC, Precision Hardware #1610 or equal. 5100720-1692285 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 DON JO BF-161-PC $2.09 $20.90

Awarded

154 Plate, push, aluminum, 3 1/2" x 15". Don-Jo #70-628, Rockwood #73B-US28, General Lock #BH7D-628 
or equal.

4680560-1651759 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 DON JO 70-628 $7.69 $76.90

Awarded

155 Ring, 3/4" zinc plated, 1000/box. Hoffman #GAK4. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100920-2009743 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1000 
Count Box

2 HPC GAK-4 $13.90 $27.80

Awarded

156 Tag, brass, 1 3/8", 38/box. Progressive #011 or equal. 5100920-1724373 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 38 
Count Box

2 PROGRESSIVE 11 $18.66 $37.32

Awarded

157 Tag, utility, 1 3/16". Metal rim tag with a 
smooth writing surface. Tag has an 

attached string, looped and knotted, 
100/bx. 

Hoffman #ERD1 or equal. 5100920-2009744 There were no 
bids received for 

this item. 

LotI tem 
Number 
158-160 Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer 
Part Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes

158 Drawer/cabinet pull, 3" center, dull 
chrome.

Don-Jo #62-626 or equal. 4680140-1051712 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

50 DON JO 62-626 $3.76 $188.00

Awarded

159 Drawer/cabinet pull, 3 1/2" center, dull 
chrome.

Don-Jo #64-626 or equal. 4680140-2014199 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

50 DON JO 64-626 $3.93 $196.50

Awarded

160 Drawer/cabinet pull, 4" center, dull 
chrome.

Don-Jo #66-626 or equal. 4680140-2014200 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

50 DON JO 66-626 $3.98 $199.00

Awarded

LotI tem 
Number 
161-172 Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer 
Part Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes

161 Hex key, triangle head, 7/32". Monarch/Falcon #2789060109. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7720400-1103317 There were no 
bids received for 

this item. 

162 Hex key, triangle head, 5/32". Von Duprin #227/90085. NO SUBSTITUTE. 7720400-1103308 There were no 
bids received for 

this item. 

LotI tem 
Number 
163-173 Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer 
Part Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes

163 Key, blank, A keyway. Best #1A1A1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100240-1135864 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 144 
Count Box

5 BEST 1A1A1KS654KS292 $198.72 $993.60 PRICED PER 144 EACH

Awarded

164 Key, blank, D keyway. Best #1A1D1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100240-1688406 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 144 
Count Box

5 BEST 1A1D1KS654KS292 $198.72 $993.60 PRICED PER 144 EACH

Awarded

165 Key, blank, E keyway. Best #1A1E1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100240-1413643 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 144 
Count Box

5 BEST 1A1E1KS654KS292 $198.72 $993.60 PRICED PER 144 EACH

Awarded

166 Key, blank, F keyway.  Best #1A1F1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100240-1693801 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 144 
Count Box

5 BEST 1A1F1KS654KS292 $198.72 $993.60 PRICED PER 144 EACH

Awarded

167 Key, blank, G keyway, 6 pin. Best #1A1G1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100240-1135873 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 144 
Count Box

2 BEST 1A1G1KS654KS292 $198.72 $397.44 PRICED PER 144 EACH

Awarded

168 Key, blank, AG keyway. Best #1A1AG1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100240-1514436 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 144 
Count Box

2 BEST 1A1AG1KS654KS292 $437.19 $874.38 PRICED PER 144 EACH

Awarded

169 Key, blank, master blank for A-E-D-F & G 
keyways.

Best #1A1AEDFG1. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100240-1682125 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 100 
Count Box

2 BEST 1A1ADEFG1KS654K
S292

$858.00 $1,716.00 PRICED PER 100 EACH

Awarded



170 Key, blank. Chicago #DK5. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100240-1234588 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 50 
Count Box

1 COMPX DK-5 $37.80 $37.80 PRICED PER 50 EACH

Awarded

171 Key, blank. Ilco #1003M. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100240-1680991 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 50 
Count Box

1 ILCO CO106-BR $15.00 $15.00 PRICED PER 50 EACH

Awarded

172 Key, blank.  Ilco #1092C. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100240-1734465 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 50 
Count Box

1 ILCO 1092C $24.60 $24.60 PRICED PER 50 EACH

Awarded

173 Key, blank. Kwikset #1063. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100240-1234855 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 50 
Count Box

1 ILCO KW1-BR $13.00 $13.00 PRICED PER 50 EACH

Awarded

LotI tem 
Number 
174-175 Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer 
Part Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes

174 Lock, combination, built-in, for lift 
handle lockers, hinged on right.

Master Lock #1630. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100680-2013224 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

100 MASTER 1630 $26.09 $2,609.00

Awarded

175 Key, Master, for #1630 locker 
combination lock.

Master Lock #K1630. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100240-2013225 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 MASTER K1630 $5.10 $51.00

Awarded

LotI tem 
Number 
176-177 Item/Service Description Commodity Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer 
Part Number Unit Bid Price Total Price Vendor Response Item Notes Award Status Award Notes

176 Padlock, 1 7/8", combination, general 
security, with key control feature. For 

use with school lockers.

Master Lock #1525. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100680-2013222 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

1000 MASTER 1525 $5.83 $5,830.00

Awarded

177 Key, Master, for #1525 Master 
Combination lock.

Master Lock #K1525. NO SUBSTITUTE. 5100240-2013223 Independent 
Hardware, Inc.

No 1 - 1 Each 
Purchase

10 MASTER K1525 $4.99 $49.90

Awarded



Jefferson County Public Schools
Tabulation - Award Totals 
Event Name: Locks & Misc. Hardware
Event ID: JCPS-8313

Vendor Awarded Total
Independent Hardware, 

Inc. 
$167,925.55

Lockmasters Inc. $0.00
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