
Jefferson County Public Schools
Bid Tabulation 

Event Name: Paper (Materials Production) 

Event ID: JCPS-8304

Approval Date: January 23, 2024

Date Bids Received: December 18, 2023

Contract Period: January 24, 2024 through July 25, 2024

Renewals: No renewal option

Comments: Award Status indicates an award

Item 
Number Item/Service Description

Commodity 
Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer Part 
Number Unit Bid Price Total Price

Vendor Response Item 
Notes Supplier Notes Award Status Award Notes

1 Paper, 65# white, cover smooth, Accent 
Opaque Digital.

12" x 18" short grain, 1,250 sheets per box. A total of 100,000 sheets may 
be purchased. PLEASE PRICE PER 1,000 (M).

5760240-
2013916

The Millcraft Paper 
Company

No 1000 Count Purchase 100 Sylvamo/Millcraft Sylvamo/Millcraft Accent 
Opaque/AB3628

56.832 5683.2 1%,net30

Awarded

1 Paper, 65# white, cover smooth, Accent 
Opaque Digital.

12" x 18" short grain, 1,250 sheets per box. A total of 100,000 sheets may 
be purchased. PLEASE PRICE PER 1,000 (M).

5760240-
2013916

Athens Paper Company No 1000 Count Purchase 100 Sylvamo (Formerly 
International Paper)

Sylvamo (Formerly 
International Paper) 

188094

64.75 6475 Terms: NET 30 days

Lot Item 
Nos. 2-3 Item/Service Description

Commodity 
Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer Part 
Number Unit Bid Price Total Price

Vendor Response Item 
Notes Supplier Notes Award Status Award Notes

2 Paper, 50# smooth offset text. Williamsburg or Husky. NO SUBSTITUTE. 11" x 17" long grain, 92 brightness 
or brighter. Acid free, ream wrapped, 2,500 sheets per carton. A total of 
1,000,000 sheets may be purchased. Meets the ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992 
requirement for paper permanence and National Association of State 

Textbook Administrators (NASTA) specifications. PLEASE PRICE PER 1,000 
(M).

5760240-
2011887

The Millcraft Paper 
Company

No 1000 Count Purchase 1000 Domtar/Millcraft Domtar/Millcraft 
Husky/AB1957

19.66 19660 1%,net30

Awarded

3 Paper, 60# smooth offset text. Williamsburg or Husky. NO SUBSTITUTE. 11" x 17" long grain, 92 brightness 
or brighter. Acid free, ream wrapped, 2,500 sheets per carton. A total of 
1,500,000 sheets may be purchased. Meets the ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992 
requirement for paper permanence and National Association of State 

Textbook Administrators (NASTA) specifications. PLEASE PRICE PER 1,000 
(M).

5760240-
2011888

The Millcraft Paper 
Company

No 1000 Count Purchase 1500 Domtar/Millcraft Domtar/Millcraft 
Husky/AB1961

22.252 33378 1%,net30

Awarded

2 Paper, 50# smooth offset text. Williamsburg or Husky. NO SUBSTITUTE. 11" x 17" long grain, 92 brightness 
or brighter. Acid free, ream wrapped, 2,500 sheets per carton. A total of 
1,000,000 sheets may be purchased. Meets the ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992 
requirement for paper permanence and National Association of State 

Textbook Administrators (NASTA) specifications. PLEASE PRICE PER 1,000 
(M).

5760240-
2011887

Athens Paper Company No 1000 Count Purchase 1000 Sylvamo (Formerly 
International Paper)

Sylvamo (Formerly 
International Paper) 05317

23 23000 Priced per 1000 sheets - 
TERMS: NET 30 days

3 Paper, 60# smooth offset text. Williamsburg or Husky. NO SUBSTITUTE. 11" x 17" long grain, 92 brightness 
or brighter. Acid free, ream wrapped, 2,500 sheets per carton. A total of 
1,500,000 sheets may be purchased. Meets the ANSI/NISO Z39.48-1992 
requirement for paper permanence and National Association of State 

Textbook Administrators (NASTA) specifications. PLEASE PRICE PER 1,000 
(M).

5760240-
2011888

Athens Paper Company No 1000 Count Purchase 1500 Sylvamo Sylvamo 05327 24 36000 Priced per 1000 sheets - 
TERMS: Net 30 days

Lot Item 
Nos. 4-6 Item/Service Description

Commodity 
Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer Part 
Number Unit Bid Price Total Price

Vendor Response Item 
Notes Supplier Notes Award Status Award Notes

4 Paper, 80# white coated cover. Endurance Digital gloss cover or equal. 12" x 18", short grain, ream 
wrapped, 250 sheets per package, 2,500 sheets per carton. A total of 

300,000 sheets may be purchased. PLEASE PRICE PER 1,000 (M). IF 
BIDDING THE APPROVED PRODUCT, NO SAMPLE IS REQUIRED.

5760240-
2013352

The Millcraft Paper 
Company

No 1000 Count Purchase 300 Moorim/Millcraft Moorim/Millcraft Pro-
Digital/AJ2573

68.028 20408.4 1%,net30

Awarded

5 Paper, 100# white coated cover. Endurance Digital gloss cover or equal. 12" x 18", short grain, ream 
wrapped, 250 sheets per package, 2,500 sheets per carton. A total of 

300,000 sheets may be purchased. PLEASE PRICE PER 1,000 (M). IF 
BIDDING THE APPROVED PRODUCT, NO SAMPLE IS REQUIRED.

5760240-
2013353

The Millcraft Paper 
Company

No 1000 Count Purchase 300 Moorim/Millcraft Moorim/Millcraft Pro-
Digital/aj2579

85.546 25663.8 1%,net30

Awarded

6 Paper, 100# white coated text. Endurance Digital gloss text or equal. 12" x 18", long grain, ream wrapped, 
250 sheets per package, 2,500 sheets per carton. A total of 300,000 sheets 

may be purchased. PLEASE PRICE PER 1,000 (M). IF BIDDING THE 
APPROVED PRODUCT, NO SAMPLE IS REQUIRED.

5760240-
2013354

The Millcraft Paper 
Company

No 1000 Count Purchase 300 Moorim/Millcraft Moorim/Millcraft Pro-
Digital/aj2582

45.367 13610.1

Awarded

4 Paper, 80# white coated cover. Endurance Digital gloss cover or equal. 12" x 18", short grain, ream 
wrapped, 250 sheets per package, 2,500 sheets per carton. A total of 

300,000 sheets may be purchased. PLEASE PRICE PER 1,000 (M). IF 
BIDDING THE APPROVED PRODUCT, NO SAMPLE IS REQUIRED.

5760240-
2013352

Athens Paper Company No 1000 Count Purchase 300 Moorim Moorim 396935 83 24900 TERMS: Net 30



5 Paper, 100# white coated cover. Endurance Digital gloss cover or equal. 12" x 18", short grain, ream 
wrapped, 250 sheets per package, 2,500 sheets per carton. A total of 

300,000 sheets may be purchased. PLEASE PRICE PER 1,000 (M). IF 
BIDDING THE APPROVED PRODUCT, NO SAMPLE IS REQUIRED.

5760240-
2013353

Athens Paper Company No 1000 Count Purchase 300 Moorim Moorim 396932 100.3 30090 TERMS: Net 30 days

6 Paper, 100# white coated text. Endurance Digital gloss text or equal. 12" x 18", long grain, ream wrapped, 
250 sheets per package, 2,500 sheets per carton. A total of 300,000 sheets 

may be purchased. PLEASE PRICE PER 1,000 (M). IF BIDDING THE 
APPROVED PRODUCT, NO SAMPLE IS REQUIRED.

5760240-
2013354

Athens Paper Company No 1000 Count Purchase 300 Moorim Moorim 367902 53.5 16050 TERMS: net 30 days

Lot Item 
Nos. 7-8 Item/Service Description

Commodity 
Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer Part 
Number Unit Bid Price Total Price

Vendor Response Item 
Notes Supplier Notes Award Status Award Notes

7 Paper, 60# white, high gloss permanent 
laser label.

12" x 18", 500 sheets per box. A total of 50,000 sheets may be purchased. 
PLEASE PRICE PER 1,000 (M).

5760240-
2013355

The Millcraft Paper 
Company

No 1000 Count Purchase 25 Mactac/Millcraft Mactac/Millcraft 
Mactac/AF6327

319.71 7992.75 1%,net30
Awarded

8 Paper, 60# white, matte permanent laser 
label.

Showcase Digital 72# liner. 12" x 18", 500 sheets per box. A total of 50,000 
sheets may be purchased. PLEASE PRICE PER 1,000 (M).

5760240-
2013356

The Millcraft Paper 
Company

No 1000 Count Purchase 25 Mactac/Millcraft Mactac/Millcraft 
Mactac/AF6328

296.86 7421.5 1%,net30
Awarded

7 Paper, 60# white, high gloss permanent 
laser label.

12" x 18", 500 sheets per box. A total of 50,000 sheets may be purchased. 
PLEASE PRICE PER 1,000 (M).

5760240-
2013355

Athens Paper Company No 1000 Count Purchase 25 Mactac Mactac HDM1000 402.95 10073.75 TERMS: NET 30

8 Paper, 60# white, matte permanent laser 
label.

Showcase Digital 72# liner. 12" x 18", 500 sheets per box. A total of 50,000 
sheets may be purchased. PLEASE PRICE PER 1,000 (M).

5760240-
2013356

Athens Paper Company No 1000 Count Purchase 25 Mactac Mactac HDM1001 395.5 9887.5 TERMS: NET 30

Lot Item 
Nos. 7-8 Item/Service Description

Commodity 
Code Vendor Name No Bid UOM Quantity

Manufacturer / 
Provider

Manufacturer Part 
Number Unit Bid Price Total Price

Vendor Response Item 
Notes Supplier Notes Award Status Award Notes

9 Envelope, #10, 4 1/8" x 9 1/2". Commercial, open side, diagonal seam, regular, 24# White Wove, packaged 
approx. 500/box, 2,500/case. PLEASE PRICE PER 1,000 (M). SAMPLE 

REQUIRED.

5690280-
2013586

The Millcraft Paper 
Company

No 1000 Count Purchase 252 Standard/Millcraft Standard/Millcraft 
Standard/AJ2940

19.396 4887.79 1%,net30

Awarded

10 Envelope, #10 (Digital) with window, 4 
1/8" x 9 1/2".

Commercial, open side diagonal seam, regular, 24# White Wove, packaged 
approx. 500/box, 2,500/case. PLEASE PRICE PER 1,000 (M). SAMPLE 

REQUIRED.

5690280-
2013587

The Millcraft Paper 
Company

No 1000 Count Purchase 126 Standard/Millcraft Standard/Millcraft 
Standard/AE7075

26.87 3385.62 1%,net30 Lead time is 3-4 weeks to fill 126k, 
we have existing inventory to fill 

partials while we wait. Awarded

9 Envelope, #10, 4 1/8" x 9 1/2". Commercial, open side, diagonal seam, regular, 24# White Wove, packaged 
approx. 500/box, 2,500/case. PLEASE PRICE PER 1,000 (M). SAMPLE 

REQUIRED.

5690280-
2013586

Athens Paper Company No 1000 Count Purchase 252 Cenveo Cenveo 28439 27.5 6930 TERMS: Net 30 days

10 Envelope, #10 (Digital) with window, 4 
1/8" x 9 1/2".

Commercial, open side diagonal seam, regular, 24# White Wove, packaged 
approx. 500/box, 2,500/case. PLEASE PRICE PER 1,000 (M). SAMPLE 

REQUIRED.

5690280-
2013587

Athens Paper Company No 1000 Count Purchase 126 Cenveo Cenveo 73896 34.5 4347 TERMS: Net 30 days



Jefferson County Public Schools
Bid Tabulation - Totals 

Event Name: Paper (Materials Production) 

Event ID: JCPS-8304

Approval Date: January 23, 2024

Vendor Sections Bid Amount Award Amount
The Millcraft Paper 

Company
Bid Items: 1 $5,683.00 $5,683.00 

Athens Paper Company Bid Items: 1 $6,475.00 

The Millcraft Paper 
Company

Lot Items: 2-3 $53,035.00 $53,035.00 

Athens Paper Company Lot Items: 2-3 $59,000.00 

The Millcraft Paper 
Company

Lot Items: 4-6 $59,685.00 $59,685.00 

Athens Paper Company Lot Items: 4-6 $71,040.00

The Millcraft Paper 
Company

Lot Items: 7-8 $15,414.25 $15,414.25 

Athens Paper Company Lot Items: 7-8 $19,961.25 

The Millcraft Paper 
Company

Lot Items: 9-10 $8,274.42 $8,274.42 

Athens Paper Company Lot Items: 9-10 $11,277.00
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