FALL 2023

ADOLPO TRI-STATE
ITEM BEN |ELIZABETH| VALLE- |VERONICA GERRY MAXWELL | MICHAEL| ESCRAP BOBBY
NO. |QUAN. ITEM DESCRIPTION WELLS | SCHAFFER| ROMO SILER | CUNNINGHAM | MULLINS | FRENCH | JOHN LEWIS | MONTGOMERY

1 1 12001 Ford 350 Super Duty 505.00]#2;250:00| 985.00 150.00 802.00) 1,765.00 501.00 2,250.00

2 1 Double Stack Oven 450 4:50

3 1 |Steam Kettle : ‘4.50 4.50

4 1 |Warm Holding Cabinet L4150 4,50

5 1 |Warm Holding Cabinet L 50 - 4.50

6 1 Steamer 450 4.50

7 2 |Large Cambro Rolling Food Carts '3.50 3.50
Game Cube Cabinet with Wheels, Dot s

8 1 |Black 15,00 15.00
Vizio Television, Model E260MV :

9 1 |*Located in Game Cube Cabinet 11200
Vizio Television, Model E260MV ST :

10 1 |*Located in Game Cube Cabinet L1000 11.00
Vizio Television, Model E260MV :

11 1 |*Located in Game Cube Cabinet _11:00
Vizio Television, Model E260MV

12 1 |*Located in Game Cube Cabinet 11.00
Wii Console, Black, Model RVL-101 :

13 1 |*Located in Game Cube Cabinet 5.00 1.00 11:00
Wii Console, Black, Model RVL-101 o :

14 1 |*Located in Game Cube Cabinet L11,00 5.00 1.00 11.00
Wit Console, Black, Model RVL-101 :

15 1 |*Located in Game Cube Cabinet 911,00 5.00 1.00 11500
Wii Console, Black, Model RVL-101

16 1 |*Located in Game Cube Cabinet oo 5.00 1.00 11:00

17 1 |Avaya 6211 Phone - Gray NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID

18 10 |Avaya/Lucent 6408D+ Phones Gray | NOBID| NOBID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NOBID | NOBID NO BiD NO BID

19 1 [iPad 4,50 4.50

20 1 iPad L0450 4:50

21 1 |iPad L4550 4.50

22 1 [iPad . 4.50 4.50

23 1 |iPad 4,50 4,50

24 1 |iPad 350 3150

25 1 iPad 15:00] | i 15:00

26 1 iPad 1200 |0 12200

27 1 iPad -11:00 w1100

28 1 |iPad : 11,00] |- 977 211,00

29 1 [|iPad CEET11.00 11:00

30 1 iPad L1100 11.00




31 1 |iPad 11:00 11.00
32 1 |iPad 11.00 11:00
33 1 |iPad 11.00 11:00
34 1 |iPad 2.11 2.11
35 1 |iPad 1211 2.11
36 1 iPad 2,11 2.11
37 1 |iPad 2.11 2.11
38 1 [iPad 2.11 2.11
39 1 |iPad 2.11 211
40 1 jiPad 2.11 2.11
41 1 |iPad 2.11 2,11
42 1 [iPad 211 2.11
43 1 |[iPad 2.11 2,11
44 1 [iPad 2.11 211
45 1 |iPad 2.11 2.11
46 1 |iPad 2.11 2.11
47 1 |iPad 2.11 2.11
48 1 |iPad 2.11 2,11
49 1 iPad 211 2,11
50 1 |iPad 2.11 211
51 1 |iPad 2:11 211
52 1 iPad 2,11 2,11
53 1 [iPad 2.11 211
54 1 |iPad 2.11 2,11
55 1 |iPad 5.00 2.11 5.00
56 1 [iPad 2.11 2.11
57 1 [iPad 5.00 2.11 5.00
58 1 iPad 2.11

59 22 |Lucent 6210 Phones - Gray NOBID | NOBID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID

60 5 Lucent 6210 Phones - White NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

61 1 Lucent Attendant Console Model 302C 17.00 17.00
62 1 Lucent Extension Selector Model 26B | NnoBID | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

63 1 [HP Printer C6490A 17.00 17.00
64 1 |Dell Optiplex 3040 Tower 17.00 17.00
65 1 [Dell Optiplex 3040 Tower 17.00 17.00
66 1 [Dell Latitude 3340 Laptop '17.00 1.25 17.00
67 1 |Dell Optiplex 7010 Tower 17.00 17.00
68 1 _|Dell Latitude 3500 Laptop 17.00 1.25 17.00
69 4 [Dell USB Keyboards NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

70 5 Dell Monitor E170Sc NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

71 4 Dell Monitor E170Sh NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

72 1 Dell Monitor E1709Wf NOBID { NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

73 1  |Dell Monitor E17155c NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

74 1 |Dell Latitude E5430 Laptop 1.00 , 125 1.25]




75

Dell Latitude E5540 Laptop

1 1.00 1.25 1.25
76 1 Dell 08S Tower 1.00 0.10 1.00
77 1 Dell Latitude 2110 Laptop 1.00 0.60 1.00
78 1 Epson LCD Projector H856A 0.50 0.50
79 1 Dell Optiplex 780 Tower 1.00 1.00
80 1 Dell Optiplex 760 Tower 1.00 1.00
81 3 Dell SK-8115 Keyboard NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
82 1 Dell Optiplex 3040 Tower 10.00 10.00
83 1 Dell Optiplex 780 Tower 1.00 1.00
84 2 Dell L100 Keyboard NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
85 1 Dell Latitude D520 Laptop 1.00 1.00
86 1 Dell Optiplex 3040 Tower 10.00 10.00
87 1 Dell Monitor E773c NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
88 1 Dell Latitude 3470 Laptop 1.00 1.50 1.50
89 1 Dell Latitude E5540 Laptop 1.00 2,10 2.10
90 1 Dell Latitude E5540 Laptop 1.00 2.10 2.10
91 1 Dell Latitude E5540 Laptop 1.00 2.10 2.10
92 1 Dell Latitude 3450 Laptop 20.00 1.50 20.00
93 1 Dell Latitude D520 Laptop NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID
94 1 Dell Latitude E5430 Laptop 1.00 2.10 2.10
95 1 Dell Latitude E5540 Laptop 1.00 2.10 2.10
96 1 Dell Latitude E5540 Laptop 1.00 2.10 2.10
97 1 Dell Latitude E5540 Laptop 1.00 2.10 2.10
98 1 Dell Latitude 3450 Laptop 20.00 1.50 20.00
99 1 Dell Latitude E5540 Laptop 1.00 2.10 2.10
100 1 Dell Latitude 3450 Laptop 15.00 1.50 15.00
101 1 Dell Latitude 3340 Laptop '.10.00 1.50 10.00
102 1 Dell Latitude E5540 Laptop 1.00 2.10 2.10
103 1 Dell Latitude E5540 Laptop 1.00 2.10 2.10
104 1 Dell Latitude E5540 Laptop 1.00 2.10 2.10
105 1 Dell Latitude E5540 Laptop 1.00 2.10 2.10
106 1 Dell Latitude E5430 Laptop 1.00 2:10 2.10
107 1 Dell Latitude E5430 Laptop 1.00 2.10 2.10
108 3 Dell KB-212B Keyboard NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
109 8 [Dell E1705b Monitor NOBID | NOBID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID
110 5 Dell E1705¢ Monitor NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
111 1 Dell E177FPc Monitor NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
112 1 Dell E1715Sc Monitor NOBID | NOBID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BiD
113 2 |HP Compag LA1951G Monitor NOBID | NOBID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID
114 2 Dell E2316H Monitor NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
115 2 MNBwCDQ 940BE Monitor NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
116 1 Dell E773c¢ Monitor NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
117 1 |Dell E772p Monitor NOBID | NOBID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID
118 2 |Epson Powerlite 420 Projector NOBID | NOBID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID




119 9 |Epson Powerlite 520 Projector NOBID | NO BID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID
120 3 [SMART U100 Projector . 040 [ 0.40
121 5 |elnstruction Smart Board NOBID | NOBID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID
122 1 SMART Technologies Board M600 NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
123 3 [SMART Technologies Board SB680 NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO-BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
124 1 Epson LCD Projector 2600 NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

__Total of Fall Surplus Sale

.. 2,808.72




