JEFFERSON COUNTY BOARD OF EDUCATION
EQUAL OPPORTUNITY/AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EMPLOYER

BID TABULATION
BID ID: 8276
APPROVAL DATE: September 26, 2023
ITEM(S) QUOTED: DIESEL & GASOLINE
DATE BIDS RECEIVED: September 12, 2023
CONTRACT PERIOD: From October 1, 2023 - December 31, 2023.

QUOTED DISCOUNT TERMS: All vendors quoted net terms.

VENDOR INSTRUCTIONS: No shipments/services are to be made against the contract.
Purchase orders will be issued.

AWARD OF PROPOSAL: Awarded to Key Oil as lowest evaluated bidder for
Part A — Diesel — Fixed Price.
Awarded to James River Solutions as lowest evaluated
bidder for Part C — Gasoline — Fixed Price.



PART A - DIESEL - FIXED PRICE

ITEM 1 -DIESEL FUEL (#2 ULSD DIESEL MUST INCLUDE LUBRICITY AGENT AND OBTAIN A COLD
FILTER PLUGGING POINT OF -30° F WITH 0 - 5% BLEND OF BIODIESEL [B0-5] WHICH MUST BE
BLENDED IN THE TRUCK PRIOR TO DELIVERY): (JCPS NO. 4600020-1715335)

STATE FIRM FIXED ADDER PER
GAL. OVER NEW YORK
MERCANTILE EXCHANGE PRICE
(Including Lubricity Additive,

State Excise Tax, Fees, Delivery

BIDDER and Biodiesel)
Colonial Oil Industries $ +0.4706
Heritage Petroleum LLC +0.2588
James River Solutions +0.2345
Key Oil +0.0567*
Mansfield Oil +0.6101
Petroleum Traders +0.3586
World Fuel +NO BID

PART B - DIESEL - POSTED TRAILER

ITEM 1 -DIESEL FUEL (#2 ULSD DIESEL MUST INCLUDE LUBRICITY AGENT AND OBTAIN A COLD
FILTER PLUGGING POINT OF -30° F WITH 0 - 5% BLEND OF BIODIESEL [B0-5] WHICH MUST BE
BLENDED IN THE TRUCK PRIOR TO DELIVERY): (JCPS NO. 4600020-1715335)

STATE FIRM FIXED ADDER PER GAL.
OVER LOUISVILLE OPIS (OPIS/PAD 2)
CLOSING RACK AVERAGE PRICE
(Including Lubricity Additive,

State Excise Tax, Fees, Delivery

BIDDER and Biodiesel)
Colonial Oil Industries $ +0.5640
Heritage Petroleum LLC +0.2964
James River Solutions +0.2345
Key 0il +0.0567
Mansfield Oil +0.3207
Petroleum Traders +0.3701

World Fuel +0.3247



PART C — GASOLINE — FIXED PRICE

ITEM 1 - GASOLINE, MINIMUM OCTANE 87, GASOLINE MUST INCLUDE RFG 10% ETHANOL.:
(JCPS NO. 4600020-1728875)

STATE FIRM FIXED ADDER PER GAL.
OVER LOUISVILLE OPIS (OPIS/PAD 2)
CLOSING RACK AVERAGE PRICE
(Including State Excise Tax,

BIDDER Fees, Delivery)
Colonial Oil Industries $ +0.6731
Heritage Petroleum LLC +0.3194
James River Solutions +0.2925%*
Key Oil + NO BID
Mansfield Oil +0.4966
Petroleum Traders +NO BID
World Fuel +NO BID

PART D - GASOLINE - POSTED TRAILER

ITEM 1 - GASOLINE, MINIMUM OCTANE 87, GASOLINE MUST INCLUDE RFG 10% ETHANOL.:
(JCPS NO. 4600020-1728875)

STATE FIRM FIXED ADDER PER GAL.
OVER LOUISVILLE OPIS (OPIS/PAD 2)
CLOSING RACK AVERAGE PRICE
(Including State Excise Tax,

BIDDER Fees, Delivery)
Colonial Oil Industries $ +0.4885
Heritage Petroleum LLC +0.3211
James River Solutions +0.2836
Key Oil +0.0634
Mansfield Oil +0.3005
Petroleum Traders +0.3001
World Fuel +0.3491

PART E - SPLIT-DROP FEE FOR DIESEL & GASOLINE

SPLIT-DROP FUEL LOADS TO TWO LOCATIONS:

BIDDER

Colonial Oil Industries $ +50.00
Heritage Petroleum LLC +50.00

James River Solutions +50.00

Key Oil +100.00
Mansfield Oil +50.00 per split
Petroleum Traders +65.00

World Fuel +50.00



SPLIT-DROP FUEL LOADS TO THREE LOCATIONS:

Colonial Oil Industries $ +100.00
Heritage Petroleum LLC +100.00
James River Solutions +100.00
Key Oil +60.00

Mansfield Oil +100.00
Petroleum Traders +130.00
World Fuel +100 .00

All other additional information is included with bid proposals. The proposals are on file in the Purchasing/Bid
Department.



