Jefferson County Public Schools

Bid Tabulation

Event Name: FRESH FRUIT & VEGETABLE PROGRAM & CONDIMENT (PREPACKAGED PRODUCE)

Event ID: JCPS-8253

Approval Date: August 15, 2023

Date Bids Received: July 6, 2023

Contract Period: August 15, 2023 through June 30, 2024

Renewals: No renewal option.

Comments: Award Status indicates an award.

Item Manufacturer / Mfg / Provider  Unit Bid Vendor Response
Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Vendor Name Provider Part Number Price Total Price Supplier Notes Item Notes Award Status Award Notes No Bid
001 Apple, slices, red or green | Fresh, U.S. No. 1 standard, bright in color, crisp | 4445840-2012369 1-Each 315 Sysco Louisville DNO 13002 $31.75 $10,001.25
variety. slices, no core. Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2- Purchase
oz. Approved Product: Peterson Farms
#203102 & #3177967. Please respond to the
following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM
NOTES field: Specify ounces per package and
number of packages per case.
001 Apple, slices, red or green | Fresh, U.S. No. 1 standard, bright in color, crisp | 4445840-2012369 1-Each 315 Creation Gardens Taylor Farms 18132 $36.75 $11,576.25 Additional spec sheet 100/.5 CUP Awarded Awarded as low bidder
variety. slices, no core. Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2- Purchase provided and samples based on $.3675 price per
oz. Approved Product: Peterson Farms to be sent. serving.
#203102 & #3177967. Please respond to the
following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM
NOTES field: Specify ounces per package and
number of packages per case.
002 Beet Sticks. Fresh, Cut. U.S. Approved Product: Creation Gardens #17480. NA 1- Each 255 Sysco Louisville DNO 1054 $26.75 $6,821.25
No. 2 standard. Ready to eat. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR Purchase
Approx. (50) 2-oz. RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces
per package and number of packages per case.
002 Beet Sticks. Fresh, Cut. U.S. Approved Product: Creation Gardens #17480. NA 1-Each 255 Creation Gardens Creation 17480 $32.95 $8,402.25 Can offer KY Grown 80/2 0Z Awarded Awarded as low bidder
No. 2 standard. Ready to eat. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR Purchase Gardens while in season based on $.4118 price per
Approx. (50) 2-oz. RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces serving.
per package and number of packages per case.
003 Blackberries. Fresh, U.S. No.1 Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-0z. SAMPLE NA 1-Each 400 Sysco Louisville DNO 14367 $51.75 $20,700.00 Awarded
standard, dry, clean, plump, | REQUIRED. Please respond to the following in Purchase
bright and well colored. the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:
Specify ounces per package and number of
packages per case.
003 Blackberries. Fresh, U.S. No.1 Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-0z. SAMPLE NA 1-Each 400 Creation Gardens Creation 17108 $98.00 $39,200.00 Samples to be sent 80/2 0Z
standard, dry, clean, plump, | REQUIRED. Please respond to the following in Purchase Gardens
bright and well colored. the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:
Specify ounces per package and number of
packages per case.




Item

Manufacturer / Mfg / Provider

Unit Bid Vendor Response
Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code uomMm Quantity Vendor Name Provider Part Number Price Total Price Supplier Notes Item Notes Award Status Award Notes No Bid
004 Blueberries. Fresh, U.S.No.1 Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. Approved NA 1- Each 315 Sysco Louisville DNO 14386 $56.75 $17,876.25
standard, firm, plump, dry Product: Creation Gardens #17110. Please Purchase
and dark in color. respond to the following in the VENDOR
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces
per package and number of packages per case.
004 Blueberries. Fresh, U.S.No.1 Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. Approved NA 1- Each 315 Creation Gardens Creation 17110 $76.00 $23,940.00 80/2 0z Awarded Awarded as low bidder
standard, firm, plump, dry Product: Creation Gardens #17110. Please Purchase Gardens based on $.9500 price per
and dark in color. respond to the following in the VENDOR serving.
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces
per package and number of packages per case.
005 Broccoli, florets. Fresh, U.S. Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-0z. Approved NA 1-Each 400 Sysco Louisville DNO 13037 $27.75 $11,100.00
No. 1 standard, florets, Products: Creation Gardens #17008 and Taylor Purchase
trimmed, sulfite-free, bright Farms #8449011. Please respond to the
green, crisp, firm. following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM
NOTES field: Specify ounces per package and
number of packages per case.
005 Broccoli, florets. Fresh, U.S. Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. Approved NA 1-Each 400 Creation Gardens Creation 17008 $42.00 $16,800.00 80/2 0z Awarded Awarded as low bidder
No. 1 standard, florets, Products: Creation Gardens #17008 and Taylor Purchase Gardens based on $.5250 price per
trimmed, sulfite-free, bright Farms #8449011. Please respond to the serving.
green, crisp, firm. following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM
NOTES field: Specify ounces per package and
number of packages per case.
006 Cantaloupe, cubes. Fresh,  Approved Products: Creation Gardens #17061 NA 1- Each 215 Sysco Louisville DNO 14286 $28.75 $6,181.25
U.S. No. 1 standard. Ready to and Taylor Farms #59762 Please respond to Purchase
eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM
NOTES field: Specify ounces per package and
number of packages per case.
006 Cantaloupe, cubes. Fresh,  Approved Products: Creation Gardens #17061 NA 1-Each 215 Creation Gardens Creation 17061 $41.50 $8,922.50 Can offer KY Grown 80/2 0Z Awarded Awarded as low bidder
U.S. No. 1 standard. Ready to and Taylor Farms #59762 Please respond to Purchase Gardens while in season based on $.5187 price per
eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM serving.
NOTES field: Specify ounces per package and
number of packages per case.
007 Carrots, baby. Fresh, U.S. No.| Ready to eat. Approx. (200) 1.6-0z. Approved NA 1-Each 100 Sysco Louisville DNO 1660 $22.75 $2,275.00
1 standard, bright in color and|Products: Creation Gardens (Grimway) #GF-BC- Purchase
moist. 135 and Taylor Farms #6919450. Please
respond to the following in the VENDOR
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces
per package and number of packages per case.
007 Carrots, baby. Fresh, U.S. No.| Ready to eat. Approx. (200) 1.6-0z. Approved NA 1-Each 100 Creation Gardens Bolthouse 4104 $36.00 $3,600.00 Additional spec sheet 100/2.6 0z Awarded Awarded as low bidder
1 standard, bright in color and|Products: Creation Gardens (Grimway) #GF-BC- Purchase

moist.

RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces
per package and number of packages per case.

135 and Taylor Farms #6919450. Please
respond to the following in the VENDOR

provided. These are
the same carrots that
schools receive for
regular orders. We can
also offer the same
80/20z carrot coins
that we did last year
for the same price.

based on $.3600 price per
serving.




Item

Manufacturer / Mfg / Provider  Unit Bid Vendor Response
Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Vendor Name Provider Part Number Price Total Price Supplier Notes Item Notes Award Status Award Notes No Bid
008 Cauliflower, florets. Any Clean, firm, compact florets, no browning. NA 1-Each 250 Sysco Louisville DNO 13331 $34.75 $8,687.50
color/variety. Fresh cut. Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. Approved Purchase
Sulfate free, packaged in gas Products: Creation Gardens #17029 and Taylor
permeable package, code  Farms #59769. Please respond to the following
dated. in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:
Specify ounces per package and number of
packages per case.
008 Cauliflower, florets. Any . X NA 1-Each 250 Creation Gardens Creation 17029 $50.00 $12,500.00 80/2 0z Awarded Awarded as low bidder
color/variety. Fresh cut. Clean, firm, compact florets, no browning. Purchase Gardens based on $.6250 price per
Sulfate free, packaged in gas ety i ik 'Approx. () 2oz, Mgzt serving.
Bermeable|packagelicode Products: Creation Gardens #17029 and Taylor
p— Farms #59769. Please respond to the following
in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:
Specify ounces per package and number of
packages per case.
009 Celery, sticks. Fresh, U.S. No leaves or indications of wilting. Ready to NA 1-Each 400 Sysco Louisville DNO 13199 $29.75 $11,900.00 Awarded
No.1 standard, clean, crisp eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. Approved Products: Purchase
stalks. Creation Gardens #17037 and Taylor Farms
#59773. Please respond to the following in the
VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify
ounces per package and number of packages
per case.
009 Celery, sticks. Fresh, U.S. No leaves or indications of wilting. Ready to NA 1-Each 400 Creation Gardens Taylor Farms 24884 $37.50 $15,000.00 50/.5 cup
No.1 standard, clean, crisp eat. Approx. (50) 2-0z. Approved Products: Purchase
stalks. Creation Gardens #17037 and Taylor Farms
#59773. Please respond to the following in the
VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify
ounces per package and number of packages
per case.
010 Cherries, red. Fresh, U.S. No. Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. Approved NA 1-Each 400 Sysco Louisville DNO New Product $40.75 $16,300.00 Awarded
1 standard, plump smooth Product: Creation Gardens #17063. Please Purchase
skin and bright red color. respond to the following in the VENDOR
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces
per package and number of packages per case.
010 Cherries, red. Fresh, U.S. No. NA 1- Each 400 Creation Gardens Creation 17063 $74.00 $29,600.00 80/2 0z
Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. Approved
1 standard, plump smooth A Purchase Gardens
skin and bright red color. Product: Creation Garc{en§#17063. Please
respond to the following in the VENDOR
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces
per package and number of packages per case.
011 Cucumber, slices. Fresh, U.S.| Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. Approved NA 1-Each 315 Sysco Louisville DNO 13512 $22.25 $7,008.75
fancy standard, medium size Product: Creation Gardens #17049. Please Purchase
slices, good shape shiny or respond to the following in the VENDOR
waxy surface. RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces
per package and number of packages per case.
011 Cucumber, slices. Fresh, U.S.| Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-0z. Approved NA 1-Each 315 Creation Gardens Creation 17049 $32.25 $10,158.75 Can offer KY Grown 80/2 0z Awarded Awarded as low bidder
fancy standard, medium size | Product: Creation Gardens #17049. Please Purchase Gardens while in season

slices, good shape shiny or
waxy surface.

respond to the following in the VENDOR
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces
per package and number of packages per case.

based on $.4031 price per
serving.




Item Manufacturer / Mfg / Provider  Unit Bid Vendor Response
Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code uomMm Quantity Vendor Name Provider Part Number Price Total Price Supplier Notes Item Notes Award Status Award Notes No Bid
012 Grapefruit, wedges. Fresh, Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. Approved NA 1-Each 275 Sysco Louisville DNO 12713 $26.75 $7,356.25 Awarded
U.S. No. 1 standard, rind to be  Product: Creation Gardens #17075. Please Purchase
intact, bright in color. respond to the following in the VENDOR
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces
per package and number of packages per case.
012 Grapefruit, wedges. Fresh, Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. Approved NA 1- Each 275 Creation Gardens Creation 17075 $53.75 $14,781.25 80/wedge; each
U.S. No. 1 standard, rind to be ~ Product: Creation Gardens #17075. Please Purchase Gardens serving is approx.
intact, bright in color. respond to the following in the VENDOR 3.4 0z.
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces
per package and number of packages per case.
013 Grapes, any variety. Fresh, | Approved Products: Creation Gardens #17131 NA 1-Each 400 Sysco Louisville DNO 12616 $22.75 $9,100.00 Awarded
U.S. No. 1 standard. Ready to| and Taylor Farms #60393. Please respond to Purchase
eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM
NOTES field: Specify ounces per package and
number of packages per case.
013 Grapes, any variety. Fresh, | Approved Products: Creation Gardens #17131 NA 1-Each 400 Creation Gardens Creation 17125, 17127, $42.00 $16,800.00 80/2 0z
U.S. No. 1 standard. Ready to| and Taylor Farms #60393. Please respond to Purchase Gardens 17131
eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM
NOTES field: Specify ounces per package and
number of packages per case.
014 Honeydew, cubes. Fresh, U.S. Approved Product: Creation Gardens #17069. NA 1-Each 250 Sysco Louisville DNO 13346 $29.75 $7,437.50
No. 1 standard. Ready to eat. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR Purchase
Approx. (50) 2-oz. RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces
per package and number of packages per case.
014 Honeydew, cubes. Fresh, U.S. Approved Product: Creation Gardens #17069. NA 1-Each 250 Creation Gardens Creation 17069 $44.25 $11,062.50 Can offer KY Grown 80/2 02 Awarded Awarded as low bidder
No. 1 standard. Ready to eat. Please respond to the following in the VENDOR Purchase Gardens while in season based on $.5531 price per
Approx. (50) 2-oz. RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces serving.
per package and number of packages per case.
015 Jicama Sticks. Fresh, Cut. Approved Product: Creation Gardens #17134. NA 1-Each 175 Sysco Louisville DNO 14423 $36.75 $6,431.25
Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2- | Please respond to the following in the VENDOR Purchase
oz. RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces
per package and number of packages per case.
015 Jicama Sticks. Fresh, Cut. Approved Product: Creation Gardens #17134. NA 1-Each 175 Creation Gardens Creation 17134 $47.20 $8,260.00 80/2 0z Awarded Awarded as low bidder
Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2- | Please respond to the following in the VENDOR Purchase Gardens based on $.5900 price per
oz. RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces serving.
per package and number of packages per case.
016 Kiwi, halves or slices. Fresh, Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. Approved NA 1-Each 315 Sysco Louisville DNO 13444 $28.75 $9,056.25 Awarded
U.S. No. 1 standard, no Product: Creation Gardens #03835. Please Purchase

wrinkles or signs of
bruising/damage.

respond to the following in the VENDOR
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces
per package and number of packages per case.




Item Manufacturer / Mfg / Provider  Unit Bid Vendor Response
Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code uom Quantity Vendor Name Provider Part Number Price Total Price Supplier Notes Item Notes Award Status Award Notes No Bid
016 Kiwi, halves or slices. Fresh, Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. Approved NA 1-Each 315 Creation Gardens Creation 3835 $50.00 $15,750.00 80/1 half; each
U.S. No. 1 standard, no Product: Creation Gardens #03835. Please Purchase Gardens serving is approx.
wrinkles or signs of respond to the following in the VENDOR 290z
bruising/damage. RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces
per package and number of packages per case.
017 Lemon, wedges. Fresh U.S. Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. Approved NA 1-Each 315 Sysco Louisville DNO 4220 $26.75 $8,426.25
No. 1 standard, rinds to be Product: Creation Gardens #17137. Please Purchase
removed, flesh only. respond to the following in the VENDOR
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces
per package and number of packages per case.
017 Lemon, wedges. Fresh U.S. Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. Approved NA 1-Each 315 Creation Gardens Creation 17137 $33.50 $10,552.50 80/wedge; each Awarded Awarded as low bidder
No. 1 standard, rinds to be Product: Creation Gardens #17137. Please Purchase Gardens serving is approx. based on $.4187 price per
removed, flesh only. respond to the following in the VENDOR 20z serving.
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces
per package and number of packages per case.
018 Lime, wedges. Fresh U.S. No. Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-0z. Approved NA 1- Each 315 Sysco Louisville DNO 1014 $27.25 $8,583.75
1 standard, rinds to be Product: Creation Gardens #17142. Please Purchase
removed, flesh only. respond to the following in the VENDOR
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces
per package and number of packages per case.
018 Lime, wedges. Fresh U.S. No. NA 1-Each 315 Creation Gardens Creation 17142 $29.00 $9,135.00 80/wedge; each Awarded Awarded as low bidder
1 standard, rinds to be Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-0z. Approved Purchase Gardens serving is approx. based on $.3625 price per
removed, flesh only. Product: Creation Gardens #17142. Please 20z serving.
respond to the following in the VENDOR
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces
per package and number of packages per case.
019 Mango, chunks. Fresh, Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. Approved NA 1-Each 400 Sysco Louisville DNO 14354 $46.75 $18,700.00 Awarded
slightly soft, yellow tinge, no | Products: Creation Gardens #17120 and Taylor Purchase
fibrous pieces of pit. Farms #59761. Please respond to the following
in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:
Specify ounces per package and number of
packages per case.
019 Mango, chunks. Fresh, Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. Approved NA 1-Each 400 Creation Gardens Creation 17120 $90.00 $36,000.00 80/2 0z
slightly soft, yellow tinge, no | Products: Creation Gardens #17120 and Taylor Purchase Gardens
fibrous pieces of pit. Farms #59761. Please respond to the following
in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field:
Specify ounces per package and number of
packages per case.
020 Orange, wedges. Any variety. Approved Products: Creation Gardens #22976 NA 1-Each 315 Sysco Louisville DNO 12735 $26.75 $8,426.25
Navel or Valencia. Fresh, U.S. and Taylor Farms #60394. Please respond to Purchase
No. 1 standard. Ready to eat. the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM
Approx. (50) 2-0z. NOTES field: Specify ounces per package and
number of packages per case.
020 Orange, wedges. Any variety. NA 1-Each 315 Creation Gardens Creation 22976 $35.50 $11,182.50 80/1/4 cut; 88 size  Awarded Awarded as low bidder
Navel or Valencia. Fresh, U.S. Approved Products: Creation Gardens #22976 Purchase Gardens orange used, 1/4 based on $.4437 price per

No. 1 standard. Ready to eat.

Approx. (50) 2-oz.

and Taylor Farms #60394. Please respond to

the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM

NOTES field: Specify ounces per package and
number of packages per case.

orange per
serving, approx.
2.60Z

serving.




Item Manufacturer / Mfg / Provider  Unit Bid Vendor Response
Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code uomMm Quantity Vendor Name Provider Part Number Price Total Price Supplier Notes Item Notes Award Status Award Notes No Bid
021 Peas, sugar snap or snow. Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. Approved NA 1-Each 175 Sysco Louisville DNO 10122 or $39.75 $6,956.25
Fresh, U.S. No. 1 standard, | Products: Creation Gardens #17167 and Taylor Purchase 10123
bright green with well-filled Farms #2395749. Please respond to the
pods with large round peas following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM
inside. NOTES field: Specify ounces per package and
number of packages per case.
021 Peas, sugar snap or snow. Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. Approved NA 1-Each 175 Creation Gardens Creation 17167 $44.00 $7,700.00 80/2 0Z Awarded Awarded as low bidder
Fresh, U.S. No. 1 standard, | Products: Creation Gardens #17167 and Taylor Purchase Gardens based on $.5500 price per
bright green with well-filled Farms #2395749. Please respond to the serving.
pods with large round peas following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM
inside. NOTES field: Specify ounces per package and
number of packages per case.
022 Pineapple, cubes. Any Approved Products: Creation Gardens #17091 NA 1- Each 315 Sysco Louisville DNO 16107 $31.75 $10,001.25
variety. Fresh, U.S. No. 1 and Taylor Farms #59764. Please respond to Purchase
standard. Ready to eat. the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM
Approx. (50) 2-oz. NOTES field: Specify ounces per package and
number of packages per case.
022 Pineapple, cubes. Any NA 1- Each 315 Creation Gardens Creation 17091 $42.25 $13,308.75 80/2 0z Awarded Awarded as low bidder
variety. Fresh, U.S. No. 1 Approved Products: Creation Gardens #17091 Purchase Gardens based on $.5281 price per
standard. Ready to eat. and Taylor Farms #59764. Please respond to serving.
Approx. (50) 2-oz. the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM
NOTES field: Specify ounces per package and
number of packages per case.
023 Tomato, grape. Fresh U.S. | Approved Product: Creation Gardens #17482. NA 1-Each 315 Sysco Louisville DNO 11086 $22.75 $7,166.25 Awarded Awarded as low bidder
No. 1 standard, ripeness | Please respond to the following in the VENDOR Purchase based on $.4550 price per
stage 4 or 5. Ready to eat. RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces serving.
Approx. (50) 2-0z. per package and number of packages per case.
023 Tomato, grape. Fresh U.S. | Approved Product: Creation Gardens #17482. NA 1-Each 315 Creation Gardens Creation 17482 $41.50 $13,072.50 Can offer KY Grown 80/2 0z
No. 1 standard, ripeness | Please respond to the following in the VENDOR Purchase Gardens while in season
stage 4 or 5. Ready to eat. RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces
Approx. (50) 2-0z. per package and number of packages per case.
024 Turnip Sticks. Fresh, Cut. Approved Product: Creation Gardens #17349. NA 1-Each 250 Sysco Louisville DNO 14244 $24.75 $6,187.50
Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2- Please respond to the following in the VENDOR Purchase
oz. RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces
per package and number of packages per case.
024 Turnip Sticks. Fresh, Cut. X NA 1- Each 250 Creation Gardens Creation 17349 $38.50 $9,625.00 Can offer KY Grown 80/2 0z Awarded Awarded as low bidder
Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2- Approved Product: Creation Gardens #17349, Purchase Gardens while in season based on $.4812 price per
- Please respond to the following in the VENDOR serving.
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces
per package and number of packages per case.
025 Watermelon, chunks. Any Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-0z. Approved NA 1-Each 275 Sysco Louisville DNO 14432 $28.75 $7,906.25
red or yellow variety. Fresh, Product: Creation Gardens #17116. Please Purchase

U.S. No. 1 standard.

respond to the following in the VENDOR
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces
per package and number of packages per case.




Item

Manufacturer / Mfg / Provider  Unit Bid Vendor Response
Number Item/Service Description Commodity Code uomMm Quantity Vendor Name Provider Part Number Price Total Price Supplier Notes Item Notes Award Status Award Notes No Bid
025 Watermelon, chunks. Any Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2-oz. Approved NA 1-Each 275 Creation Gardens Creation 17116 $41.75 $11,481.25 Can offer KY Grown 80/2 0z Awarded Awarded as low bidder
red or yellow variety. Fresh, | Product: Creation Gardens #17116. Please Purchase Gardens while in season based on $.5218 price per
U.S. No. 1 standard. respond to the following in the VENDOR serving.
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify ounces
per package and number of packages per case.
026 Yellow Squash Coins or slices. Approved Products: Creation Gardens #17232 NA 1-Each 100 Sysco Louisville DNO 14177 $24.75 $2,475.00
Fresh, U.S. No. 1 standard. and Taylor Farms #3326465. Please respond to Purchase
Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2- the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM
oz. NOTES field: Specify ounces per package and
number of packages per case.
026 Yellow Squash Coins or slices. Approved Products: Creation Gardens #17232 NA 1- Each 100 Creation Gardens Creation 17232 $35.75 $3,575.00 Can offer KY Grown 80/2 0Z Awarded Awarded as low bidder
Fresh, U.S. No. 1 standard. and Taylor Farms #3326465. Please respond to Purchase Gardens while in season based on $.4468 price per
Ready to eat. Approx. (50) 2- the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM serving.
oz. NOTES field: Specify ounces per package and
number of packages per case.
027 Zucchini, slices. Fresh, U.S. | Approved Products: Creation Gardens #17230 NA 1-Each 315 Sysco Louisville DNO 14171 $23.75 $7,481.25
No. 1 standard. Ready to eat.| and Taylor Farms #59844. Please respond to Purchase
Approx. (50) 2-0z. the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM
NOTES field: Specify ounces per package and
number of packages per case.
027 Zucchini, slices. Fresh, U.S. | Approved Products: Creation Gardens #17230 NA 1-Each 315 Creation Gardens Creation 17230 $32.50 $10,237.50 Can offer KY Grown 80/2 0z Awarded Awarded as low bidder
No. 1 standard. Ready to eat.| and Taylor Farms #59844. Please respond to Purchase Gardens while in season based on $.4062 price per
Approx. (50) 2-0z. the following in the VENDOR RESPONSE ITEM serving.
NOTES field: Specify ounces per package and
number of packages per case.
028 Condiment, Individual Packed approx. (100) 0.75-0z. cups per case. ~ 4445250-2013777 1-100 9000 Churchfield Trading CF SAUER 6504 $20.99 $188,910.00 COLUMN K IS LOCKED ~MIN ORDER 504 Reject - does not deliver
serving. Dressing, Ranch, Approved Product: Heinz #10013000357156. Count Case Company

Light.

Please respond to the following in the VENDOR
RESPONSE ITEM NOTES field: Specify size of
cup and no. of cups per case.

cs

to all sites per bid
specifications. There

were no other bids
received for this item.
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