AWARD OF BIDS/PROPOSALS

The following is a summary of bids/proposals submitted from the Purchasing Department for approval.

BIDS/PROPOSALS

BID	MAILING ROSTER	DEPARTMENT	RESPONSE - NUMBER RECEIVED
Bid 43-14 Music Instruments and Supplies Catalog	Commerce Lexington TSMSDC Economic Engine	Purchasing	10
2. Bid 45-14 Student Pictures	Commerce Lexington TSMSDC Economic Engine	Purchasing	3

1. Bid 43-14 Music Instruments and Supplies Catalog

BACKGROUND AND RATIONALE:

This bid provides a multiple award catalog contract used to purchase music instruments and supplies for FCPS. Approval of the contracts will permit FCPS to continue to operate without disruption to the services required to support the educational process.

Vendor: The following bidders received specifications and have bid on the indicated contract:

Key to Markings ### Recommended Bid Award

	Percentage Discount from public pricing			ublic pricing
Company	Music	Sheet	Other	Instrument
	<u>Instrumer</u>	<u>nts</u> <u>Music</u>	<u>Supplies</u>	<u>Repair</u>
### Doo Wop Shop	10-40	20	20	10
### Shar Products	10	20	10	NB
### Washington Music Center	0-60	0-20	0-60	NB
### Hurst Music (WBE)	35-50	10	30-40	0
### Sam Ash Music	20-65	20-65	20-65	NB
### Music in Motion	0	0	0	NB
### Gist Piano Center	10-30	30	20	30
### Don Wilson Music (WBE)	40	10	40	5
Lakeshore Learning Materials	5	NB	5	NB
### Peripole Inc	5	NB	5	NB

Contract Period: Beginning January 1, 2015 and ending December 31, 2015

PROPOSAL:

Item	Amount	Funding Source	Recurring/ Nonrecurring	Measurable Expected Impact and Timeline
Music Instruments/ Supplies	Last year's expenditure was over \$20,000.00	Schools and departments	Recurring	Immediate contract to provide Music Equipment /supplies for all schools K-12 for 2013-2014 as well as fiscal compliance with bid laws.

Funding key: Schools and Departments

STAFF CONTACT: Grady Ford, Purchasing

POLICY REFERENCE: KRS 45A.365

RECOMMENDATION: A motion is in order to:

"accept bids from Doo Wop Shop, Shar Products, Washington Music

Center, Hurst Music, Sam Ash Music, Music in Motion, Don Wilson Music, Gist Piano Center, and Peripole Inc.."

2. Bid 45-14 - Student Pictures

BACKGROUND AND RATIONALE:

This is a school picture bid that affords annual quality photos for students and parents to purchase and serves as a fundraising project for individual schools. The established contracts provide for furnishing individual pictures at the most favorable prices and terms possible with schools receiving the "school markup".

<u>Vendor</u>: The following bidders received specifications and have bid on the indicated contract:

	Key to Markings
### -	Recommended Bid Award
	Daalaaaa

-				
<u>Company</u>	<u>Package</u>	<u>Bid Pric</u>	Bid Price	
Holifield Photography				
Grades PreK - 11	A (290 sq. in.) (1 pose)	\$11.50	###	
	B (175 sq. in.) (1 pose)	\$8.00	###	
	C (105 sq. in.) (1 pose)	\$3.25	###	
Grade 12	290 sq. in. with 3"x5"	\$34.00	###	
Glade 12	glossies/photographs	ψ54.00	$\pi\pi\pi$	
Crade 12 Alternate		24.00	###	
Grade 12 - Alternate	290 sq. in. with 2"x3"	34.00	###	
·	glossies/photographs			
Lifetouch National School Stud	<u>lios</u>			
Grades PreK - 11	A (290 sq. in.) (1 pose)	\$12.50	###	
	B (175 sq. in.) (1 pose)	\$10.50	###	
	C (105 sq. in.) (1 pose)	\$ 7.50	###	
Grade 12	290 sq. in. with 3"x5"	NO BID		
3.3.33 . -	glossies/photographs			
Grade 12 - Alternate	290 sq. in. with 2"x3"	NO BID		
Grade 12 / Merriale	glossies/photographs	INO DID		
Otronoloridos Otrodio	glossies/priolographs			
Strawbridge Studio	1 (000	0.40 50		
Grades PreK - 11	A (290 sq. in.) (1 pose)	\$10.50	###	
	B (175 sq. in.) (1 pose)	8.00	###	
	C (105 sq. in.) (1 pose)	4.25	###	
Grade 12	290 sq. in. with 3"x5"	NO BID		
	glossies/photographs			
Grade 12 - Alternate	290 sq. in. with 2"x3"	NO BID		
	glossies/photographs			

Contract Period: January 1, 2015 and ending December 31, 2015

PROPOSAL:

Item	Amount	Funding Source	Recurring/ Nonrecurring	Measurable Expected Impact and Timeline
Student Pictures	Not Applicable	Not Applicable	Recurring	Will allow students and parents to receive quality photography services annually and provide a fundraiser project for schools

STAFF CONTACT: Grady Ford, Purchasing

POLICY REFERENCE: KRS 45A.365

RECOMMENDATION: A motion is in order to:

"accept bids from Holifield Photography, Lifetouch National School Studios and Strawbridge Studios."