Invoice No. 4741

P.O. Box 200304
Austin, TX 78720-0504
512/259-5858

FAX $512/259-5850
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1 Your PO No.: 1311234
Our Order No ) 12-091
Slnp Date

www.acousticalresources.com |
F.0.B.:

I Invoice Date: 121722012
_l_Due Date: 1172013

] Ship Via: ODFL / 15001678315
J Freight Tenns. Full Frelght Allowed

12/1 7/20 1 2
Leander, TX

Project: Spencer County High School: Taylorsville, KY

J Quote No.: KY0803 12-5Q38

Sold To:

Spencer County Board of Education
207 W. Main Street

Taylorsville, KY 40071

Product: Description:

Ship To:
Spencer County Board of Education
Spencer County High School
520 Taylorsville Rd.
Taylorsville, KY 40071
_Attn: Barry Clements Cell 502-827-8644 o
Page 1 of 1

- 200B

Panel. Qty:
11
2
9
WDF44

Panel, Qty:
12

Remit To:

Acoustical Resources, Inc.
P.O. Box 200504

Austin, TX 78720-0504

200B: 'Basic' Series Acoustical Panel: 2” Thick, 7 PCF Glass Fiberboard / Square, Chemically
Hardened Edges and Square Corners / Impaling Clips & Adhesive. (Adhesive By Others)

Finish: Guilford Color: To Be Selected

47" x 71" x 2"
48" x 72" x
72" x 48" x 2"

WDF44: Wall Mounted, Fabric-Wrapped Barrel Diffuser: 47" x 47" x 7" /
Finish: Guilford Color: To Be Selected

47" x 47" x 7"

Sizes: Sq.Ft. Ordere SqFt. Shipped:
255 255
48 48

216 216

2“

Qty Ordered Qty. Shipped
12 12

Sizes:

$8,590.00
EXEMPT
$0.00
§0.00
$8,590.00

SubTotal:
Sales Tax:
Freight:
Credits:
Total:

Terms: 1/10, Net 30

For Credit Approved Customers Only
A 1 1/2% Canying Charge shall acarue and be
added 1o any unpaid, overdue balance per month.

RECEWED
DEC 2 1 2012

Note: Reference Installation Instructions.
Thank-you for this order. Please do not hesitate to contact us should you have any questions, concerns or we can be of further

assistance.



Goodlett, Vicki

From: Justin McElfresh <jmcelfresh@scbarchitects.com>

Sent: Wednesday, December 26, 2012 6:56 PM

To: Goodlett, Vicki

Cc: Beaverson, Brett N. - SCPS Director of Operations; dguess@scbarchitects.com
Subject: Re: Acoustical Resources invoice

Vicki,

I have reviewed the invoice and it is acceptable for payment as the amount corresponds to the DPO and the material is

on site and provided as specified.

Merry Christmas!l!

Sincerely,

Justin

Sent from my iPhone

On Dec 26, 2012, at 9:34 AM, "Goodlett, Vicki" <vicki.goodlett@spencer.kyschools.us> wrote:

Good Morning Justin,

Hope your Christmas was merry and bright! I’'m forwarding the Acoustical Resources invoice | received
in the mail. Please let me know when this has your approval for payment.

Thanks!

Vieki Gooddett, CSFM

Finance Officer
Spencer County Public Schools
502-477-3250 x 2128

From: SCBOE scanner@spencer.kyschools.us [mailto:SCBOE scanner@spencer.kyschools.us]

Sent: Wednesday, December 26, 2012 9:33 AM
To: Goodlett, Vicki
Subject: Attached Image

<3576_001.pdf>



